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» FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Page 1 102
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapore 417883
Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No : 20-0006262-1D
Estimate : 21525
Pate - 22.11.20M9
Vehicle Num : GBB 6880C
TP s s Make/Model | MIT CANTER
Chumssis’Engine ni
“v1.e Lo Accident Drate © 2001 1.20109
- Clum No : 1119-21525
Reference ;
Policy No
Oty Particular Amount S$
List Item :
1 pc Front windscreen midg  ~q o~ 5 352.50*
I pe Front panel A e~ $ 915.80 +
I pe Front comer panel (RH) Deabe A £ 235.60 —
| pc Front head lamp (RH) $ 659,20~
I pc Front side lamp (RH)y | gecl £ 221.20+~~
I pc Front signal lamp (RH) s 235.10
| pe Front bumper e, $ 998,50~
2 pe Front bumper bracket @ 253.20 Ay e~ $ 506.40 +
| pc From grille % . $ 456.20 *
| pe Front grille emblem $ 195.20 +
| pe Front side mirror stay bar (RH) _},,5,. Best $ 235.50 *
2 pe Front side mirror @ 13920 N P $ 3840 T .
2 pe Front side mirror cover @ 16530 2eAd $ 330,60 &
I pc Front door (RH) e $ 1,652.20
I pc Front door lock (RH) y B $ 525.304%
2 pe Front door hinge @ 101.20 (RH) 254570 8 202.40 4
1 pe Fromt door rubber (RH) LY $ 351.204
, - 18677)
| pe Front door inner board (RH) Pt $ 985.20+
I pe Front door inner pillar (RH) $ 851.604
| pc Front door step plate (RH) - $ 199.50F
List Item Total : $ 10,427.60
Discount 25 % : $ 2.606.90
$ 7.820.70
Special Nett ltem
I pc Front number plate N i $ 45.00
I pe Front windscreen glass sealamt  ple o L0 $ 100.00°T
1 pe Front door company name sticker  ale S 45.08- =0
Special Nett Total : $ 190.00




« FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD Page 2 to 2
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay
Singapbre 417883
Tel Mo: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No : 20-0006262-1>
Estimate : 21525

Date : 22.11.2019
Vehicle Num @ GHB 6RB0C
MakeModel © MIT CANTER
ChissisEngine no
Accident Date - 20.11.2019
Claim Mo 111921525

Reference
Policy No
Oty Particular Amount 55
. Labour Charge :
To check wiring $ 80607 50
Remove and refix front windscreen glass 7 oy - £ 180.00 4~
Remove and refix meter , dashboard and wire >y $ 450.00 X
Remove and refix cushion seat and carpet $ 150.00 -1
Knock dent on demage portion, cut welding and renew parts $ L3be-t0" o0
Respray painding S 1.20060" SUQ
Labour Charge Total : $ 3.560.00
Singdollars :Seventy Four Thousand Six Hundred Fourty Three And Cents Ninety Five Only .
E &O.E Total Amount : $ 11,570.70
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

e ———

From: Chong Boon Sen <boonsenchong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 11:14 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAUtO)

Ce Admin A: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205640/GBJ40428/CBS & YOUR REF: (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTII9020702/Ada3 -Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ4042B AND
GBBABBOC ) on 20/11/2019

Attachments: insured repart.POF

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan,
Pls find Insured report.

Chong Boon Sen
Claims Executive
Departmeant

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079309
DID: (B5) 63886171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sq.cniaiping.com | FB: www.lacebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: 4 $jiii Taiping SG 3 Anson
Aoad #16-00 Springleal Tower Singapore 079309
DID: (65) 63896171 | M: (B5) XXXX XXXX | F:(65)6222 1033

From: Me| Kwan (LKKAuto] [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]|

Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 10:22 AM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JlaLe@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205640/GBJ40428/CBS & YOUR REF: (TP : LKK REF - CCB/CTI19020702/Ada3 -Direct
Settlement - Accident Involving GBJ40428 AND GBB688OC ) on 20/11/2019

Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our
necessary action,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 ooss | email: MeiEwan@kkauto.com | fox: 67414108
Hlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-35 | ${408633)




Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Jia Le and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 5792.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank ymu

Bist Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwang lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Bik 51, Payn Ubd Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.

For more information please visit hup//www symanteccloud.com




7L LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
- 51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408233
- TEL G256 35681 FAX: 62568 4315

Reg No: 169607168R GST Reg Mo, 19-8807188-R

fillated to Federation Internationale |

CHINA TAIPIHG INSURANCE (S) PTELTD Ref : CCB/CTI19020702Adalq2

Lesvafe T 1111
SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Dele :
Code:. CTI
Insured Veh.  GBJ 4042B Veh. Inspected GBB 6880C
Policy No. DMCVSN1935821900 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D205640 Excess () 0.00

Assign From Assign Date 21112018

Make & Model MITSUBIBHI CnNTER c.c 2677
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. FB70BBA20103 Colour WHITE
Odometer 119015 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification MIL
General GOOD

R/H Front Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm

L/H Front Tyre |185R15C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm

R/H Rear Tyre |195R15C BRIDGESTONE 6 mm

UH Rear Tyre |195R15C BRI:IGEST{JNE & mm

- a.-..- e ATIRAEE
B ¥
T PR {wf L.-Er" A ." rl.—f ] _._".-.L___

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DﬁMAGES AT THE FRONT O/S PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

Accident Date 20/1172018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SING&PORE 417883

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B]IN ACGOHMNGE TO YOUR iNSTRUETIGNS WE HA\I"E NGT AUTHI:)RIS’ED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REFAIR.




1 Vd 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No 189607198R GST Reg No. 19-8607188-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBB 6880C

S e e e

- B O = ik b B =l =k ok omk owmk ml =

FRONT WINDSCREEN MLDG

FRONT PANEL

FRONT CORNER PANEL (RH)

FRONT HEAD LAMP (RH)

FRONT SIDE LAMP (RH)

FRONT SIGNAL LAMP (RH)

FRONT BUMPER

FRONT BUMPER BRACKET @$253.20
FRONT GRILLE

FRONT GRILLE EMBLEM

FRONT SIDE MIRROR STAY BAR (RH)
FRONT SIDE MIRROR @$156.20
FRONT SIDE MIRROR COVER @$165.30
FRONT DOOR (RH)

FRONT DOOR LOCK (RH)
FRONT DOOR HINGE (RH) @$101.20
FRONT DOOR RUBBER (RH)

FRONT DOOR INNER BOARD (RH)
FRONT DOOR INNER PILLAR (RH)
FRONT DOOR STEP PLATE (RH)
LESS 25% DISCOUNT

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN)

FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS SEALANT (SN)
FRONT DOOR COMPANY NAME STICKER (SN)

LABOUR

TO CHECK WIRING

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
DENTED
CRACKED
CRACKED
CRACKED

BENT

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
BENT

NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CC6/CTI19020702/Ada3q2

221.20
235.10
868.50
506.40
456.20

235.50
318.40
330.60
1,652 20

525.30
202 40
351.20
885.20
B51.60
1646.50
-2,606.80

22120
23510
968.50

235.50

330.60

-728.93

7.820.70

2,186.77

45.00

100.00
45.00

30.00

180.00

30.00

80.00|

30.00




_’ L7L” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

B i Ba & 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
TEL: €256 3561 FAX' 6256 4315

Reg No 199607198R GST Reg No 19-8607188-R Page No.2 of 2

T ey
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NDT NEGESEAR‘I’

REMOVE AND REFIX FRONT WINDSCREEN GLASS.

REMOVE AND REFIX METER ,DASHBOARD AND WIRE. |NOT NECESSARY 450.00 -
REMOVE AND REFIX CUSHION SEAT AND CARPET. NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
KNOCK DENT ON DAMAGE PORTION ,CUT WELDING 1,500.00 400.00

AND REEW PARTS.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF
FRONT DOOR (RH)

RESPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 500.00
3,560.00 S30.00
GRAND TOTAL 11,570.70 3,148.77

Report Ref Hu CCB/CTI19020702/Ada3q2

L

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATA|
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - Thin Report is made sabaly for the cee and tenefit of the Clhewt named an 1he Tront page of his Report,




