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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF) <Hafizul_Farhan_RAHMAT@spf.gov.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 10:28 AM

To: assignments; SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Frankie THAY (SPF); Cui Fen ENG (SPF)

Subject: Post survey of SLH3531E (vs QX1024Y DOA: 19/6/2019)
Attachments: Annex B (LOD) 2019-074.pdf

Our ref: AEMD/105/009/2019/074
Hi,
Refer to attached, kindly conduct post survey of SLH3531E.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hafizul Farhan Bin Rahmat

Assistant Logistics Support Officer

Logistics Support and Services Division

Police Logistics Department [ Singapore Police Force
DID: (65) 6478 4840 | FAX: (65) 6478 4848

HOME TEAM _#

. * TRANSFORMATION 2025 #*
One Home, One Team
Bullding Our Futwre Together

WARNING 'Ervieged!Cantigential information may be tained in trus message It you arg not the intended addressee, you must not copy, distribute or take any
action i rellance therson Lom weation of any infarmation in this email 10 any unaulnonzes Derson 15 . offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213) Piease

atity the sender immediately if you receive nis in €

From: Hafizul Farhan RAHMAT (SPF)

Sent: Monday, 8 July 2019 4:05 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Frankie THAY (SPF) <Frankie_THAY@spf.gov.sg>

Subject: Pre-Repair survey of SLH3531E (vs QX1024Y DOA: 19/6/2019)

Hi,
Kindly conduct pre-repair survey of SLH3531E at:
Lion City Rentals
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-01 Carros Center
Singapore 737869

Mr Sim Siak Tong



CONTACT NO: 9742 2188

-

Best Regards,

Hafizul Farhan Bin Rahmat
AEMD / PLD
0 )it
DID: (65) 6478 4840 | FAX: (65) 6478 4850

HOME TEAM &

. * TRANSFORMATION 2025 »*
. One Home, One Team
. Bullding Our Future Together

WARNING "Prvileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message If you are not the intended addressea. you must nol copy distribute or fake any
action in rellance theraon Communication of any information in this email 1o any inauthorized persen s an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please

notify the sendar immediately i you raceiva this in ermor




LCR

LION CITY RENTALS

Your Reference QX1024Y
Our Reference SLH3531E
Contact person g.akmng@honcltylentals.i.nm_sg

Date: 13/11/2015%

SPF Accident Claims Section

Automotive Engineering & Management Division
Police Logistic Dept

1 Mount Pleasant Road

BLK 8 Old Police Academy

Singapore 298333

Dear sirs
Accident involving SLH3531E/QX1024Y dated on 19/06/2019
Your insured driving vehicle no: QX1024Y had negligently collided into our said vehicle

As a result of the said collision, our car has suffered loss and damage as follows:

Cost of repairs S 4,387.00 (Inclusive GST)
Survey Fee E 355.00
| Loss of use $80 x 4 days s 320.00
Pre-Repair Inspection $80x 14 days | $ 1,120.00
Grand Total S 6,182.00

We enclosed herewith a copy of LTA search fee, GIA report and invoices of our said vehicle for
your reference and further actions.

Yours Faithfully
S.T.Sim
Manager

Accident Reporting Centre

1090 Lower Delta Road
#05-12 Singapore 169201

LCR Hotline : 3138 1884
www_lioncityrentals.com.sg
rentals(@lioncityrentals.com.sg



Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd
l-'“=_;|’.l Lower ?'c.--lta Road

LION CITY RENTALS :

#0513

Singapore 169201

Tax Invoice

SPF Accident Claims Section inv No, WIN191101025
Tel: 64784840 Invoice Date 13 Nov 2019
Ref r WWJ19101732
Terms 7 Days
Veh. No. ' SLH3531E
Current Mileage 14538 km
§ o Tax Taxable
# Description Qty UuUOM u/P Amt Tax Type Amt
1 Lump sum repairs (SLH3531E) ] 4,100.00 287.00 GST (5R)(7%) 4,100.00
2  Survey fee 1 331.78 23.22 GST(SR) (7%) 331.78
Subtotal : 5% 4,431.78
Total Tax : S§ 310,22

Total+ 5% 4,742.00
For Lion City Rentals PteAtd

\
N

{ .

(Authorised Signature)
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/s APPRAISAL VP PTELTD

Company Reg No' 201403586G

malli@vpappiaiss

TAX INVCICE

Tax Invoice No VP 2018-00404
Tax Invoice Date 25-Jul-19
Terms 30 Days

Due Date 24-Aug-18
r

LCRF Pte Lid

80 Jalan Lam Huat #04-01

Carros centre

Singapore 737869

Claim Type : THIRD PARTY
Your Reference No, : PLS ADVISED
Survey Vehicle No : SLH3531E

Date of Accident
Report Date
Submit Date

Jur Reference No

: 18/06/2019
: 25/07/2019
: 2510712019
: VPA-2012/00333

Description Amount (S%)
Survey fee $270.00
Photograph $25.00
Transport $6C.00

SGD $355.00

Cheque payment is preferrad and should be made 1o

Name Appraisal VP Ple Ltd
Mailing Address

Alternatively Giro or EFT payment should be mage (o

Benaficiary Name : Appraisal VP Pla Ltd
Benaliciary Account No - 2889011510
Benasficiary Company Address

Bank :DBS

Bank Code LTIT

Bank Address

Branch Name DBS. MBFC

Branch Code - 288

Swift Code DBSSSGSG

** Faas are dua upon receipt of invaices as per our Terms and Conditions

- 50 PiayFair Road Noel Building +04-01 Singapore 367985

50 PlayFair Road Neal Sullding #04-01 Singapors 387285

: 12 Marina Boulevard, DBS Asia Cenlral. Marina Bay Financial Centsr Tower 3, Singapore 018982
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8@ JusEquity Law Corporation

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS » COMMISSIONER FOR DATHS
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JusEquity Law Corporation
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS « COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS

133 New Bridge Road #10-03, Chinatown Point,, Singapare 059413
Telephone: (65) 6536 9339, Fax: (65) 6536 5368
Email: claims@juseq.com.sg websitr: www.juseg.com.sg

OurRef:  JEQ/191215/1119/BLU
Your Ref:  SLD2369K (QX1153H)

25 November 2019

SINGAPORE POLICE FORCE By Fax: 6478 4848/ 6478
28 IRRAWADDY ROAD 4850
NEW PHOENIX PARK

SINGAPORE 329560

Dear Sir

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMF3538K & SLD2369K (QX1153H) ON 25-11-2019
We act for the owner of vehicle no. SMF3538K.

We hereby notify you of a road traffic accident on 25 November 2019 at about 1310 hrs, at
AYE involving our client’s vehicle and vehicle registration no. SLD2369K (QX1153H)
driven by you / your insured at the material time. A copy of our client’s accident report is
enclosed.

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle has been damaged. Before our client proceeds
to repair the damaged vehicle, please let us know within 2 working days of your receipt of this
notice whether you would like to conduct a pre-repair survey of the vehicle. If we do not
receive any reply from you within the stipulated timeline, our client shall proceed to repair the
vehicle without further reference to you.

Yours fajthfully

Encl.

CONFIDENTIAUTY CAUTION

This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it Is addressed and contains information that is privileged and
confidential. If you, the reader of this message, are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this
communication. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by telephone and return the original

message to us at the above address at our expense, Thank you.

JusEquity Law Corparation (Registration No. 200104738E) is a law corporation with limited liability



MLCR10082483 / Licn City Rentals Ple Lt - HQ Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
R TTED B Jons poiand 1128 Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 25/06/2019 13:24

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please repart correctly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process,
2. This Form must be the er and/or the Authorised Driver.

3.mmmmuummmmumwmmummmdmlmfmmyubwmummmm
repudiate palicy liability.
4.mmmwdqumwmmhistmdmwwmmmdmwmmu.

8. false be referred to the Police for

&mmﬂumbyhmaweummmmbyﬂwﬁmmrlnumw-ﬂmdsmmmu}fw
mmmmdmmmMam.ummumwwmmmu

?.BymbdgummolIhlirlpormlheImm.ymhmbymlomomd&mmnhmmmmmu&uwmmm
aforesaid.

Date Of Report

25/06/2019 11:36
Date Of Accident 19/06/2019 12:50
Exact Location Of Accident SERANGOON AVE 2
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SLH3531E

Vehicle Registration Number

Name Of Registered Owner LCRF PTELTD

Co Reg No 201624597K
Email Address RENTALS@LIONCITYRENTALS.COM.SG
Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-31381884

Vehicle Particulars e BEYE =5 o E
Manufacturer HONDA

Model SHUTTLE HYBRID-1.5 (A)

ﬁE:::c; r:m :or which vehicle was being used at PRIVATE USAGE

Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy NO

for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please stale action to be taken THIRD PARTY

PRIVATE CAR

Company

Name of Insurance Company

Type Of Coverage THIRD PARTY '
Fleet Policy YES
Policy Number 19-MK000200-R00

Cover Nole Number

Driver

Name of Driver GOH BAK TANG

NRIC No 51438840J '
Date Of Birth 04/11/1960 i
Occupation OUTDOOR |
Date Of Driving Pass 30/10/1984

Driving Experience 34 YEARS AND 7 MONTHS

Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-97332991

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMall Address NOEMAIL

Page 1 of 21




BLK 22 EUNOS CRESCENT
Addyes #05-3007

Postcode 400022
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured ~ OTHER - HIRER

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR ;
Road Surface DRY

Jther Infc

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)

involved in the accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO :
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by ;
ambulance? |

Was any other material or property damaged? NO |
|

I have been approached by unknown person(s) NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver) : 1 _ _ '

adnll -

Was the accident reported to the police? YES

Ce A o

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Police Station Name KAMPONG UBI NEIGHBOURHOOD POLICE POST
ROAD: BLK 9§ EUNOS CRESCENT #01-2687 , POSTCODE: 400009 )
Pallos Staiion Addross COUNTRY: SINGAPORE
Police Station Contact TEL NO: 1800-7479998 - FAX NO: 67453410
Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If Yes,against whom?

REFER TO SKETCH

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NO

Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number Qx1024Y

Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category GOVERNMENT

Name of Driver

NRIC/Passport Number

Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Page 2 of 21




Nature Of Damage |
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver) |

Pm&oﬂi:




Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE

r § Please report gorrectly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Form must be completed by the Poficyholder and/or the Authorized Driver.

3 MWMMHWMMMNMdM

4 mmmmm&mwmmhunmnmmmmmumm
companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.
6. m‘mnumnumqmmmmmmnmwm

mammmmﬂumaﬁmum-mummmmn
interested parties.

7. nwm#mhmwﬂnm;mmwuumnhm&mmumnmm and 10 copies of
the report being made availsble sloresaid,

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA|
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

0} processing, handiing and/or dealing with my ctaims including the settlement of the claims and any necessary
Investigations relating to the daims;

(ii} investigating the accident and/or my claims;
Mmmmmmmmumumemﬁm

Mwmmﬂuﬁmﬁﬂgawmmmnm 1o me,
which could involve discosure of certain personal data about me to biring about defivery of the same as well & on the
external cover of envalopes/mad packages); and for

ib) awmmmm:mhwmwuuwwmmmm
wﬂmmmmﬂmmmmumumummmm

mmmmumwmummmw-mmmmmmu
wmm-ﬁnrhﬂdm&m&mwmdm_mm

(d) wmmﬂ#hmumwmmmmu-mdhum
Investigaticn and management in present and all future daims.

() hMuMu&-wMMuMIM
0] uanmmqmmmhﬂhmmmum
mhm-nﬂmmnwm*nhm-m“n e
th%mﬁm-uﬂummm-mm

g

—Q‘:G )ﬂ,‘n

Driver’s Signature Reporting Centre Personnel’s Sgnature
(I driver &s not the policyholder) Name; Jeap
Date & Time: NRIC/FIN No.+
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Sketch Plan #2
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

| Bleat vefew b pne pulice repect a5 atlached

DECLARATION

Piindectons: particulars are true In every respect.

Policyholder's - L)
e~ o ‘F:.,'.,,_z - _

Date & Time: I Griver i 7ot the policyholder) Mo """". »
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SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Origin:
Kampong Ubi NPP

Sketch Plan #3 Pg. 1

T/20190620/2168

10of3
Report No, T/20180620/2188

8 Eunos Crescent #01-2687 SINGAPORE

400008
Tel No: 1800-7479999

REPORT OF A TRAFFIC ACCIDENT

Date/Time Report Made:
20/06/2019 20:48

niommants Harticulars

Vide Report No.: Station Diary No.:

Name of Informant: Address:
GOH BAK TANG APT BLK 22 EUNOS CRESCENT #05-3007 SINGAPORE
L 400022
ID Type / ID No.: Contact No.:
NRIC NO / S1438840J Home/Office: Mobile: 91128480
Nationality: Email:
SINGAPORE CITIZEN
Sex: Age: Date of Birth: | Type of Informant:
Male 58 04/11/1860 Driver
Race: Language: Institution / School Name:
Chinese
Occupation: Driving Licence Information:
GRAB DRIVER Class: 3 Date of Expiry:
Gereralllnformation ofthelAceidant
Non-Injury
mgt Police Vehicle Before right turn
Location:
Along Road 1
SERANGOON AVENUE 2
in -309 (BISE16)
Weather: Road Surface: Road Speed Limit:
Clear Dry
Traffic Flow: Traffic Control: Traffic Volume:
One Way Not Controlled No Traffic
Type of Collision: Anyone conveyed by
Betweaen Moving Vehicles - Head To Rear ambulance:
No

ELANTRA
1.6 AT ABS
D/AB 2WD
4DR

SLH3531E HONDA

SHUTTLE
HYBRID 1.5
A

Black 0

Page 6 of 21



Sketch Plan #4 Pg. 1

SINGAPORE "
POLICE FORCE mmmmmm‘mﬂﬂlm

Police Station Of Origin: 20f3
Kampong Ubi NPP Report No. T/20190820/2168
g Eunos Crescent #01 -2687 SINGAPORE

400008 CONTINUATION OF REFORT
Tel No: 1800-7479999

Pedestrian Involved: No

No. of Pedestrians Injured: NIL_ _ Use of Pedestrian Crossing: NA
Name LIM WEWIE 11D No. 58737879
Related Vehicle Qx1024Y Contact No.| NIL
Hospital/Clinic | NIL Class of | Class: NIL
Driving Date of Expiry: NIL
i Licence &
Expiry Date
Date Treatment | NIL Date Distharge NIL
No. of Days granted Medical Leave NIL ree of Injury | NIL
Name GOH BAK TANG ID No. $1438840J
Related Vehicle | SLH3531E ‘ Contact No.\ 91128480
Hospital/Clinic NIL Class of Class: 3
Driving Date of Expiry: NiL
Licence &
Expiry Date | -
Date Treatment | NIL Date Discharge | NIL
[ No. of Days granted Medical Leave | NIL Degres of Injury NIL
Brief Details.

On 19 June 2019 at about 12:50pm, | was driving vehicle SLH3531E along Serangoon Ave 2. | was ata
complete stop, with my right turn signal on. | was about to tum into the carpark on my right when | was hit
on the rear by vehicle QX1024Y.

The collision resulted in the rear boot door of my vehicle to te dented in. After the collision, both cars
drove into the carpark to exchange particulars. Traffic Police also came down and took down my
particulars. After which, | left the scene.

Page 7 of 21




Sketch Plan #5 Pg. 1

SINGAPORE
POLICE FORCE

Police Station Of Origin:

Kampong Ubi NPP

9 Eunos Crescent #01-2687 SINGAPORE
400008

Tel No: 1800-7479999

Sketch Plan
Informant is not able to provide sketch plan

IMPORTANT: Please attach a copy of your vehicle's
the certificate with you now, please fax a copy to 654

m T/20180620/2168

30f3
Report No. T/20180620/2168

CONTINUATION OF REPORT

Insurance Certificate to this report. If you don't have
74885 stating the report number as referencs.

Signature Of Officer Recording The Report: Signature Of Informant:
G/ 5

Sgt 2 CHAN LIP YANG, DEMIAN *} s
Signature Of Interpreter: ; Date/Time;

Not applicable 20/06/2019 20:48
Officer In Charge Of Case: Classification Of Case:
TP /DDGVT /

Page 8 of 21



/ APPRAISAL VP PTE LTD

50 playFair Road #04-01 No=! Buliding Singz

Companyv Reg No: 201403586G

we 357995 | Tel +85 68511914 | Emal mail@vpsppraisal com

VEHICLE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REPORT

To: LCRF Pte Ltd I
60 Jalan Lam Huat #04-01 :

Carros centre |

Singapore 737869 J
|

Survery Inspection Address

REFERENCES
Appraisal VP Ref No : VPA-2018/00333 Dats of Report : 25/07/2019
Claim Type : Third Party Claim Date of Request : 05/07/2018
Third party vehicle : SLH3531E Date of Accident 1 19/06/2018
Date of Inspection : 0510712019
Regisiration Plate No : SLH3531E Engine Modification :NIL
Model / Make : HONDA SHUTTLE Pre-accident damage * NIL
Calour : BLACK General Condition : Good
Manufacturing Year : 31110720186 Generzl Paint Work : Good
Engine No : LEB4263463 Stesring : Serviceable
Engine Capacity : 1496 CC Handbrake : Serviceable
Chassis No : GPT1043563 Footbrake : Serviceable
Odometer No 1234174
Transmission : AUTO
TYRES CONDITION
Front Right : 5mm Rear Left : S5mm
Make : FIRENZA Make : FIRENZA
Size : 185/60 R15 Size : 185/60 R15
Front Left : 6mm Rear Rignt : Bmm
Make : FIRENZA Mzke : FIRENZA
Size : 185/60 R15 Size : 185/60 R15
‘VEHICAL REPAIR COST
Descriptions Repairer (S§) Difference (S$) Adjuster (S§)
Paris 5,136.00 1,406.00 3,730.00
Labour 2,020.00 560.00 1,460.00
Calculated Cost (8$) : 7,156.00 1,966.00 5,190.00
Recommended Lump Sum Repair Cost (S$) 4,100.00
Estimate Repair Duration 4 Days
Survery Inspection At LCRF Pte Ltd

Carros Centre 80 Jalan Lam Huat #04-01

Singapore 7378692

This survey was congucted by Appreizal P Pre Lig withowr srejudios baais end we oo rof sulhcrped repsy Reooe by Appraizal VP Pre g is desmed a5 configantial and prowided far the
e of elmnts and appointed sgant e have inspected tharouphly sach and every llem on the repaines’s sstimane againal the actual damages found on the wehical All findings and
are imeg gy and final decison of safismant o your goodsalves Any disciosure or pubbcations of 1t or parts Mereof snad be e respons:biity of such person

N Kabilty shal! be aftacned 'o Appraisal VP Ple LH therefore



/ APPRAISAL VP PTELTD

Companv Reg No- 201403586G

Fait Rosd #0401 Nest B o Siligapie 57985 T = B Jpappraisal
ANNEX A
VEHICLE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REPOR
Reference NI VPA-2019/00333
Vehicle Nc SLH3531E
Workshep LCRF Pte Ltd
List of Damaged Parts
| Repairers|  Adjuster's
S/No | Qty |Description Condition . t(ss)| { (SS)
1 T |Rear taigale / Buckied 1.450.00 1.450.00| 12597
2 1 |Rear tailgate weatherstrip W Mot necesssan 225.00 0.00|X
3 1 |Rear tailgate windscreen m{}uldjr[g/ Necessary 185.00 195.00(/
4 1 |Rear tailgate lock / Jam 188.00 198.00)”
5 | |Rear tailgate lock zatch Y4uv Jam 105 00 105.00[#
8 1 |Rear tailgate hybird emblem / Necessary 88 60 88680/
7 1 |Rear tailgate shuttle emblem / MNecessary 84.860 84.80(.~
8 1 |Rear tailgate honda emblem X V% Necessary 31.30 8130|X
E 1 |Rear bumper Necessary | 1.800.00 1.800.00| IS0~
10 | |Rearendpanel X f Renair | 1.020.00 0.00|Y
11 1 |Rearend panel top gamish -/ ¢vv Deform 260.00 26000~/
Sub Total 5,507 50 azs250] ) Wh-7°
Less 20% 1,101.50 852.50] - j ?
iTohl 4,406.00 3,410.00 ? ]';?2 9’6
Special ltem
Repairer's Adjuster's
S/No _ Condition
. [Temcgyton Amount (85)] Amount (S§)
1 1 |Bumper clip Necessary 80.00 ap 00| 107
2 1 |Body sealant Necsssary 300.00 80.00| 40 /‘Jéﬁ'l
3 1 |Reverse sensor Necessary 250.00 200.00( 7
4 1 |Windscreem sezlant Not necessary 100.00 0.00
Sub Total 730.00 320.00
f
[Total 730.00 320.00] J / ¥

|FINAL TOTAL | 5,136.00]  3,730.00]




APPRAISAL VP PTELTD

Company Reg No J01403586G

ANNEX B

JEHICLE DAMAGH MENT RE
Reference No  : VPA-2019/00333
Vehicle No SLH3531E

Workshop LCRF Pte Ltd

Labour Details for front

Repairer's Adjuster's
SiNo Description
Amount (S§)| Amount (S§§)
1 To labour charge for removing rear bumper. rear boat, rear end 300.00 720.00
panel inner and outer out to facllitate repair and replacement of
damaged parts
2 To respray painting affected areas 900.00 600.00|/
3 To remove and install tailgate glass 120.00 80.00
6 Transfer tallgate mechanism 100.00 60.00
[Total Labour 2,020.00 1.480.00

ANNEX C

Repair Cost

Repairer's Adjuster’'s

o i Amount (S$)) Amount (SS§)
1 Total Part Cost 5,136.00 3,730.00
Total Repair and Labour Cost __2.020.00 1,460.00

|Total Repair Cost 7,156.00 5,180.00

- 237049

N- 979

Adjusted Repzir Cost
(Lump Sum Repair)

54,100.0C;‘

L- 1T47
5961-96
LIS~ T16-T6
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SU pinyF e Roao 304-01 Neel Busding Singagars 367985 | Tdl +B5 58511514 | Emal nallE vpapprasal com

VEHICLE DAMAGE ASSESSMENT REFORT

Reference No VPA-2018/00333
Vehicle No SLH3531E

ACCIDENT BRIEF

From documents sighited, the Insured's vehicle ana Third Fany's vehicle were involved in 3 Head te rear collision
On site survey inspection revealed that the damage noted are consistent with the sccident as reported

Damage at rear taiigate, r=ar bumper, rear end panel, rear spare tyre panei and slc

ADVICE

LCRF Pte Ltd submitted the estimate report cost of $7,156.00 we have adjusted the renair cost 10 $5.190.00. We
recocmmend the repair cost on 2 lump sum basis of $4,100 00

The repairs would require a penod of 04 working days

We are pleased to submit our inspection survey report and photographs for yeur kind attention.
All survey and inspection work was carried out to the best of our ability, knowledge ana expenence.

Victor Png\
Appralser
Appraisal VP Pte Ltd

Susgisumel
This sunvey was conductad by Appraisa! VO B Lo without pratdioe DAss @0 e 00 19T SUTNONTas s Reoon oy Aporamal VP Pis Lid i o& as conk and o d ko ihe

Use of ehents and! appenied sgent mewmwwﬂwmmmmmﬁmmmmwhnm Al fnclveps ang
Kalons arn kalst dingly ana Snal 3 of saul 10 pOur Qecd sebves Adty dreciosie e Of SuOkZINENS Of Il & FaNs INETEO! BNAN DE e TEAEGNSIDINY 31 KUET DErsen

Mo kagury snal be [ VP P L




Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd Company Registration No. 199607198R

51 UBI AVE 1, #01/02-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL: (065) 6256 3561 FAX: (065) 6256 4315

Your Ref: AEMD/105/009/2019/074 Date: 11" Dec 2019

Our Ref: CS1/SPF19020697/Etd3e2

M/s Automotive Engineering & MGT Division
Accident Claim Section (Spore Police Force)

| Mount Pleasant Road Blk 8 Old Police Academy
Singapore 298333

Attn : Hafizul Farhan

Dear Sir / Madam,

EVALUATION REPORT (PAPER SURVEY) OF ACCIDENT VEHICLE NO: SLH 3531E
INSURED VEHICLE: QX 1024Y
ACCIDENT DATE: 19/06/2018

We thank you for your instruction on 19/11/2019.

We acknowledge receipt of the following documents:-
a) Automobile Inspection Report of SLH 3531E from M/s Appraisal VP Pte Ltd.
b) Final Repair Bill of SLH 3531E from M/s Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd.
¢) Singapore Accident Statement and Police Report of Vehicles SLH 353 1E.
d) Colour damaged vehicle photographs of SLH 353 1E.

Based on the documents received from you, we have evaluated the damages of the vehicle and have
the following comments:-

1. Information Recorded: -

Registration Number : SLH 3531E
Make & Model : Honda Shuttle
Chassis Number : GP71043563
Year of Registration 12016

Engine Capacity : 1496 cc

2. We recommend that the repairs of the entire damage require about __4 (Four) _ working days
to complete.

3. We hereby provide our recommendations on the cost of repair to the damaged vehicle as stated
in the following page.



ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLH 3531E

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page No.:1of 2

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ‘g-)) (5‘;
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR TAILGATE BUCKLED 1,450.00 1,250.00
1|REAR TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP SERVICEABLE 225.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 195.00 195.00
1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK JAMMED 198.00 198.00
1|REAR TAILGATE LOCK CATCH SERVICEABLE 105.00 -
1|REAR TAILGATE HYBRID EMBLEM NECESSARY 88.60 88.60
1|REAR TAILGATE SHUTTLE EMBLEM NECESSARY B4.60 84.60
1|REAR TAILGATE HONDA EMBLEM SERVICEABLE 81.30 -
1|REAR BUMPER NECESSARY 1.800.00 1.150.00
1|REAR END PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 1,020.00
LABOUR
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH SERVICEABLE 260.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,101.50 -593.24
4,406.00 2,372.96
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BUMPER CLIP (SN) NECESSARY 80.00 30.00
1|BODY SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 300.00 40.00
1|REVERSE SENSOR (SN) NECESSARY 250.00 200.00
1|WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 100.00
730.00 270.00
LABOUR
TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR REMOVING REAR BUMPER, 900.00 600.00
REAR BOOCT, REAR END PANEL INNER AND QUTER OUT
TO FACILITATE REPAIR AND REPLACEMENT OF
DAMAGED PARTS. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR
END PANEL.
TO RESPRAY PAINTING AFFECTED AREAS. 900.00 600.00
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL TAILGATE GLASS. 120.00 80.00
TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM. 100.00 60.00
2,020.00 1,340.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,156.00 3,982.96

Report Ref No. CS1/SPF19020697/Etd3e2
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RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,200.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)
Report Ref No. CS1/SPF19020697/Etd3e2

NOTES : THE ESTIMATED UPPER RANGE OF REPAIR COST FOR THE DAMAGED VEHICLE IS IN THE REGION OF
$3,200-$3,500

RECOMMENDED REPAIR DAYS : 4
WEEKEND : 1
TOTAL DAYS : 5§

é: %2.
CHEN TSUE YEE ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.




