Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 January, 2020 2:09 PM

To: Siak Tong Sim

Cc: Kelly Shi; Yvonne Ng; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD/Invoice for SLG3981U - LKK REF CC4/AIG19020654/Qhb3
Attachments: SKW5752D search fee.pdf; SLG3981U LOD.PDF; SLG3981U Tax invoice.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly also furnish us the 2" page of the GIA search Fee Invoice.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

« Wishing you @ Happy and Frosperous Lunar New Yeq, »

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ SRS

RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Siak Tong Sim [mailto:siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 26 December, 2019 2:54 PM
To: Vic (LKKAuto)



Cc: Kelly Shi; Yvonne Ng
Subject: Re: LOD/Invoice for SLG3981U

Dear sir
Attached LOD/Invoice for SLG3981u for your approval and early settlement

Regards
S.T.Sim (65-97422188)
Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat

#04-35/36 Carros Centre

Singapore 737869




