Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 9 April 2021 8:22 AM

To: Ace Autolution

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: GBD2185S LOD LKK REF : CC4/AIG19020652/Apb3
Attachments: DV_GBD2185S.pdf

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.
We confirm settlement at $3,356.45(all-in).

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary
action: -

e Authorisation to Act signed by your client, Comfort Design Pte Ltd

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 8 April 2021 6:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBD2185S LOD LKK REF : CC4/A1G19020652/Apb3

Dear Sir / Madam,
We accept the above offer.

Thank you .



Regards,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD
13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE
SINGAPORE 417807

Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

On Fri, Mar 12, 2021 at 11:15 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dears Sirs/Mdm,

We have make an offer on 26/12/2020. Kindly refer to the attached email.

Please confirm acceptance.

1. Cost of Repair 5 3,000.00
2. Loss of Use (4days x $80.00) 5 320.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 5 345

Total | % 3,356.45

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 10 March 2021 5:55 PM

To: Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBD2185S LOD LKK REF : CC4/A1G19020652/Apb3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.

Hi Hsiao Tong,

FYNA, CC4/A1G19020652/Apb3

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Su Li| Admin Support

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, March 10, 2021 5:43 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: GBD2185S LOD

Dear Sir / Madam,

May | receive your reply as soon as possible ?

Thank you .

Regards,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417807




Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

On Wed, Dec 30, 2020 at 4:38 PM Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir / Madam,

For the Loss of Use, can your side help us to add on 3-4 days ? Because waiting PRI, Saturday & Sunday .

Thank you .

Regards ,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417807

Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

On Wed, Sep 9, 2020 at 3:53 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Anna,

Kindly be informed that we are preparing our report to seek mandate.



We will revert accordingly.

Thank you.

"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: 9 September 2020 2:59 PM

To: 'Ace Autolution' <admin@aceauto.com.sg>; Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GBD2185S LOD

Dear Anna,

Thank you for the email.



Dear Khanchna,

Kindly assist.

est Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 9 September, 2020 2:50 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Re: GBD2185S LOD

Dear Sir / Madam,

May | have any answer from your side ?

Thank you .

Regards ,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE




SINGAPORE 417807

Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

On Thu, Aug 27, 2020 at 4:22 PM Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Catherine,

For this case , have any updates for us ?

Thank you .

Regards,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTE LTD

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417807

Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

On Mon, Jun 1, 2020 at 4:33 PM Ace Autolution <admin@aceauto.com.sg> wrote:

Dear Sir/Madam ,

Please take note of the attached file ( Letter of Demand ) for your action .

Date of accident : 09 November 2019



Involving Vehicle No : SMD3481A

Regards ,

Anna

ACE AUTOLUTION PTELTD

13 KAKI BUKIT ROAD 4 ,

#03-29 BARTLEY BIZ CENTRE

SINGAPORE 417807

Tel : 6844 1184 / 9657 2134

Attachments area



