Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Sent: August 5, 2021 12:57 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin

Cc: ‘claims’; Admin A

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1911-125--Accident involving SMG6015C (AIG) & SHD9842L on 15.11.19

*** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19020577/Kba3

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Yin,
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our principal M/s AIG ASIA PACIFIC PTE LTD had repudiated the claims in view of our
insured has breach of policy terms and conditions.

Kindly re-direct your client’s claim to our insured for redress.
We will proceed to close off the matter.
Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: July 13,2020 12:26 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1911-125--Accident involving SMG6015C (AIG) & SHD9842L on 15.11.19 *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG19020577/Kba3



Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Jasper,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted

From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 July, 2020 11:52 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'claims' <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1911-125--Accident involving SMG6015C (AIG) & SHD9842L on 15.11.19

Without prejudice

Dear Sir

We are making a claim against your client SMG 6015C.
Enclosed is our LOD for your easy reference.

Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.

Hope to receive your offer soon.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department

TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

**¥* Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63



Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764
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