Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 June 2020 12:14 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: SMG 2966J DOA : 14/11/19
Attachments: 20200605_120641.jpg; 20200605_120726.jpg
Hi Shiau Chan,

This case finalised

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 June, 2020 12:04 PM

To: TEAMWORK

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hu Shu Shan,
thanks

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

57424

SERER WWTT e the Larthe Print only when necessary-

From: TEAMWORK [mailto:claims@teamworkgarage.com]
Sent: Friday, 5 June, 2020 11:44 AM




To: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Cc: TEAMWORK
Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Dear Rasul,
We confirm COR @ $3750 and DOR @ 5 days
Thank you and have a nice day.

Regards,

Shu Shan

Teamwork Garage Pte Ltd
Blk 53 Ubi Avenue 1
#01-24

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408934

Tel: 6844 2475

Fax:6844 2474

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Tuesday, 2 June 2020 4:45 PM

To: Darren
Subject: RE: SMG 2966J DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Any update?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 May, 2020 12:00 PM
To: 'Darren’

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,



Any update?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ IFEFS s
SemmE = e Save the Larthe Frint only when necessary-

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April, 2020 3:47 PM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly update

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 15 April, 2020 12:19 PM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly update

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 April, 2020 8:34 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly update

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 13 April, 2020 9:02 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly update

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 April, 2020 9:09 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19



Hi Darren,

Any update?

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EFES e
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 6 April, 2020 12:42 PM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly expedite

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 April, 2020 10:31 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly expedite

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 March, 2020 9:36 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly expedite

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 March, 2020 11:01 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly expedite

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 March, 2020 8:53 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19



Hi Darren,

Please assist insurance is chasing again

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ ESES -

RLERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 March, 2020 9:49 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Please assist in confirming the finalise amount

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 6 March, 2020 3:08 PM

To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly assist

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March, 2020 8:57 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly confirm the amount, insurance is chasing for the report

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 March, 2020 9:58 AM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Can close?

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 3 March, 2020 12:01 PM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly assist to confirm



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 February, 2020 12:22 PM
To: Darren

Subject: RE: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 February, 2020 11:09 AM
To: Darren

Subject: SMG 2966] DOA : 14/11/19

Hi Darren,

Refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 3,750 / 5 days of lump sum repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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