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Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 9:22 AM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: RE: OD / 5578737087SG / SKR 1614Y Dat of loss 3 Oct 2019
Hi

Our source S 40k - $ 45k, do you have any SG car mart references ?

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit 100.ala ro learn more.

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) [mailto:yvonnewong@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, October 31, 2019 9:06 AM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK; SUR

Subject: [EXTERNAL] OD / 5578737087SG / SKR 1614Y Dat of loss 3 Oct 2019

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Morning Priscilla

The market value of SKR1614Y is $73K - $74K (Estimated) as at Oct 2019.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK [mailto:Priscilla-LK.Sim @aig.com]

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 2:49 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Alvin Yit (alvinyit@fta.com.sg) <alvinyit@fta.com.sg>
Subject: RE: OD / 55787370875G / SKR 1614Y Dat of loss 3 Oct 2019
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Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) 7'/"’/"7
From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 2:49 PM

To: SUR; Alvin Yit (alvinyit@fta.com.sg)

Subject: RE: OD / 5578737087SG / SKR 1614Y Dat of loss 3 Oct 2019

Hi

Kindly assist with market value.



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner P:rticutars

} Owner ID T'ﬂJE

| Owner ID: _

| Vehicle Details

| Vehicle No:

| Vehice tobe Exported:

[ Intended Dcregtstratlon Date:
Vehic_l_e Ma ke;

Vehicie Modet:

Primary Colour:
Mandfactﬁ}i—né_fear )
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

' Mauli'num Powcr Ou:put.
Open Market Value.
Original Registration Da bes
F]rs_t_ Reglstrra_tlonpate:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PA.RF Eligjblhty-

PARF Eaglhnlity Expirv Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Periad(Years):
} QP Paid

Coggggate Amounl

Total Rebate Amaunl_
The Im‘ormation contamed herem is correct as at 04 Oct 2019

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Singapore NRIC
B835A

SKR1614Y p
Yes

04 Oct 2019

HONDA

HONDA INSIGHT 1.3 CVT HYBRID
Red i ip—
2014 -

LDA35001611
JHMZE2850ES200068

72.0kW (96 bhp) ' -
$18.759.00

21Jan 2015
~21 Jan 201‘5

1 .

£5,000.00

Yes
20 Jan 2025
$3,750.00

20 Jan 2025

~ A-Car up to 1600cc & 97kW {130bhg)

10

$66.01000
$34.939.00
$3868900



r- 100 Celebrating 100 Years:

Visit g to learn more.

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2019 2:45 PM

To: Yew Hock Motor

Subject: OD / 55787370875G / SKR 1614Y

Hi Chris

Yew Hock has tender the wreck for $ 39,839/=

Kindly enlighten the market value of this car Honda Insight 1.3 Hybrid as not able to find any reference in SG car mart.
Priscilla Sim LK

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

100 Celebruﬁng 100 Years:

Visit 100.alg to learn more.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



10/31/20" ' Used Honda Insight Hybrid 1.3 Car in Singapore @ Price SGD 62,900

Use: 'w.oneshift.com/used_cars/index.php)
» H qs (|istings.php?make:Honda&model:lnsight) » Honda Insight Hybrid 1.3 (A)
U e / Model Search
GO SHOWFILTER  ADVANCED SEARCH (www.oneshift.com/used_cars/advanced_search,php)

Overview v

)
|
|
]

1 insight Hybrid 1.3 (A)
'5.php?po_carname=Honda Insight

.k~ﬁ-‘?\-

$62,900

Be the first of your friends to like this.

~d (//lwww.oneshift.com/used_cars/ads_detail_print.php?adid=236722&print=1)
$62,900
Available
26 Feb 2014 4 yrs 3 mths left
571,564

https:/ cars/ads-detail.php?adid=236722&make=Honda&model=Insight
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