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31 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (1631 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTDI1905369/SYH Date: 26™ December 2019
Our Rel> CS/SMO19020489/Ugd3 Without Prejudice

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Melvin
Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO._SJR 6246E .

We thank you for the instruction on _19/11/2019.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 19/11/2019 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount :S§ 14.396.96 .

Revised Estimate Amount :S% 4.050.00 (Lump Sum)
“Check™ Items Amount ks -

Market Value : 5% -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 5% -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

rear portion.

Comments’ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

Marcus Chua
Licensed Appraiser



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvinye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 2:31 PM

To: SUR; assignments

Cc: Jason; Henry, Irene James; Hwang, Shiang Yi; Lina Pang

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim)  Qur ref :
CMTD1905369/SYH

Without Prejudice
Hi LKK Auto,

Please make arrangement to survey SIR6246E on a without prejudice basis.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

SOMPO
@ S A Century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
30 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sqg | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase? via Sompo SG

# Download on the [ (cafife ]

»
S— @& App Store P> Google Play

For Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | © For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may cantain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited
if you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November, 2019 11:47 AM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref : CMTD1905369/5YH

Without Prejudice



Dear Sir/Madam,

We will like to select Marcus Chua From LKK Auto Consultants,
Thank you,

Best Regards

Lina

Fastech Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#01-46/48/50 Autobay
Singapore 417883

Tel: 67465405 Fax: 67458520

Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2015 11:28 AM

To: Lina Pang <Lina.pang @fastechauto.com.sg>

Cc: Jason <Jason@fastechauto.com.sg=; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi
<shiangyi hwang @s50mpo.com.sge

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref : CMTD1905369/SYH

Our Reference : CMTD1905369/SYH
Your Reference: SIR6246E

Without Prejudice
Date: 19/11/2019

Attention:
FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
Dear Lina,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIR6246E & GBH1440R ON18.11.2018

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 18/11/2019.

Please be informed that Ms Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct

the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)

2



Mahd Rasul (West area)
Maohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng
leffery Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A century of Trust
P INSURANCE |

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase? via Sompo 5G

# Download on the B GETITON

@ App Store

P> Google Play

1For Travel Parsonal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Download now @ or

Disclaimer: This g-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
andior legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message,

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclasure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf}. Please click here for
our Privacy Policy

From: Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sp>

Sent: Monday, 18 November, 2019 2:34 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg=

Cc: Jason <Jasan@fastechauto.com.sg>

Subject: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

Your insured’s vehicle: GBH 1440R.



Date of accident: 18/11/2019

Please arrange Pre-repair Inspection for my client’s vehicle no: SJR 6246E.

In accordance to APPENDIX C Pre-action Protocol for Non-Injury Motor Accident Cases of PRACTICE
DIRECTIONS

AMENDMENT NO. 1 OF 2016 paragraph 2.3, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors within 2
days of the notice.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Lina

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6
#01-46/48/50 AutoBay
Singapore 417883

lel: 6746 3405

Please note that it is o condition of any scttlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any personal injury ¢laim (iCany ) of the owner/
claimant.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuta)

Sent; Thursday, 26 December 2019 9:59 AM

To: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; assignments; ‘"Hwang, Shiang Yi'

Cc: 'Henry, Irene James'; SUR

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref :
CMTD15905369/5YH

Attachments: CSSMO19020489Uqd3.pdf

Dear Shiang Yi,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 5JR 6246E.

Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 5:54 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@/kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref : CMTD1905369/5YH

Dear Melvin,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 5IR 6246E on 18/11/2015.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@]kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)} <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 2:56 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; SUR

<sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Request for PRS : 5JR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref : CMTD1905369/SYH

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 5:54 PM

To: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; assignments

Cc ‘Henry, Irene James'; 'Hwang, Shiang ¥i'; SUR

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref:
CMTD1905369/SYH

Dear Melvin,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SIR 6246E on 18/11/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 2:56 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@s0ompo.cOM.sg=; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Henry, Irene James' <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi' <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg=; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com:=

Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SJR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref: CMTD1905369/SYH

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin [mailto:melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 2:31 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Jason <lason@fastechauto.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi

<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>; Lina Pang <Lina.pang@fastechauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: Request for PRS : SIR 6246E DOA: 18.11.2019 (Third Party Claim) Our ref : CMTD1905369/5YH

Without Prejudice
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page 1 of 2

Enﬁuire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:
Message

Company
556D

SJR6246E

No

18 Nov 2019

HONDA

CITY 1.5LI-VTEC AUTO
Beige

2008

L15A71800665
MRHGM26509P020207
88.0 kW (118 bhp)
$19,338.00

01 Jul 2009

01 Jul 2009

1

$19,338.00

Forfeited

$0.00

31 May 2024

A - Car (1600cc & below)
5

$13,943.00

$12,646.00

$12,646.00

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle
must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if

applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Nov 2019

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput7?FUNCTION _[D=F030... 18-Nov-19



FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No : 20-0006262-D

REG NO. : SIR 6LY6CE  HoX
MAKE/MODEL:  HONDA CITY ;

ESTIMATED REPAIR COST FOR THE VEHICLE MENTIONED ABOVE 4l ﬁ
oTY DESCRIPTION AMT(S$)
LISTITEMS i
i Rear windscreen moulding 5 86.50
| Rear boot lid 57 595.20
Rear boot hinges 5 128.80
Rear boot 3 373.80
1 Rear boot inner lock $ 149,60
i Rear boot logo 5 2250
1 Rear boot "CITY" emblem 5 t 31.60
1 Rear boot "IVTEC" emblem 5 32.70
1 Rear boot outer chrome moulding $ 212.50
2 Rear boot number plate lamps 5 64.00
2 Rear talllamps $ 591.20
2 Rear taillamp panels 5 301.00
1 Rear end panel 5 525.50
1 Rear end panel inner garnish $ 135.50
i Rear bumper 5 670.60
2 Rear bumper brackets % 50.00
i Rear bumper lower grille 5 235.00
2 Rear bumper reflectors - 136.00
2 Rear bumper side retainers % : 77.20
1 Rear floor panel § 7 911.40
1 Rear floor board 5 ( 146.80 —
i Rear fender % T765.60
2 Rear fender air gates $ 117.20 ~
2 Rear fender inner shields % 117.20 ,
2 Rear fender Inner trims % 393.80 »
s 6,871.20
; Less 20% 5 1374.24
' $

5496.96

PAGE10OF 2
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SPECIAL NETT ITEMS

Rear windscreen sealant
Rear boot top spoiler

Rear bumper clip (1 set)
Rear bumper r
Body sticker (1 set)

LABOUR CHARGES

To remove, replaced damaged lamps and check up rear wiring,
To remove and refit inner garnishes.

To remove and refit rear reverse sensor.

To transfer rear boot lid mechanism and wirlng assembly.

To remove and refit rear windscreen glass.

To remove, refit and replace exhaust silencer and mountings.
To apply undercoating.

Panel beating.

To re-spray painting on the affected areas,

GRAND TOTAL :

PAGE20F 2

5,496.96

80.00 -
850.00 =

50.00
1,200.00
2,200.00

@l o 0 A

4,480.00

80.00
180.00 |
150.00

80.00
1B0.00 .

150.00 -

200.00
1.800.00
1,600.00

@lh o B W B oW B BN

4,420.00

14,396.96




y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-y 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607108-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL Ref : CS/SMO190204B9/Ugd3n2
e " |INAAE
#05-01/06 Date: 02-01-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: 3SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
insured Veh. GBH 1440R Veh. Inspected SJR B246E
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1905369/5YH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YOMNG KANG MELVIN Assign Date 19/11/2019
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CITY (A) c.c 1497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. MRHGM26508P020207 Colour BEIGE
Odometer 265303 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Medification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[195/55R15 FIRENZA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |185/55R15 FIRENZA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/55R15 FIREMZA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |195/55R15 FIREMZA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  18/11/2019 |Inspection Date 19/11/2019
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg No: 109807198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJR 6246E

£1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Page No.:1 of 2

; Estimate Our Adjusted
aty Description of Parts Condition [ -8 mmp?;}] ";,’:%
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NOT NECESSARY B86.50 -
1|REAR BOOT LID DENTED / BENT 595.20 595.20
2|REAR BOOT HINGES NOT NECESSARY 128.80 -
1|REAR BOOT WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 373.80 161.30
1|REAR BOOT INNER LOCK TWISTED 149,60 148.60
1|REAR BOOT LOGO MECESSARY 2250 22.50
1|REAR BOOT "CITY" EMELEM MECESSARY 31.60 31.80
1|REAR BOOT "I-WTEC® EMELEM NECESSARY 32.70 3270
1|REAR BOOT QUTER CHROME MOULDING CRACKED 212.50 212.50
Z2|REAR BOOT NUMBER FLATE LAMPS NOT MECESSARY 64.00
Z|REAR TAILLAMPS CRACKED 591.20 591.20
Z2|REAR TAILLAMP PANELS QIS BENT / N/STO 301.00 150.00
REPAIR SEE
LABOUR
1|REAR EMD PANEL BADLY DENTED 52550 404 60
1|REAR END PANEL INMNER GARMISH TWISTED 135.50 135.50
1|REAR BUMPER DENTED 670.60 523.20
Z2|REAR BUMPER BRACKETS NO SUCH PARTS 50.00 -
1|REAR BUMPER LOWER GRILLE NO SUCH PARTS 235.00 =
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS NO SUCH PARTS 136.00 -
Z2|REAR BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS BENT T7.20 yr.20
1|REAR FLOOR PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 911.40 -
LABOUR
1|REAR FLOOR BOARD TORMN 146.80 146.80
1|REAR FENDER TO REPAIR SEE TES.60 -
LABOUR
2|REAR FENDER AIR GATES MOT NECESSARY 117.20 -
2|REAR FENDER INMER SHIELDS MOT MECESSARY 117.20 -
?|REAR FENDER INMNER TRIMS NOT NECESSARY 393.80 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -1,374.24 -G46. T8
5.496.96 258712

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19020488/Ugd3n2




| P P4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

§1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Page Mo 2 of 2

Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Wo rk!hnp?;]} {il}
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 -
1|REAR BOOT TOP SPOILER (SN) NOT FITTED 850.00
1|SET REAR BUMPER CLIP (SN) MECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) SHORTED 1,200.00 200.00
1|SET BODY STICKER (SN) NOT FITTED 2,300.00
4,480.00 220,00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE,REPLACED DAMAGED LAMPS AND CHECK B0.00 30.00
UP REAR WIRING.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INNER GARNISHES. 180.00 80.00
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 150.00 50.00
TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID MECHANISM AND B0.00 §0.00
WIRING ASSEMBLY.
TO REMOVE AND REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS. NOT NECESSARY 180.00
TO REMOVE,REFIT AND REPLACE EXHAUST SILENCER |NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
AND MOUNTINGS,
TO APPLY UNDERCOATING. 200.00 80.00
PAMEL BEATING.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF NIS 1,800.00 850.00
REAR TAILLAMP PANELS REAR FLOOR PAMEL AND
REAR FENDER.
TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE AFFECTED AREAS. 1,600.00 1,100.00
4.420.00 2,250.00
GRAND TOTAL 14,396.96 5,067.12
RECOMMEMNDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 4,050.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19020489/Uqgd3n2

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DMSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES: - This Repar i mada solaly for the use and benafit of the Client namad on the front page of this Reporn.

biligy of responsibility whalsosyes, lf can or tort, i accepbed bo any d party who m [ip

i iy Ehdrd paarty




