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Ssm B Pre L Company Registration No. 109807 108R

S1UREAVE L, mi2-25 PAYA UHDINDHUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE J08913 TEL : (065) 2583561 FAX : (045) 62564315

Yourrel:  To Be Advised Dale: 02,12.2019
Our ref: CC4/LPC19020480/T L hbh3

The Motor Claims Department

M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sir/Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SMEKS011D
We refer to the above matier.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 27.11.2019
at the premises of M/s _CYS Automobile Services Pre Lid and have the following 1o report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 5% 4,18E.56

Revised Estimate Amount : 5§ 3,838.56

"Check” Items Amount : 5% :

Murket Value 1 88 -

LTA Reimbursement Value : 58 -

Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage: P =
The vehicle sustained damages at the

/S Portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4 days

Yours faithiully,

MOHD. TAUFIKH
Licensed Appralser
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5 CYS Automobile Services Pte Ltd

ROC Reg. Mo :ADS041/2001E GST Reg. NO' 20-0105041-E
MR NURLIZAWATI BINTE RAMLAN POLICY NO " THIRD PARTY CLAIM
BLK. 694A WOODLANDS DRIVE 62 YOUR REF - GBE 5182 X (LONPAC)
#04-16 SINGAPORE 731694 OUR REF - TP 6098
VECHICLE NO - SMK B011 D
MAKE/MODEL - HYUNDAI AVANTE
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 12.11.19
SURVEY BY DATE : 13.11.19
1 PC FRONT DOOR RH S$ 1.831.20 df{-’
1 PC FRONT DOOR STICKER RH 24 0001~
1 PC FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE RH 69.00 £V
PC REAR DOOR RH 1,775.00(o(—
PC REAR DOOR STICKER RH 24 00 A
S$  3,723.20
LESS 20% 744 64
S$ 297858
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTION S$ 30.00 .~
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPLACED/ REPAIRED PANEL 80.00 SU
LABOUR CHARGES 500.00 4 <0
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES 600.00 < °°
SS 418856

SIN DDLLAﬁS: FOUR THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY-EIGHT AND CENTS FIFTY-SIX ONLY
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38 Woodlands Industrial Park East 1 #07-17 Admiralty Industnal Park Singapore 757700
Tel: 6219 2098 (3 Lines) Fax: 6219 2036 E-mall: cysauto@singnet.com.sg



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 10:30 AM
To: CYS Auto, Woodlands; MT_Claim_SG; assignments@Ikkauto.com; Admin-D

(LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMKB011D YOUR INSURED: GBES192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY

Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022640 [External General]

13 amed la/it|2014
Lonpac External - General ' M}-Lim
Without Prejudice ’
Ve not In

Dear Esther

Our Insured has reported the accident.

You may liaise with LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd for survey.
Dear Nivitha

FTA

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 ExL. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706
=

The all C¥e% lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General dala is for internal / external use

Erom: CYS Auto, Woodlands [mailto;cysauto@singnet.com.sg)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 9:48 AM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMK8011D YOUR INSURED: GBE5192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Dear Lili,

Any update on this case?

My client is chasing me already
Pls halp me

Thanks.

Esther

Cys
62192098



From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 2:16 PM

To: CYS Auto, Woodlands <cysauto@singnet com sg>

Cec: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim @lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMK8011D YOUR INSURED: GBES192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Lonpac External - General
Dear Esther,

My colleague, Ms Ong Li Li is handling the case.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

1,

The all £%%3 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data Is for internal / external use

From: CYS Auto, Woodlands [mallto;cysauto@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 15 November, 2019 1:07 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Clalm_SG

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMKB011D YOUR INSURED: GBES192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Hi Gerald,

My client said that your insured has reported
Can | have the liability now?

Thanks.

Esther
Cys
62192098

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]
Sent: Thursday, 14 November, 2019 2:24 PM

To: CYS Auto, Woodlands <cysauto@singnel COM.sg>
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMK8011D YOUR INSURED: GBES192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Lonpac External - General

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Esther,

Our insured has not done so and we have written to him already.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

.

im

The all C¥&% ) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use.

From: CYS Auto, Woodlands [mailto:cysautoi@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 14 November, 2019 2:09 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMK8011D YOUR INSURED: GBE5192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Hi Gerald,
Do advise if your insured did report already?
Thanks.

Esther
CYS
62192098

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November, 2019 3:25 PM

To: CYSAUTO <cysauto@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SMKBO011D YOUR INSURED: GBES192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY [External General]

Lonpac External - General
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Wee 5in,

Our insured has yet to lodge the report and we are unable to comment on llability.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

3



300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
65) 6296 2706

The all (&%) lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use

From: CYSAUTO [mailto:cysauto@singnel,.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November, 2019 3:20 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: OUR REF: SMKB011D YOUR INSURED: GBES 192X - KINDLY CHECK LIABILITY

Our Ref: SMKS8011D
Your Insured: GBES192X WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMKS8011D AND GBE5S192X AT BLK. 162 WOODLANDS ST. 13 OPEN
AIR CARPARK ON 12 NOVEMBER 2019

Atiached herewith GIA report for your attention.
Kindly check liability for this claim.
Your early reply is awaited. Thanks

Warm regards,
Ms Tee Wee Sin

\ / CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD
‘ ‘ 38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1 #07-17 S(757700}
5 Tel: 62192098 Fax: 62192096

Email: cysauto@singnet.com.sg




CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD

38 Waodlands Industrial Park East 1
#07-17 Admiralty Industrial Park
Singapare 757700
Tel: 62192098 (3 lines] Fax: 62192096
E-mail address: cysanto@singnet.com.sg

Our Ref: SMKS8011D
Your Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022640

13 February 2020

IMMEDIATE  ATTENTION
Lonpac Insurance Berhad BY EMAIL & POST ONLY
300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Attn: Ms Ong Li Li, Motor Claims Department

Dear Ms.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMKS011D AND GBES192ZX AT BLK. 162
WOODLANDS ST. 13 OPEN AIR CARPARK ON 12 NOVEMBER 2019

Refer your email dated 12 February 2020.

We enclosed herewith your respective Discharge Voucher and our client’s Letter of
Authority for your attention.

Kindly let us have vour respective cheque of $4.550.20 made in favour of “CYS

AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD” without delay.

Yours Sincerely,
CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTE LTD

Tee Wee Sin
Secretary



' 7d 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bl BE B 51 Ut Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 288 3581 FAX: B258 4315

Reg. No: 18960T188R GST Reg. No. 16-9607108-R

i

DF INSURANCE BHD Rel - CC4/ILPC19020480/T 1ha3n2

300 BEACH ROAD :
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 198555 Oate 18022020 l|||l[|l”|l|

Claim No. 18/19/18/VC05/022640 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From  ONGLILI Assign Date 18/11/2019

Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2019
Chassis No. KMHDB41CMKLUB93412 Colour BLACK
Odometer BB45 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 NEXEN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/65 R15 NEXEN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |195/65R15 NEXEN B mm

L/H Rear Tyre |195/85 R15 NEXEN & mm

2rniroe

Survey held at CYS AUTOMOBILE SERVICES PTELTD

38 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK EAST 1
#0717

ADMIRALTY INDUSTRIAL PARK
SINGAPORE 757700

A:lTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON .ﬁ PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:
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Reg. Mo 168607188R GS5T Reg No. 19-0607184-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMK 8011D

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ui Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibd Indusinal Park, Singapone 408833
TEL 8256 3561 FAX 8256 4315

Page MNo.:1af 1

Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMRER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Repor s mads sabsly (er the use snd eosdil sl e Client named on the o pags of tis Repen.

rl Advy B

| condition
1|FRONT DOOR RH CENTED 1,831.20 1.831.20
1|FROMNT DOOR STICKER RH MECESSARY Z24.00 24.00
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER HANDLE RH TO REPAIR SEE 69.00 »
LABOUR
1|REAR DOOR RH DENTED 1,775.00 1,775.00
1|REAR DOOR STICKER RH MECESSARY 24.00 24.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT <744 B4 -730.84
297B.56 28231.36
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTION 30,00 30.00
TO APPLY RUST PROOFING ON REPLACED/REPAIRED BD.DO 30.00
PANEL.
LABOUR CHARGES.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF 500.00 400.00
FRONT DOOR OUTER HAMDLE RH.
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING CHARGES. 800.00 400.00
1.210.00 B&0.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,188.56 3,783.36
| RECOMMENDE FREPAIRS |- b DRB| e A=t | 378338l
Report Rel No. CC4/LPC12020480/T 1ha3n2
g " p i
i
|I
MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN
M.MATAL AMSAE-A Automolive Assossor



