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MS@ Fi rs tca pita] MS First Capital Insurance Limited CoRap o 2080001080 C51 Feg tin M2-CODLATE.S

& Aaffles Quay H21-50 Singepare 248580

Tel (A5} 6222 2311 Fau:[gS) 6222 3547

Clalin & Hadee Underwilting Dupe 6 Rebinson Road FLE-01 City 1ouse Singagere 090877
T=i [65)6507 IBLE Fax: [55) G507 184%

wwiw.msfirstoapital comosg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 12-11-2019 Our Ref No. D12007164MFSEH
Accident Date (08-11-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHBE228R Third Party Vehicle. SLCE177M
Survey Location 176 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01
Contact Person. CHEW KEONG
Contact No. 64528211/ 0 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

intad
SRR LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number. A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

) SUPREME AUTO
A At . MIL
Cc : Workshop SERVICE PTE LTD tention. NI
Cc : TP Solicitor A TP Solicitor Fax No. MA
Officer Incharge JASON TEA CHEE KIAT
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survay assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is & computer gensrated latter, no signalure required.




I‘I"_vnnne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 10:53 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc 'lason Tea'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007164MFSH/A
Attachments: SLC8177M DOA 08112019 REVERT.pdf

Dear 5ir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLCEB177M
Date of survey : 19/11/2019
Mumber of days : 3 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6o56-1561 | email; ywonnewongi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

Best Regards,
Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler
LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phane: 6256-3561 | email; yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 11:48 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg=; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Jason Tea' <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007164MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
Fhone: 6841-1972 | email; assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{an8qa3)

From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2015 11:02 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Jason Tea <JasonTea@msfirstcapital.com.sg=
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18007164MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards.

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com
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A1 UREAVE L1125 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL @ (0631 62563561 FAX : (065) 62504315

Your Rel* D19007164MEFSH Date: 22 Nov 2019

Our Ref: CS/FC119020463/Kyd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SLC817TM .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 19/11/2019 at the premises of M/s SUPREME AUTO SERVICE P/L. and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 3.190.35
Revised Estimate Amount ' S% 1.854.73
“Checlk™ Items Amount 1 5% 131.92
Market Value : 5%
LTA Reimbursement Value - 88
Nett Value 58

Description of Damage:

nearside
The vehicle sustained damages  —e—

at the ofs rear door. [ | [ T
affside
Yours faithfully

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Wehicle Owner Particulars
Crwner [D Type:

Crwner 1D:

Wehicle Details

Wehicle Mo.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Wehicle Make:

ehicle Model:

Primary Celour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo.:

CH:a.ssis Ma.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rehate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Perindﬂ‘r’_ﬂars]:

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Tatal Rebate Amount:

The infermation contained harein is correct as at 13 Jan 2020

Campany
(148

SLCBI177M

Mo

13 Jan 2020
TOYOTA

WELLFIRE 2.5Z G-EDITIOMN CVT
Black

2016

ZARHAT? 184
AGHINC057354
134.0 KW {179 bhpl
£40,943.00

24 May 2016

24 May 2016

3

54932100

Yes
25 May 2026
534.9%0.00

25 May 2024

B - Car above 1600cc or $7EW (130bhp)
10

$4%,1546.00

$31,290.00

$68,280.00

OK



SUPREME AUTO SERVICE PTE LTD

TIDAL CAPITAL PTELTD

176 SIN MING DRIVE #02-01 SINGAPORE 575721
TEL: 64520715 FAX: 64529250

ESTIMATE

clo 46 Lentor Plain
Singapore 786548

i /Z:'J,?ég,,;v
(1L, @ (5224
Voroy Aboe /2,

?d:,«;?

iy

Date: 19/11/2018

QUANTITY

PARTICULARS

AMOUNT (3)

1pc
1pc
1pc
1pc

RE: SLC 8177 M

rear bumper frjﬂa‘?'

rear bumper retainer
rear bumper lamp

towing cover Z.ew

sub-total

less 25%
sUb-total

To remove and replace all the parts mentioned above, knocking
and straighten up the necessary affected areas.

To spray painting on affected areas.

To install reverse sensors.

total

¥
6“*”*#’ 1,889.70

t__...-"
For O 86.20 |—
Sn 17590 | g
Ary 102.00 |[—
2.253.80
563.45
1 690.35
.?dr"s--(
500.00
580.00 | 727
420.00 éﬁ(/
3190.35
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