ek | R s [Fet 14020440 /yd 3l i
 aonge PITS ASSIGNMENT (Offics)
v ey Moo Chin _fet Detertine: 843 /114
Esti Cout: EHIRTS
OD{TE) WET'TI RES/ OD RES /EVA /INV | MV /¢S )
To Inspect Veliicle Nor: SGF Jec4< mmed: SHR 32232
at Workstop w/s Futdeeh Ando - T G346 5405 .
of | ketei Bukit-pve 6 & o1-4
" Foliey Nor_ cuito:__D144007266 MF#H
Sum nswged: ~ Paoem: TP
Mule of Velg: DOA 16/ lamq

{(CVenl's Hecord)
CA J REV | REP, | KRV 24 HRs l“‘P LD, Fndorement:

DateTiae: 9wy 14 /1114, Peron Contictad: L Vel (IO

Doate/Time Il!“:’j""""""ll“IT|!"|ll::l;l'h‘l Vb “_',/""'
SO st ;

HE 30932 ¢ IFCT [F00oF62 /T4 b B i &

2 S I’d&k}(_ﬁgm . ‘ ‘ e ——

et e | — e — o = W

5 I B
—_— .

f ——— | -




< aece) ASSIGNMEN| ;
e
Froui Dale Vi No S-(; 706[ Séﬁrﬂngn 2 .-"'é#’ O£
Eslimalad Coet: _ - B Tyl:-‘@ﬂ Cyclef Eual Van | Lorry I Tal | Prima Mover |
Truck | Trallar or j

o Zypte vach < 7

Color

ol Sp Readln T/Radie: Insured FSid TNI T NA
R N i 99‘5’«‘7/
e -—

A g .
Insured INNSLEL5 4 Engittc

Folieybo. CiNo
Cisims No T Gen. Cong:
Sum Inswred.  Ewcesst Shasring: I -
(tolient's Fecord) Brake: @ | )
Maka of Ve ’ Mead f __ B
e & 2b e i
(Policy Condition) R;
Rema: The veh had commanced Its NS | OF | | 8S/DUNTEXNGVATGY f FS I LIZA ) MIC FOHTSU | PIR T SUMI/
tepale 8t the time of inspection. A 1070 1 YOKO o 6 . C- T
Bal. or Mafhel Value & A Eron| Best
IDAC Accidant Rport Congistent? : Yes or No R/gsl _(."" mm - RBa -.("' e
GlA | PR Seen Consistent? - Yes ar No LiBs R = Ugsl ‘l:' o
Eel Repals: ?S;‘_ ;ﬁ Res. Yes ot No DOA !/ _.; i [/ :'I o0l p—ﬁ , é )!
Lty Sum: ZU_ % 3Val: Yes or No ‘Survey held ol -_—
CA | REV | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Demeges Fnrmrﬂﬁly/gmtmpm
. Vehice: INJOUT |
Date: _ PesonContacted: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Struclure med dise 10 oollision
“Daia I Tine | Action [ Insiruction é}ﬂr Sy 6o _ —
_uuty| 23 ;E'_..»-'.f’__'?-y.g -
|t 4 s o

2l Sias Etal ch@w_mﬂﬁn* JoEeE '_
1Y/ ;Zig_fl@é@ﬁw& A, (Re 1*2:.101 10, €2% J

DalaTirne, Fis Pagy )

Days Of Repalr. 1S 2bis = HH
] ) r—l: Final Reponrt Resurvey No.of Tripr 2= |Survey Fes IM&_

DsiaMrss. s Bvtinn s Tramgporac | — SH
_q\l_t:llj_"f\’ Flﬂ' Add Faa: ‘Sielnep 8 |Ir._-3-Frs_L,_s= 5N j’iﬁ_
! Intsrvisw [-“5__ M r-_h-,.l'; { ﬁ L

¥ ok Fobivinh ¢ Tish ln (= W W Y . amu
| '-lu\)\ |,1|:'] _ cug



YL 5
i A = e Lo

§1 UBTAVE 1, sl 25 PAYA U INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408911 TEL : ((65) 62563561 FAX : ((65) 62564315

Your Ref: D19007266MFSH Date: 26 Dec 2019
Our Ref: CS/FC119020440/Uvd3

The Motor Claims Department

MS Fisst Capital Insurance Ltd

Deas Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ SGF78548 .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 16/11/2019 at the premises of M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD. and have the

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8% 36207.70

Revised Estimate Amount ;S8 1506673

*Check” Items Amount : S8 - :

Market Value : S8 - .

LTA Reimbursement Value :S% -

Nett Value 158 .

Description of Damage: —

The vehicle sustained damages -

at the rear & front portion. o
offmde =2

Yours faithfully

CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser
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Tel (BS)6222 2011 Fax (65| 6227 3547

ILhesoms W i Ubdmrsitling Bapt: 35 Aobimzon Rosd W1E-01 Oty Wouse Singepore DG3ETT
Tek [£5) 6507 3848 Fax (%) £507 3845
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 18-11-2019 Our Ref No. D190072688MFSH
Accident Date 16-11-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHB32237 Third Party Vehicle, SGF78545
Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-46/48/50AUTOBAY
Contact Person. LINA
Contact No. 67485405/ 0 Fax No. 0
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: ACCIDENT NOT REPORTED:
Abgiciale LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 684168315
Contact Numbaer. A

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop FASTECH AUTO PTELTD Attention, NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge MERINA CHIA SAN SAN

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survay repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and T days for re-inspaction.
This is @ computer genaerated letier, no signature required

T p——




Yvonne Wuna !LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, December 26, 2019 8:05 PM

To: 'CWS Motar Claims’

Cc: ‘Merina Chia’; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007266MFSH/1
Attachments: SGF7854S DOA 16112019 REVERT pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SGF 78545
Date of survey : 19/11/2019
Number of days : 15 days

Thank you,

Best Regards;

¥ vonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-4561 | email: ywonneweongidkkauto.com | fax: ba5b-4315
Blk 51, Payva Ui Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933]

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2019 8:00 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007266MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 5GF78545 on 18/11/2019.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler



Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, November 21, 2019 8:00 PM

To: ‘CWS Motor Claims'

Cc: ‘Merina Chia'; SUR

Subject: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007266MFSH/1
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SGF78545 on 18/11/2019.

We are still pending estimate from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wang (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@ lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, November 19, 2019 9:01 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Merina Chia' <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com,sg>; SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007266MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-1072 | email: assignments@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paye Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



From: CWS Motor Claims [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 19 November 2019 8:47 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Merina Chia <MerinaChia@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007266MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




Used Toyota Wish Car for Sale in Singapore, Imperium Car Motor Pte Lud - sgCarMan

sGCARMART.COM

New Cars

Used Cars

Sedl My Car Directory

Price Range 1

@ Wish |8

Toyota Wish 1.8A (COE till 07/2026)

Dreeriiew Financial
___"“y_____m

o — &
U =/

Price 43,800

Depreciation $6,530 fyr

Mileage N.A,

Road Tax $1,264 fyr

Dereg Value $34,613 & of today {

COE £51,630

Engine Cap 1,794 o

Curts Weight 1,300 kg

Type of Vehicle My

Features

Original Condition

Accessories

Factory Fitted Intenar,

Description

Insurance  Accessories

Skmilar

Imperium Car Motor

Reg Date

Manufactured

Transmission

Power

No. of Owners

07-Aug-2006
(Byrs Bothe 13dayve COE jeft)

2006

Auto

$20,685

$22.754

7.0 kW [130 bhp)

Road Tax Paid Tl Aug 2020. Premiwm Grooming And Brand New Pairt Cost Provided. Bank And In Houss Full
Loan Avaitable. STA/Vicom Evaluation Weicome. Trade In Welcome. Kindly Contact Our Sales Advisor For Viewing

And Test Drve,

Category

Status
Availabls

Resources

o o

Car Valuation - Fres

Find out the market value of your existing car for free. |

Wehicle Evaluation

—rormmmre  Afraid of lemons? Raquest to have ths car evaluated profescionally

https://www.sgearmart.com/used _cars/info.php?lD=866920&DL=2804

Login  Sign up
Products Insurance Articles Forum
Deguecsation | | | > 10 year{| v |Vihice Type v W& submit
Resparch Photos Map

Page | of 2

Resources

| B e w7

Sajler Information

Derigsrinm Car Mobor Poe Lid

25 Eah| Bubkt Szad & 20149
Synergy O 08
Tel: 65572663

2 Mehdn Teo
Eugene Lim

LB el ]
27258

|8-Nov-19



Used Toyota Wish Car for Sale in Singapore, AA Trust Automotive - sgCarMart Page 1 of 2

SsGCARMART.COM

Login  Sign up

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Exclusive Year End Sale

wiih Frice Aange wl Degrecaation v ] > 10 year{ | | vehicle Type w! N submit i~

Toyota Wish 1.BA (COE till 05/2026)

Crverview Financtal Insurance Accessories Similar Research Photos Map

Depreciation $6, 780 fyr Reg Date O5-Mary-2006
(Byrs Smths 16days COE (eft)

Mileage N.A Manufactured 2006 I '
Road Tax £1,264 fyr Transmission Autoy
E A . - i‘!
Dereg Value $29, 751 as of today | ] oMy $19,355 ——
Engine Cap 1,794 ox Power 9.0 kW (130 bhp)

i
Curb Weight 1,300 kg No. of Owners 4

=

COE $46.048 ARF $11.291

——
Type of Vehicle .

B -
Features

16 Vabves WT-| DOHC Engine, Smooth Super 4 Speed ECT Steptronic Autn, Digral Auto Climate Control Arcon
fircam, ABS, T Sesters Saller Information

A Trust Avtomobive
Accessories sy X
Sports Rma Leather Seats, Upgraded Brake Kit, IWC Head Unit. Reverse Sensors. Solar Films. Knockdown Rear ﬁ
Selx

| W PROWSINS DEALER 2075w

Description ¥ 73 Mackenzie Road Lot 03/04/07/048
New Pamt Work! A& Trust Certified Vehicle! Extremely Well Masntasn By Previous Ownert Powerful Ang Mackenzie Uised Car Centre
Responsive Engime And Fusl Efficent! MPY With Ample Space For The Whola Familyl Highly Recommanded Tl G3450381

Populsr Family Car! Flexible Bank/1n House Loan Avasidable! Trade In Most Welcome! Hurry Sown Ta Our
Showroom Before Its Gone!

= Willey 165N
Cligrmamit FINE5036

Eﬂtﬂgn
hd Dawe AESO00%]

Status
Avallable

Respurces

m Yichicle Evaluation

A Afraid of lemons? Raguest to have this car svaluated professionally. |

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used _cars/info.php?ID=840917&DL=2726 18-Nov-19



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 723)

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SGF78545
Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended Deregistration Date: 20 Nov 2019
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: WISH 1.8 A
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2005

Engine No.: 1222485103
Chassis No.: ZNE100289208
Maximum Power Output: 97.0 kW (130 bhp)
Open Market Value: $19,849.00
Original Registration Date: 24 Apr 2006
First Registration Date: 24 Apr 2006
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $21,834.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited

PAREF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 23 Apr 2026
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $47.450.00
COE Rebate Amount: $30,486.00
Total Rebate Amount: $30,486.00

Page 1 of |

The information contained herein is correct as at 18 Nov 2019

OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _[D=F030... 18-Nov-19
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FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

| Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158  Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No : 20-0006262-D

venicteno: SGFT8LYS

aTy PARTICULAR

1PCS REAR WINDSCREEN A-T  s128850 ¥

1 PCS REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING J-H.. $128.70 =
1PCS TAILGATE Ve S Aedly 7> $1866.10.—
1PCS TAILGATE INNER LOCK ‘et $388.80
1PCS TAILGATE REAR LOGO qc s8N0
1PCS TAILGATE "WISH' EMBLEM 5 AME 88050 X
1PCS TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD WeC-/v Pefrrs  $84510,~
18ET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS A1 $50.00 ¥
1PCS TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP I 520950 —
1PCS TAILGATE OUTER CHROME MOULDING 7% 538820
2PCS TAILGATE DAMPERS ([@$350.00 -1 70000 )/
1PCS TAILGATE INNER HOLDER GARNISH 11 $45.00 X
1PCS REAR BUMPER £P2.20 PS sess30—
2PCS REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$10500 4d-IU rra  S210000PC
2PCS REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$68.50 (Aed $137.00 FC

1 8ET REAR BUMPER CLIPS Ak 85000
2PCS REAR BUMPER DAMPERS @355 60 Mckus  s11120 PC
1PCS REAR END PANEL Aedy P 869910
1PCS REAR END PANEL LOWER MEMEER (-'fi'ﬂ $211.50
1PCS REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH v 528860

2PCS TAILLAMPS @$458,10 wolf 1o M e na $91620 (@ ¢
2PCS TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @$455.10 $91020 19 o
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL (fu Jaf 3112010
1PCS REAR FLOOR PANEL TOPBOARD 9770 J{ $588.20

2PCS REAR FENDERS @$977.10 M b Gesiz 1Pe
2PCS REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @$805 10 Wf ara £1.210.20 ‘f’c.
1 SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS A4 $50.00 ¢
1PCS REAR EXHAUST Ap  STBBS0
2PCS REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS {$65.00 A4 §130.00%

1 PCS REAR EXHALST HEAT SHIELD 1 §211.10 7

1 PCS REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET & CARRIAGE  377-LD ANy 545050
1PCS REAR AIR VENT AT TR0
1 PCS BONNET At ¢ s678.10—
1 PCS BONNET INSULATOR Tin  S211.507

{ SET BOMNET INSULATOR CLIPS $50.00

1 PCS BONNET LOCK Lvf  $14550 7

1 PCS BONNET OUTER CHROME MOULDING (rA s15530.~"
2PCS HEADLAMPS @$689.10 ,‘/5 Ao »/5trr $137820
1PCS FRONT BUMPER OFL 0 7§ $BI00 —

1 PCS FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Aea” $26620~

1 PCS FRONT BUMPER SPONGE Then $168.50~"
2PCS FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$65.50 Aa  S131.00 3

1 SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS el §50.00—"
2PCS FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVERS @$68.00 P17 S136.00

1 PCS FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE “ $188.20 >

1 PCS FRONT GRILLE JQ’Z ﬁ $166.60



1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1 PCS
1PCS
1 PCS
2PCs
2PCS
2PCS

1'P'Hﬂf
1PCS
1PCS
1PCS
1 SET
1SET
1 80L

FRONT BRACE PANEL
FRONT SUPPORT PANEL
AIR CON CONDENSER

AR CON SUCTION HOSE
AIR CON DISCHARGE HOSE
RADIATOR

RADIATOR FAN MOTOR l Sz

RADIATOR FAN BLADE

RADIATOR FAN COWLING

HORN UNITS @5105.00

FHONT FENDERS @$650.10

FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELDS @515 10

SNETT

REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR
REAR END PANEL SEALANT

REAR FLOOR PANEL INSUALTOR
REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT
REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER
FRONT LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDR
RADIATOR COOLANT

LABOUR CHARGES:

TO CHECK WIRING

TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR REVERSE SENSOR
10 DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN

TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUSHION UPHOLSTREY
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHAUST

TO DISMANTLE & REFIX PETROL TANK

TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER

TO REFILL AIRCON GAS

TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING

LABDOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING

I 12150~

$668.10
Sl gy 29340

A7 $39550 *
1 saesi0 X

&p‘fﬂ{.ﬂ 4$1866.50 «

Y e

i s208.10"
Sve  szo00 X
H’ $ S s130020 (/G
| £380.20 X
$28,887.70

Cre $280.00 22

Akc. 55000 —

A $20000 (GO
JALe  $50.00 Ko
Aend 35000 Yo
$”Zy  $5000 .5
A€c 35000 3 o

$80.00 3 O
$80.00 ¢
$15000 [ 2 9
$100.00 4 7
£150.00 )
AN $100004
$100.00 £ O
A4 538000 X
515000 /90
sz0000/ S0
$2,800,00 L 'fﬂ 0

$2,500.00 |
TOTAL  $36.207.70 §09

N9
[Yuédy v
— — (e NIL

LKK Autp Consuilants hence not

- a~rrr-.:’..-l-|."f-.||1' Imbé ’



¥y L7L” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

o £1 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: B258 4015

Reg. No: 189607188R GST Reg. No. 18-8607198-R

lag Loda Ll PRI .

MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Rel - CS/FCI19020440/Uyd3n2

35 ROBINSON ROAD . ,

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877 Date - 06-01-2020 ”II'III[I'I"III
rnd Veh.  SHB 32237 Veh, Ipmd SGF 78548
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D1900T266MFSH Excess t‘] 0.00

Assign From MERINA CHIA Assign Date 18/11/2019

TOYOTA WISH (A)

Make & Model
Engine No. __ HIDDEN 2006
Chassis No,  ZNE100288208 Colour BLUE
Odometer 394084 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 GET 5 mm
L/H Front Tyre |205/55 R16 GST 5 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 GST 5 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |205/55 R16 GST & mm

18/11/2018
Survey held at FASTECH AUTO PTELTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY

AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS. WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uibi industnal Park, Singapare 408933
TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg. No: 18960T16BR GST Reg Mo, 18-8607 168-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO, SGF 78545

e e —

1|REAR WINDSCREEN NOT NECESSARY 1.288.50 .
1|REAR WINDSCREEN MOULDING NECESSARY 128.70 128.70
1|TAILGATE BADLY DENTED 1,866.10 1.248.10
1| TAILGATE INNER LOCK DENTED / JAMMED 38880 388.80
1|TAILGATE REAR LOGOD NECESSARY 68.10 68.10
1| TAILGATE "WISH" EMBLEM NOT FITTED 60.50 -
1|TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD DEFORMED / 84510 485.10
CRACKED
1|SET TAILGATE INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1| TAILGATE WEATHERSTRIP TWISTED 298.50 286.50
1| TAILGATE OUTER CHROME MOULDING BENT / CRACKED 388.20 388.20
2| TAILGATE DAMPERS @$350.00 NOT NECESSARY T00.00 .
1| TAILGATE INNER HOLDER GARNISH NOT NECESSARY 45,00 -
1|REAR BUMPER DISTORTED 665.30 492.30
2|REAR BUMPER REFLECTORS @$§105.00 N/S CRACKED 210,00 58.50
2|REAR BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @%68.50 N/S BENT 137.00 68.50
1]1SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
2|REAR BUMPER DAMPERS @%55.60 N/S BENT 11120 55.60
1|REAR END PANEL BADLY DENTED E98.10 699.10
1|REAR END PANEL LOWER MEMBER BADLY DENTED 211.50 21150
1|REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH TWISTED 288.60 288.60
2| TAILLAMPS @$458.10 N/S CRACKED 916.20 408.10
2| TAILLAMP HOUSING PANELS @$455.10 N/S DENTED 810.20 455.10
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL CRUMPLED / 1,12010 1,120.10
BUCKLED
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL TOP BOARD WARPED 588.20 499.10
2|REAR FENDERS @3977.10 N/S BADLY 1,854.20 977.10
DENTED
2|REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARDS @$605.10 N/S TORN 1.210.20 605.10
1|SET REAR FENDER INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
1|REAR EXHAUST NOT NECESSARY 788,50 -
2|REAR EXHAUST MOUNTINGS @365.00 NOT NECESSARY 130,00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020440/Uyd3n2
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REAR EXHAUST HEAT SHIELD
REAR SPARE TYRE BRACKET & CARRIAGE
REAR AIR VENT

BONNET

BONNET INSULATOR

SET BONNET INSULATOR CLIFS

BONNET LOCK

BONNET OUTER CHROME MOULDING
HEADLAMPS @$689.10

FRONT BUMPER
FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
FRONT BUMPER SPONGE

FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDERS @$65.50
SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS

FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP COVERS @$68.00
FRONT BUMPER CENTRE GRILLE

FRONT GRILLE

FRONT BRACE PANEL

FRONT SUPPORT PANEL

AIR CON CONDENSER

AIR CON SUCTION HOSE

AIR CON DISCHARGE HOSE

RADIATOR

RADIATOR FAN MOTOR

RADIATOR FAN BLADE

RADIATOR FAN COWLING

HORN UNITS @$105.00

FRONT FENDERS [@$650.10

FRONT FENDER INNERSHIELDS ﬂi'lﬂﬁ."lﬂ
LESS 25% DISCOUNT

NOT NECESSARY

BEROKEN

NOT NECESSARY
BUCKLED

TORN
NECESSARY
TWISTED
CRACKED

N/S BROKEN / O/S
CRACKED

DISTORTED

BENT

TORN

NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
BROKEN

TWISTED

BENT

BENT / PUNCTLURE
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
BENT / PUNCTURE
JAMMED

BENT

CRACKED
SERVICEABLE

N/S BUCKLED
NOT NECESSARY

Report Ref No. CS/FC1198020440/Uyd3n2

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industnial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL B25E 3581 FAX B258 4315

45050 399.50
121.00 -
678.10 B678.10
21150 211.50
50.00 50.00
14550 145.50
155.30 155.30
1,376.20 1,378.20
830.00 64510
266.20 266.20
166.50 166.50
131.00 =
50.00 50.00
136.00 -
188.20 -
166.60 166.60
121.50 121.50
688.10 6868.10
1.213.10 1.213.10
385.50 -
388.10 =
1,866.50 1.866.50
450.50 450.50
150.40 150.40
209,10 200,10
210.00 -
1.300.20 650.10
390.20 -
-4, 666,75

28.687.70 14.000.25




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubi Industnal Park, Singapons 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 258 4315
Reg. Mo 10960T188R GST Reg. Mo 19-0607198-R

1]SET REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR (SN) CRACKED 280,00 200.00
1|REAR END PANEL SEALANT (SN NECESSARY 50.00 50.00
1|REAR FLOOR PANEL INSULATOR (SN) NECESSARY 200,00 100.00
1|REAR WINDSCREEN SEALANT (SN) NECESSARY 50.00 40.00
1|SET REAR LICENCE PLATE W/HOLDER (SN) BENT 50,00 40.00
1|SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WIHOLDER [SN) BROKEN 50.00 40.00
1|B0OL RADIATOR COOLANT (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
730,00 500.00
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING, 80.00/ 30.00
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACING REAR REVERSE SENSOR. 80.00 50.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR WINDSCREEN 150.00 120,00
TO TRANSFER TAILGATE MECHANISM. 100.00 60.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX SEAT,CUHION UPHOLSTERY. 150.00 80.00
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX REAR EXHALST NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
TO DISMANTLE & REFIX PETROL TANK. 100.00 60.00
TO MOUNT VEHICLE ON CAR O-LINER. NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
TO REFILL AIRCON GAS, 150,00 100.00
TO SPRAY RUST PROOFING. 200.00 150.00
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING & REPLACING PARTS, 2,800.00 I.W.EDL
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. 2,500,00 1,800.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19020440/Uyd3n2
MARKET VALUE: 544,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $30,486.00=NETT VALUE: $13,514.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensod Appraiser

DESCLABER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Repert i made sobsly for the eee nd benedit of e Cllent named on the front pegs of this Bepan




