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51 UBTAVE 1, #801-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (M65) 62563561 FAX : (65) 62564515

Your Ref: D19007233MFSH Date: 22 Nov 2019

Our Ref: CS/FCI19020314/Kyd3

The Motor Claims Department
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd

Dear Sir/Madam,
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SHD287Z .
Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 18/11/2019 at the premises of M/s TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD. and
have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 18§ 26.966.53
Revised Estimate Amount : 5% 1.479.74
“Check” ltems Amount 1 5% -
Market Value 1 8% -
LTA Reimbursement Value ' 5% -
Nett Value : S8 -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages

at the o/s front. Il I i
—__ el )
Yours faithfully

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser



Ms ‘ FirstCa pita I M5 First Capital Insurance Limited corep Mo 1550001060 GAT Mg ko MZ-DO016FE-0

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore 048580
Tel (65} 6222 2311 Faw (656222 3547

Claim & Marpr Underwriting Dept: 36 Rodinson Aoad BLE-0L City House Singapore 0BEE77
Tel (65) 8507 3848 Fax (55) B30T 3845
wwiw . mafirsteapital comosg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

15-11-2018 Our Ref No. D18007233MFSH
09-11-2019 Claim Type. Third Party
SHE297D Third Party Vehicle. SHD287Z

NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
KEK ZHEWEI
62876668/ 0 Fax No. 62571330

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cec : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

TRANS-CAB AUTO
SERVICES FTELTD

MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

Attention. NIL

JOANNEY

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This iz a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Yvonne Wuna (LKK Auto)

From: Mg Wai ¥Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, November 22, 2019 4:28 PM

To: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan’

Subject: FW: VEHICLE NO: SHD287Z DOA: 09/11/2019 -- AAD1911-113
Attachments: SHD287Z ESTIMATE.pdf

Dear Yvonne
Amount confirmed $ 1,200 (before GST).

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg

TRAMS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
Mo, 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111

Tel: 6287 6666 Fax: 6287 7764

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto) [mailto:yvonnewong@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, 22 November, 2019 4:17 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: jasminetan@transcab.com.sg

Subject: VEHICLE NO: 5HD287Z DOA: 09/11,/2019

Hi Wai Yin

| check and confirm is L/S 51200.00 @ 1.5 days repair.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



Yvonne Wona (LKK Auto)

From: Yvonne Wong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, Movember 22, 2019 3:42 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims'

Cc Joanne Yong'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007233MFSH/
Attachments: SHD287Z DOA 09112019 REVERT.pdf

Dear Sir/ Madam

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SHD287Z
Date of survey : 18/11/2019
Number of days : 1.5 days

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: yvonnewong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, November 15, 2019 4:30 PM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joanne Yong' <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007233MFSH/1

Dear SirMidm,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: CWS Motor Claims [maElto'.i:wsmutur::Iaims@msfirstcapital.cnm.sgl

Sent: Friday, 15 November 2019 3:55 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg=; Joanne Yong <Joanneyong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007233MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com




> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Wehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

PGP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Message

Compary
BTEK

SHD287Z

Yes

13 Nov 201%

REMALLT

LATITUDE 2.0L DI AUTO DVAB 4DR
Red

2015
MPREBIFCO02735
VF1ABL1SALKC282201
127.0kW (170 bhp)
$19.998.00

04 Mar 2016

04 Mar 2014

0

$19,998.00

Yes
03 Mar 2024
$14,998.00

03 Mar 2024

A - Car up to 1600cc & F7kW [130bhp)
]

$39,633.00

$21,322.00

$34,320.00

Please note that the B-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upan COE expiry or when the vehicle

reaches Its statutory lifespan [if applicable), whichever is earlier.
The information contained herein is correct as at 13 Nov 2019

"



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 5697111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax No.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 287Z

BONNET HINGE RH
BONNET LOCK

BONNET CABLE
BONNET CABLE COVER
BOMMET SEAL OUTER
BONNET SEAL INNER
LOWER ARM RH L70Y
KNUCKLE ARM RH L70Y
ABSORBER FRT RH L70Y
DRIVESHAFT RH
STABILIZER BAR FRT
WIPER RESERVOIR MOTOR
WIPER RESERVOIR
WIPER RESERVOIR NECK

T N A T (S I (I S R e

Special Nett
1 BUMPER CLIP FRT
1 BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH
1 BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH
1 BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP
1SET  FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP
2 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMNEL NUT
2 FRAME FULL SUPPORT PAMEL 5TUD
1 WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH
1 FRONT RIGHT TYRE
1 FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM
1 FRONT RIGHT TYRE RiM COVER
1SET  Front licence plate with holder
1SET  RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW
1SET  RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP
6 BONNET INSULATOR CLIP L70Y
2 BONNET CABLE COVER SCREW L70Y

TOTAL
10%

AAD1911-113

M 23740
/T 152.80
fo 5520
[, 8060
Jo 8320
Ju, 70.10
fo 19270
S 48150
f. 20350
7 1,355.70
Po 42790
A 860
/< 179.60
S 2930

12,640.07
1,264.01

mﬂmwmmmmmmmmmmmmm

11,376.06

W oba B B A W0 LA Y bR BT B0 B B BB BB 5

M. 66.00
A 1200
AA 1050
n 5900
A~ 70.00
YA 2000
A 30,00
An 3050
£u 30000
Tis 380,00
fi. 5000
fv. go00
Ju 1600
Ap 5200
Aa 730
4 rs 10.85 J




Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. : 6287 6666 Fax Mo.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No. 2010196266

5HD 287Z

2 BONMET CABLE CLIP L70Y

TOTAL
TOTAL PARTS
LABOUR
Putty and spray painting of the affected portion.
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned.

Panel beating, knocking and straightening the
necessary portion, remove and renewal of parts,
adjust and realign the same

To rust-proofing of the affected areas.

To transfer of front fender fittings, attachment
and perform water seepage test.

To transfer of bonnet fittings, attachment and
perform water seepage test.

To check steering geometry and computer wheel
alignment

To dismantle and refit front end suspension,
undercarriage parts, final checking and testing.

To transfer of front bumper fittings, attachment
and perform water seepage test.

To transfer of tire, rim and on wheel balancing.

AAD1911-113

A 631 X

1,210.47

12,586.53

600000 ¥/

170,00 /xr/

6,000.00 2 ce/

~a

o

fea,

e ¥

17000 X

170.00 ,(

17000 X
22000 X
38000 ¥

17000 X

170.00 X



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd AAD1911-113
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111

Tel Mo, ; 6287 6666 Fax Mo, : 6257 1330

CO./GST Reg. No. 201019626G

SHD 2872

o remove and rehit intenor tittings, tnmings,
garnish, fittings and other, to enable repair. $ An. 38000 X

Labour charge to mount and dismount vehicle

on jig bench, to facilitate repair. % A 38000 X
TOTAL $% 14,380.00
Over All Total § ~ 26,966.53
LUMP SUM (REPAIR DAY) Jﬂ"ﬁ';\"S

/ ;/JZ 5/47_;



Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel No. ; 6287 6666 Fax Mo.: 6257 1330
CO./GST Reg. No, 201019626G

SHD 287Z

Vehicle No.:

Chassis No.:

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:

Date of Accident :
Third Party Insurer :
Date of Registration:

PART
BUMPER COVER FRT
BUMPER SPOILER FRT
BUMPER ABSORBER FRT
BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH
BUMPER SUPPORT FRT
BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT
BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT
BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH
BUMPER BEAM FRT
HEADLAMP RH
HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH
FENDER PANEL FRT RH
WHEELARCH FRT RH
FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH
FENDER BRACKET FRT RH
FEMDER INSULATOR RH
TOW COVER FRT
FRONT BRACE PANEL
RADIATOR GRILLE

RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME
FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL
FRAME FULL SUPPORT BRACKET
BOMMNET

BOMMET INSULATOR

BONNET STRUT RH

_l_l..._L_l_.l._'._l_t—l_l_l_l—l_l—l_l._&_l_n_n...l_l—l_l.—ld

RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE '‘RENAULT

AAD1911-113

/4/’7 /dﬁm:{_/

L, & 207/
SHD 287Z
VF1ABL15AUC282201
RENAULT
LATITUDE
9.11.19
FCIL
4/3/2016

LIST
s M 1470 «—
g fu. 34470 X
$ S, 39468 X
$ 237 10140
$ S, 1070
$ S, 29250
$ fo, 14700
5 fe. 20721
5 T 66370
$ S 74360
$ /T 12830
$ /T 437.10
$ fin 19140
$ i 1180
$ Ju, 106.40
g Jv, 6630
s Jn, 6090
3 T 177.22
§ Ju. 969.90
$ v, 22536
$ S~ 686.00
§ " 59270
$ A 4160
$ M 1,312.70
$ Je. 29430
$ 5330
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
59 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 35681 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo, 19-3807188-R Page No.:1 of 4
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SHD 2872
Qty Description of Parts Condition ?E::LT:::?;]} Our ﬁgj}“m
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BUMPER COVER FRT MTG CRACKED 747.20 747.20
1|BUMPER SPOILER FRT SERVICEABLE 344.70 -
1|BUMPFER ABSORBER FRT SERVICEABLE 394 68 -
1|BUMPER RETAINER FRT RH DISTORTED 101.40 101.40
1|BUMPER SUPPORT FRT SERVICEABLE 10.70 E
1|BUMPER UNDERTRAY FRT SERVICEABLE 292 50 4
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER FRT SERVICEABLE 147.00 =
1|BUMPER FOG LAMP GRILLE RH SERVICEABLE 207.21 -
1|BUMPER BEAM FRT TO REPAIR SEE 663.70 3
LABOUR
1| HEADLAMP RH SERVICEABLE 743 60
1|HEADLAMP PANEL FRT RH TO REPAIR SEE 128.30 .
LABOUR
1|FENDER PAMEL FRT RH TO REFAIR SEE 437.10 -
LABOUR
1|WHEELARCH FRT RH SERVICEABLE 191.40
1|FENDER BRACKET LOWER RH SERVICEABLE 11.80
1|FENDER BRACKET FRT RH SERVICEABLE 106.40 .
1|FENDER INSULATOR RH SERVICEABLE 66.30 -
1| TOW COVER FRT SERVICEABLE &60.90 -
1|FRONT BRACE PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 177.22 .
LABOUR
1|RADIATOR GRILLE SERVICEABLE Q59 90 -
1|RADIATOR GRILLE BADGE "RENAULT" SERVICEABLE 22536 :
1|RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME SERVICEABLE 686.00 -
1|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 582.70 -
LABOUR
1|FRAME FULL SUPFORT BRACKET TO REPAIR SEE 41.60 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET TO REPAIR SEE 1.312.70 -
LABOUR
1|BONNET INSULATOR SERVICEABLE 294 .30 &
1|BONNET STRUT RH SERVICEABLE 53.30 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020314/Kyd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 40B833
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Req. Mo, 19-0607158-R

Page Mo.2 of 4

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition |2 Chop {g]} ﬁj}

1|BONNET HINGE RH TO REPAIR SEE 237.40 -

LABOUR
1|BONNET LOCK TO REPAIR SEE 152.80 -

LABOUR
1|BONNET CABLE SERVICEABLE 56.20 ’
1|BONNET CABLE COVER SERVICEABLE 80.60 :
1|BONNET SEAL OUTER SERVICEABLE 83.20 .
1|BONNET SEAL INNER SERVICEABLE 70.10 .
1|LOWER ARM RH L70Y SERVICEABLE 192.70 .
1|KNUCKLE ARM RH L70Y SERVICEABLE 48150 -
1|ABSORBER FRT RH L70Y SERVICEABLE 203.50 :
1|DRIVESHAFT RH TO REPAIR SEE 1,355.70 .

LABOUR
1|STABILIZER BAR FRT SERVICEABLE 427.90 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR MOTOR SERVICEABLE 82.60 .
1|WIPER RESERVOIR SERVICEABLE 179,60 -
1|WIPER RESERVOIR NECK SERVICEABLE 29.30 -
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -1,264.01 84.86
11,376.06 763.74

SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BUMPER CLIP FRT (SN) NECESSARY 66.00 66.00
1|BUMPER BRACKET CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 12.00
1|BUMPER SUPPORT CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 10.50 ;
1|BUMPER GRILLE LOWER CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 69.00 :
1|SET FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 70.00 :
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL NUT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 20.00 :
2|FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL STUD (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.00

1|WHEELARCH CLIP FRT RH (SN) NOT NECESSARY 30.50 -
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE (SN) SERVICEABLE 300.00 -
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM (SN) SERVICEABLE 380.00 :
1|FRONT RIGHT TYRE RIM COVER (SN) SERVICEABLE 50.00 -
1|SET FRONT LICENCE PLATE WITH HOLDER (SN) SERVICEABLE 80.00 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE SCREW (SN) SERVICEABLE 16.00 -
1|SET RADIATOR GRILLE FRAME CLIP (SN) NOT NECESSARY 52.00 -

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19020314/Kyd3n2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
61 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapare 408333
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R Page No.3 of 4
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
C n
Qty Description of Parts onditio Workshop ($)) ($)
6|BOMNET INSULATOR CLIP L7DY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 7.30 -
2|BONNET CABLE COVER SCREW LT0Y (SN} NOT NECESSARY 10.85 =
2|BONMET CABLE CLIP LTOY (SN) NOT NECESSARY 6.31 -
1,210.46 66.00
LABOUR
PUTTY AMD SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED 6,000.00 440.00
PORTION.
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERMNED. 170.00 10.00
PANEL BEATING KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE 6,000.00 200.00
NECESSARY PORTIONM REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS,ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.INCLUSIVE OF
THE REFPAIR OF BUMPER BEAM FRT HEADLAMP PANEL
FRT RH,FENDER PANEL FRT RH,FRONT BRACE
PAMEL FRAME FULL SUPPORT PANEL FRAME FULL
SUPPORT BRACKET, BONNET BONNET HINGE
RH,EOMNET LOCK AND DRIVESHAFT RH.
TO RUST-PROOFING OF THE AFFECTED AREAS. NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT FENDER NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF BONNET FITTINGS ATTACHMENT AND|NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
PERFORM WATER SEEPAGE TEST.
TO CHECK STEERING GEOMETRY AND COMPUTER NOT NECESSARY 220.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT.
TO DISMANTLE AND REFIT FRONT END NOT NECESSARY 380.00 -
SUSPENSION,UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS FINAL
CHECKING AND TESTING.
TO TRANSFER OF FRONT BUMPER NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
FITTINGS,ATTACHMENT AND PERFORM WATER
SEEPAGE TEST.
TO TRANSFER OF TIRE,RIM AND ON WHEEL NOT NECESSARY 170.00 -
BALANCING,
TO REMOVE AND REFIT INTERIOR NOT NECESSARY 380.00
FITTINGS, TRIMINGS GARNISH,
FITTINGS AND OTHER,TO ENABLE REPAIR,
LABOUR CHARGE TO MOUNT AND DISMOUNT VEHICLE |NOT NECESSARY 380,00 -
ON JIG BENCH,TO FACILITATE REPAIR.
14,380.00 G50.00
GRAND TOTAL 26,966.52 1,479.74

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18020314/Kyd3n2




Page Mo:4 of 4

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

1,200.00

Report Ref Mo, CS/FCI19020314/Kyd3n2

y/éva

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client namad on the frond page of this Repen,

prin part. Any thied pany acting or replying on this



