Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: chewkeong@supreme.sg

Sent: Thursday, 4 June 2020 12:20 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: GY 6371A / DOA:  07/11/2019 FIRST CAPITAL
Attachments: GY 6371A.pdf

Dear Denise,

The vehicle had been repaired and we had finalised the amount with Kenneth.
Finalised COR Lump Sum $4,050.00, 5 days.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Chew Keong

Supreme Auto Service Pte Ltd
No0.176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-01 Singapore 575721
Tel: 97368619

Fax: 64517423

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 3 June 2020 2:06 pm

To: admin <admin@supreme.sg>

Subject: RE: GY 6371A / DOA: 07/11/2019 FIRST CAPITAL

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please update status of this vehicle

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 18 May 2020 4:06 PM

To: admin <admin@supreme.sg>

Subject: GY 6371A / DOA: 07/11/2019 FIRST CAPITAL

Dear Sir/Madam,

Please update status of this vehicle

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



