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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

M

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 31 May, 2017 10:06 AM

To: 'Chan, Kian-Chuan'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE: SFF9696E OUR REF: 17412004535G-001

Dear Kian Chuan,
The market value for SFF 9696E is $97K - $99K (EST) as at May 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 May, 2017 11:59 AM

To: 'Chan, Kian-Chuan' <Kian-Chuan.Chan@aig.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: MARKET VALUE: SFF9696E OUR REF: 17412004535G-001
Importance: High

Dear Kian Chuan,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Chan, Kian-Chuan [mailto:Kian-Chuan.Chan@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 26 May, 2017 11:51 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Alvin Yit
<alvinyit@fta.com.sg>; Claims <claims@fta.com.sg>; rogassociates@gmail.com




Subject: MARKET VALUE: SFF9696E OUR REF: 17412004535G-001
Importance: High

Hi,

Need help on this Market value, thanks !
Date of Loss : 19/5/17

Claim No : 17412004535G-001

Thanks.

Warmest Regards,

KC Chan

AlIG

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1945 | Fax +(65) 68357416
kian-chuan.chan@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Page 1 of 2

| Text size +

Owner ID Type:
Owner |D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:

Open Market Value:

Original Registration
Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC
02158 DOp 1q /_g//—";
SFF9696E

No

24 May 2017

JAGUAR

XF 2.2 14D AUTO ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR HID TC

Beige

2011

4005984224DT

SAJAC0663CDS35675

140.0 kW (187 bhp)

$54,583.00

20 Jan 2012

20 Jan 2012

o 4974744

$54,583.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes
19 Jan 2022

$38,208.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amaunt:

Total Rebate Amount:

19 Jan 2022

E - Open Category
10

$65,700.00
$30,571.00

$68,779.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 May 2017
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