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51 UBLAVE 1, #0125 PAYA UBTINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (I65) 62563561 FAX ; (065 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1905259/SYH

Our Ref: CS/SMO19020096/Aqf3

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Grace

Dear Sirs/Mdm

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO,

We thank you for the instruction on _13/11/2019.

Date: 24™ March 2020

Without Prejudice

SJOQ 8046H .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 13/11/2019 at the premises of M/s HUA MENG SPRAY and have the
following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : S§ 7.039.12

Revised Estimate Amount 8% 3.500.00 (Lump Sum}

“Check” Items Amount : S8 -

Market Value : S§ -

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% -

Nett Value : S$ -

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the .

front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.
Recommendation Davs of Repair: 4 days.

We have NOT authorize repair.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI
Licensed Appraiser




Nivitha (LKK Auto)
“

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 10:22 AM

To: SUR; assignments

Ce: Hua Meng; Henry, Irene James; Hwang, Shiang Yi

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OURREF:SJQ 8046 H D.O.A:11.11.2019

Our ref : CMTD1905259/SYH

Without Prejudice
Dear LKK Auto,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SJQ8046H on a without prejudice basis.

Best Regards

Melvin Ye

Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

, SOMPO
@ b A Century of Trust

INSURAN

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www . facebook com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

& Download on the h GETITON

Download now @ ‘ App Store or GOOQ?E PI’E’Y

YFor Travel, Personal Accident & Home Insurance | ? For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient. please delete this meassage

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your parsonal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf}. Please click here for
our Frivacy Policy

From: Hua Meng <huameng@Ilive.com.sg=>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November, 2019 9:32 AM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: PR5 - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: SJQ 8046 H D.O.A: 11.11.2019 Qur ref : CMTD1905259/SYH
Importance: High

Dear Melvin



We propose to choose LKK Auto Consultants to conduct pre-repair survey.

Thank You.

Regards,
Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
Tel: 67465519  Fax:6743 489%6

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, November 13, 2019 9:10 AM

To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Cc: Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: 5)Q 8046 H D.O.A: 11.11.2019 Qur ref : CMTD1905259/SYH

Our Reference : CMTD19052%9/5YH
Your Reference: SJQ8046H

Without Prejudice
Date: 13/11/2019

Attention:
HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP
Dear ling Yee,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING YP101L & 5JQ8046H ON 11.11.2019

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 12/11/2019.
Please be informed that Ms Hwang Shiang Yi is the handler of this case.

We regret to inform that we are unable to revert on liability for direct settlement as we have yet to receive our
insured’s accident report.

Kindly advise should you still require us to conduct survey on a “Without Prejudice” basis.
If you are agreeable to conduct survey on a “Without Prejudice” basis, we propose to use one of the motor

surveyors named in the attached list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as
Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong (North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)
Marcus Chua (East area)




Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
Jeffery Ong

4 | In House surveyor Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye
Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

i/ SOMPO A century of Trust

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase® via Sompo SG

" Download on the
Download now @ App Store o GO'%EPIBY

LEnr Travel Personal Accident & Home Insurance | 2 For Travel, Personal Accident, Home & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompa Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom
disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
aur Privacy Policy

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 November, 2019 3:05 PM
To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey @sompo.com.sg>




Subject: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: ¥P 101 L OUR REF: 5)C, 8046 H D.O.A: 11.11.2019
Importance: High

Dear Sir

Please refer to the attachment for your necessary action and revert your surveyor name list to us urgently.
Your promptly reply will be appreciated by us.

Thank You.

Regards,
Jing Yee
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
Tel : 6746 5519 Fax: 6743 4896



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March 2020 11:22 AM

To: *Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; SUR; assignments; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi'

Cc: ‘Henry, Irene James'

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF:5JQ 8046 H D.O.A:11.11.2019
Cur ref : CMTD1905259/5YH

Attachments: CS5M019020096Aqgf3.pdf

Dear Shiang Yi,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of 51Q B046H.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com=

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 3:16 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; assignments
<assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: 'Hua Meng' <huameng@live.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; "Hwang, Shiang i
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: 5)Q 8046 H D.0.A: 11.11.2019 Our ref : CMTD1905259/5YH

Dear Melvin,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJQ 8046H on 13/11/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #0z2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2015 11:02 AM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Hua Meng' <huameng@live.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi'
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: SJQ 8046 H D.0.A: 11.11.2019 Our ref : CMTD1905259/5YH

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 316 PM

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; SUR; assignments

Cc: ‘Hua Meng'; 'Henry, Irene James’; "Hwang, Shiang Y1’

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: 5)Q 8046 H D.0.A: 11.11.2019

Our ref : CMTD1905259/5YH

Dear Melvin,
please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle 51Q 8046H on 13/11/2019.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Uhbi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 13 November 2019 11:02 AN

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Hua Meng' <huameng@Ilive.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.cOM.5g=; 'Hwang, Shiang Yi'
<shiangyi.hwang@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PRS - SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: 5)Q 8046 H D.0.A: 11.11.2015 Our ref : CMTD1905259/5YH

Dear Sir/Madam,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>
Sent: Wednesday, 13 November, 2019 10:22 AM
To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; Hwang, Shiang Yi

<shiangyi.hwang @s0mpo.com.sg>
Subject: RE: PRS- SOMPO INSURED: YP 101 L OUR REF: 5JQ 8046 H D.0.A: 11.11.2019 Our ref : CMTD1905253/5YH

Without Prejudice

Dear LKK Auto,
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Lancer Any Ay 2009 Ay vy fay Avallable

[[] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.6M GLX $42,800 $4,660 fyr 14-Jar-2009 1,584 cc - Sedan Available
{COE till 01/2029)

Carsigrmment Unit, Warranty Wil Be Given To Next Buyer. Newly Overhaul Engine, Brand New Outch, Full Set Approved Drift Racing
Exhaust With Cest, Front Evod 2 Pot Brake Kit. Greddy Full Aluminum Radiator, DT Sports Coilover. Short Shifter, hothing Spared For Ne

[7] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.6M GLX $26.566 $6,390 fyr 16-Jan-200% 1,584 2 ~ Sedan Available
(COE till 01/2024)

Price Reduce By 14/02, New 5 Years COE, Mew Tax Till Jan 2020, New Tyres, Just Done Camputerize Wheal Alignment, 1 Owner,

Lambarghini Orange Metallic Gold Colour, With Full Set OF Bodykits, Just Overhauled Engine 100% One Year Ago, Including New Timing... T

[[] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.64 GLX $35, 888 36,180 fyr 21-Jan-200% 1,584 oo 64,000 km Sedan Available

Sports {COE Lill 01/2024)

Fully Serviced By Cycle & Carriage, High Loans Availatia, 100% Accident Free. Well Maintained. Bank Loan And In House Loan Avallable,
Low Monthty Instaliment, Trade In Weloome. View Now To Believe Tt) | e a0 ]

Monster Mators Pe Lid

] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.6M GLX $39,600 44,290 fyr 04-Feb-2008 1,584 e 120,000 km Sedan Available
{COE till 02/2029)

Goad Condition Engine. Reguiarly Malntained. Low Mileage. Good Condition Interios, Welcome To View., Foinior camnin §

Is your COE expiring? Let us help you renaw it!

Gatting your COE renewed is easy, fast and affardabile, Well help you renew your COE and get a loan for it, Get the cheapest loan in town and an
appraval In 2 days without effort! Enguire today.

D Mitsubishi Lancer 1.6M GLX 549,800 §5,380 fyr 12-Feb-2009 1,584 o 197,000 km Sedan Avallable
(COE till 02/2029)
Nice Car With Some Very Delicious Mods! Just Renewed 10Years COE On 02/3019. Carefully Taken Care Since Day One, Under Usage, No
Repairs Nesded, STA Evaluation Welcome, Loan Available, Bark Or In Howse Loan, Maintained Regularly, Refurbished Til Leok And Feel...
Car Search
1
[[] Mitsubishi Lancer 1,64 GLX $41,888 $4,510 fyr 25-Feb-2009 1,584 cx 171,000 lkm Sedan Available
Sports (COE till 02/2029)
Criginal Good Condition, Cheapest 10 Years COE Car Renewable, Low Depreciation Car, Loan Can Be Arranged. P onicr comen §
[[] Mitsubishi Lancer EX 1.54 GLX = $34,800 $8,010 fyr 17-Mar-2009 1,499 cc 145,000 km Sedan Availatile

(COE till 03/2024)
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BOR TR HERTORT

Just Arrreed! Well Maintained By Prewious Cwner! High Loan With High Trade In fwailable, Price Negotiable, Call Now Or Visit Our
Shavracem Todzy.

¥ mibcbiahi e, Mitsublsh] Larcor, mitshithi ancer, Mitsubisni

[[] Mitsubishi Lancer EX 1,54 GLX ~ $4LE00 $4,570 fyr 24-Mar-2009 1,499 ce 127,700 km Sedan
Sports (COE till 03/2029)

Mew Arrivall Cheagest In Town! [Low Depreciation OF §k+ Per Annum Cniyl] Black On Black! 3 Cwners Only! Very Mint Condition!
Intericr And Extesiar Looks Lika New! Mew 2K Paintwork! 4 Mew Tyres! Pawerful And Responsive Enginel Perfect Gearbax! Fuel Efficientl...

[[] Mitsubishi Lancer EX 1.5A GLX =~ $27,000 $6,050 jyr 29-Apr-2009 1,499 cc 132,450 km Sedan
{COE till 04/2024)

$27000 » 48 Months, Tratallment From $330 Only, Lowest Interest Rates From 2,96% Only. Popular Mid Side Sedan Of Mitsubishi,
Spacious Cabin With Huge Rear Boot, Flexibla Loan, Bank Loan, In House Loan, Trade In Are Mast Welcome, Call For More Information...

Auto Inn

[7] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.64 {COE $30,800 $5,300 fyr T1-May-2009 1,584 oo - Sadan
till B4,/ 2024)

Low Maintenance Sporty Car. Loud LTA Friendly Exhaust. Big GT Wing For The Downforce During Corners. Meost Wear And Tear Replaced.
High Loan Avallaole, High Trade In Welcomne, Conslgnment Unit. Call To Arrange For Viewing.

38 Karz Station LLP

Insurance renewal at cheaper price!

Wu'lﬁndwwﬂe:haapﬁtmrInsuramuquol:l.ﬁwMlﬂmmmmunmmmmmwtdmmump.ﬂemmmdw

coméont of your own home, Roadside assistance & claims suppornt completely free.

Find out mong!

[] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.6A GLX $23,500 $5,260 fyr 9-May-200% 1,584 oc 110,000 km Sadan
Sports (COE till 04/2024)

Will Provide New Palntwark, Don't Miss! Cheapest, In Town! Low Fuel Consumption! Very Well Maintained! New Road Tax! Price S2ill Can
Wegotiate, Please Call Before Viewing, Flexible Loan Availablel Low Monthly Instaliment,! Trade In Wekome,

Car Search

u Mitsubizhi Lancer EX 1.5A GLS 533,800 $7.360 fyr 11=Jun-2009 1,49% cc 103,000 ke Sadan
{COE till 06/ 2024)

Erand Hew Bodykit And Paintwork. Fantastic Candition, View To Believe. High Loan Available. Hurry Contact Us To Arrange A iewing And
Test Drive.

Monster Motors Pre Lud

[ mitsubishi Lancer EX 1.54 GLX ~ $27,500 $6,250 fyr 19-Jun-2009 1,499 o 5 Setlan
(COE till 04/2024)

Sporty Gresy, One Owner Only, Low Maintenance Cost, Very Well Maintained, Easy Financing, Fliexible In-House Loan Packages Avaslabla.
Prirma Motar & Leaging

D Mitsubishi Lancer EX 1.5A GLX $33,800 56,750 fyr 19=Jun-200% 1,499 e 104,388 km Sedan
(Mew 5-yr COE)

Paowerful & Fuel Efficent Driviel 2 Owners Una, Low Mileage, Car's In Fantastic Condition| 100% Accident Free! Cheapest In The Market 1
Lewest Depeeciation Guaranteed) Full/High Loans Available, Trade In Weltome. Call/Whatsapp Now To Arrange A Viewing! Altractive De...

Morgter Motors Pie Lid

[:I Mitsubishi Lancer EX 1.5A GLS ~ $34,800 $7,470 fyr 10-Ju-2009 1,499 cc 107,000 km Saedan
Sports (COE till 07/2024)

Wonderful Setup And Fuel Efficent! 1 Year Extended Engine And Gearbox Warranty! Attractive Interest Rate Avallable! Optional For 10
Years COE Renewall Engine And Gearbox (Great), Exterior (Great), Interior (Great), Undercarriage (Great). All Model Trade In Welome....

Taigs: 2009 Mitwibisy Lante, 2000 mitmdichi farcer; Mibaois) wour, matmubishi lancer, MiEeSs
o reet I
[] Mitsubishi Lancer 1.64 GLX 524,800 §5,310 fyr 15-Jul-200% 1,584 cc 125,000 krn Sedan
Sports (COE till 07/2024)

100% Loan Avallabie, After You Make Seme Comparison OF The Prices And Deprecition Of Most Lancer, Youll Find That This Lancer s o
Low Depreciation nd Has The Best Value For Your Money. Owned By Executive Cwhner Selling Due To Upgeading, This Unk Had Served...

SmartiCars Boutique Fe Lid
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Owner 1D Type:
COwner ID:

Singapore NRIC
993l

Wehicle Mo

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour;
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis Mo.:

M aximum Power Output:
Cpen Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date;
Transfer Count;

Actual ARF Paid:

5J0B045H

Yes

13 Nov 201%
MITSUBISHI

LANCER 2.0L MIVEC GT 5M/T
Grey

2008

4B11BX1353
JMYSHCY4ABUOO1137
114.0 kW (152 bhp)
$19,1485.00

27 May 2009

27 May 2009

2

$1%,165.00

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Forfeited

$0.00

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE PeriodiYears)
PQP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:

31 Jan 2024

B -Car {1601cc & above)
5

$15,668.00

$13,208.00

$13,208.00

Please note that the S-yvear COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the

vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicablel, whichever is earlier,
The information contained herein Is correct as at 13 Nowv 2019

OK
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Sketch Plan #4 Pg. 1

wWem LETTER OF UNDERTAKING

[/'\We, Kamerei B Sorif _ the owner of vehicle no. Slanaé H

My/Our Insurance is under M/s AXA Insurance Pte Ltd , I/we shall decide whether to
claim under my/our Policy or against the Third Party and if the former shall submit
such a claim to M/s AXA Insurance Pie Ltd with all relevant facts and documents
within 14(fourteen) days of occurrence or discovery of damage.

My/Our Third Party claim is handle by my/our preferred waorkshop,
Hua Menn gpm{p‘ Pr:uwl.'lhq Wik s i'DF
= T | o

Signed and Acknowledge by:

Nric no. & signature of policyholder Company stamp Date

Prge & of 14



HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883
Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896

ESTIMATE
KAMEREI BIN SARIF Date :20.11.2019
BLK 470 PASIR RIS DRIVE &6 Vehicle No :5]Q 8046 H
#02-452 Make/Model :MIRSUBISHI LANCER
5510470 Accident date :11.11.2019
No DESCRIPTION Qty Amount (55)
List Items _
1 Front bonnet A 1 S 1880 7 oo
2 Front bonnet hinges @ $59.40 ; 2 5 1188~
3 Front bumper 1o,/ 1 S 891
4 Front bumper side holder @ $33.00 '~ P S BE -
5 Front bumper top rubber S Lig0 1 5 290 X
6 Front RH headlamp (! \ 1 $ 11396
7 Front RH fender T p i { ( i 1 S 496 .-
8 Front RH fender signal lamp . 7] 1 S 407
9 Front RH fender inner shield P 1 5 105
To A 5 4686.8
Less 20% Disc S 937.36
Total 5  3749.44
Special Nett ltems
1 Front bumper clips (1 set) pi- S 66
2 Front RH fender inner shield clips (1 set) o 7 S 55 X
Total s 121 B
Labour Cost
1 Remove ,replace & repair consistent to the accident S 1300 o0
2 Respray painting 20 S 1200 B0
3 Tuff kote ' S 100 *~
i 90 Total S 2600
) Grand Total $  6470.44

————




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo 18-9607198-R

Affiliatad to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

50 RAFFLES PLACE

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Ref : CS/SMO12020096/A0f3n2

[N

#05-01/06 Date : 26-03-2020
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
1: Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. ¥P 101L Veh. Inspected SJQ BO4EH
Policy Mo. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD190525%/5YH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  MELVIN YE YONG KANG Assign Date 13/11/2019
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MITSUBISHI LANCER c.c 1998
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No. JMYSHNCY4A8U001137 Colour GREY
Odometer 121288 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 HABILEAD 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 HABILEAD & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 HABILEAD G mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 HABILEAD & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date _11/11/2019 [Inspection Date 13/11/2019
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON ASWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BjIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

]ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 4 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uibi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Reg. No: 183607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJQ 8046H
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|FRONT BONNET HINGES @3$59.40 NOT MECESSARY 118.80 -
1|FRONT BUMPER TORN 891.00 B91.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @$33.00 MNECESSARY 66.00 66.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOP RUBBER NOT NECESSARY 29.70 -
1|FRONT RH HEADLAMP CuT 1,139.60 1,139.60
1|FRONT RH FEMDER DENTED 496.00 496.00
1|FRONT RH FENDER SIGNAL LAMP NOT NECESSARY 40.70 -
1|FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD NOT NECESSARY 105.00 =
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -288.68 -259.26
2,598.12 2333.34
1|FRONT BONMET (SN) DENTED 1,800.00 800.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -180.00 -
1,620.00 900.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1{SET FRONT BUMPER CLIPS (SN) MECESSARY 66.00 30.00
1|SET FRONT RH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS (SN) NOT NECESSARY 556.00 -
121.00 30.00
LABOUR
REMOVE REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE 1,300.00 500.00
ACCIDENT.
RESPRAY PAINTING. 1,200.00 600.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
WIRING. 100.00 30.00
2,700.00 1,130.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,039.12 4,393.34

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19020096/Agfan2
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Page No.:2 of 2

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 3,500.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SM0O19020096/Agf3n2

V. % \g‘
ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOEAMIRTE AMSAE-A,M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:. This Report is made salaly for the uss and banafit of the Client named on the frant page of this Report.




