4/30/2020 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAuto) - Outlook

[REMINDER] Re: LOD; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SG5574R AND SLK8045T ON 28.10.2018
ALONG JUNCTION OF BEDOK AVE 3 / BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD *** LKK REF:
CC3/AIG19020059/Qea3

Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>
Thu 4/30/2020 9:10 AM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>
Cc: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalqishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck (Auto
Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims 8 IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Hi Sir,
We refer to the email dated 19/12/19.

Please like furnish us with the video footage in order to process.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, December 19, 2019 4:30 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & |A/Buses)
<ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Cc: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck
(Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SG5574R AND SLK8045T ON 28.10.2018 ALONG JUNCTION OF BEDOK AVE 3 /
BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19020059/Qea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Karen,

We refer to the above matter.

Our principal would like to request for a copy of the video footage to review on the liability.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@]lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 2:27 PM

To: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>; Asher Sng
(LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck
(Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SG5574R AND SLK8045T ON 28.10.2018 ALONG JUNCTION OF BEDOK AVE 3 /
BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG19020059/Qea3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Asher,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@]kkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Karen Chan Siau Chin (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <ChanSiauChin@smrt.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 December, 2019 11:28 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Balgish Binte Abdul Halil (Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <BalgishBAH@smrt.com.sg>; Tan Wei Teck
(Auto Svcs/Claims & IA/Claims & IA/Buses) <TanWeiTeck@smrt.com.sg>

Subject: LOD; ACCIDENT INVOLVING SG5574R AND SLK8045T ON 28.10.2018 ALONG JUNCTION OF BEDOK AVE 3 /
BEDOK RESERVOIR ROAD

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sirs,

We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SG5574R.
Your client's negligent driving has caused the above accident.
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As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,

Cost of Repair $697.00
Loss of Use ( 2 days x $350.00 day) $700.00
LTA search fee $7.00
Total $1,4.04.00

We enclose the following documents,

1) 1) Repair Invoice
2) 2) GIA Report
3) LTA search

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email.
Payment by cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.

Thanks & Regards,
Karen Chan

Claims Department
Tel: 6556 3523

Thanks & Regards,
Karen Chan

Claims Department
Tel: 6556 3523
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