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Junice Lee (LKKAuto)
m

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 April, 2017 6:11 PM

To: KHOR Saw Theng

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E AUTO YEAR 2007
Dear Saw Theng,

Resend

The market value for SGX 4407A is $7,500 - $8,000 (EST) as at April 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 April, 2017 10:18 AM

To: KHOR Saw Theng <sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E AUTO YEAR 2007

Dear Saw Theng,

The market value for SGX 4407A is $7,500 - $8,000 as at April 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 April, 2017 4:16 PM

To: KHOR Saw Theng <sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E AUTO YEAR 2007

Dear Saw Theng,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Janice,




Jaitice Lee (LKKAuto)
B = . = = . | ]

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 April, 2017 4:16 PM

To: KHOR Saw Theng; SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E AUTO YEAR 2007
Dear Saw Theng,

Thank you for the email.

Dear Janice,

Please kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KHOR Saw Theng [mailto:sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 21 April, 2017 4:12 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: MARKET VALUE FOR TOYOTA VIOS 1.5E AUTO YEAR 2007

Hi Veron

As spoken, please help to check MV for this vehicle-SGX4407A (S7766043G)

Thanks.

Regards

Khor Saw Theng (Ms) | Assistant Manager, Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No: 1800 880 4888

redefining /insurance




4/21/2017 PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Text size + -

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 6043G

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SGX4407A

Vehicle to be Exported: No

Intended De-registration

Date: 21 Apr 2017

Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: VIOS E AUTO
Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2007

Engine No.: 1NZX601118

Chassis No.: MRO53HY9305019467

Maximum Power Qutput:  80.0 kW (107 bhp)
Open Market Value: $12,607.00
Original Registration Date: 24 Aug 2007
First Registration Date: 24 Aug 2007
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $13,868.00

OPC Cash Rebate Details

OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility:No

OPC Cash Rebate Eligibility _
Expiry Date:

OPC Cash Rebate Amount: -
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 23 Aug 2017 D
PARF Rebate Amount: $6,934.00 (, SID % P & 8‘9
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: i_S_A;@__Z_QlL

COE Category: E - Open Category
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $2,510.00

COE Rebate Amount: $0.00

Total Rebate Amount: $6,934.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 21 Apr 2017
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