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@ @ CYCLE & CARRIAGE FRANCE PTE. LIMITED %A\
' PANDAN GARDENS CUSTOMER SERVICE CENTRE

CYCLE & CARRIAGE 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339 Tel: (65) 6568 4501 Fax: (65) 6565 1240 CITROEN

Company Reg No. 200609327M

ESTIMATE ST Reg No, MR-8500111-X
Invoice Name &Address. . ... .. & > OwnerName&Vehiclelnfo =~
7h Cust No/Name /Sun Zhuoran
Sun Zhworgh RegNoRegDate  SLB65530  / 18/04/2016
BLK 1198 KIM TIAN-RD Date In/Mileage / 0
#14-232 “ ol
STRAMsere AaoNso Chassis No .. VF73DBHZTFJ863149
Engine No 10JBHD3027713
ContactNo  Mobile: 97659601 Make/Model CIT/CAP 1.6 BLUEHDI EATG SEDUCTION
Colour/Trim WPP / 8MF
Account No Terms. .~ Dale/TimePrinted .+ "7/ /CSE: . "/ Operator ="/ s WIP:No
CSM00073 Cash  09/11/2019/ 12:50 QUK 282 / Kevin Leong 14910
ik  Description of Goods / Services ¢ 0T o Q. UnitPrice Disc% . Amount
E PNTB8000 1200.00
TO REPAIR ON REAR BUMPER & AFFECTED AREA
E PNT98000 420,00
PAINT WORK ON REAR BUMPER
£ PNT88000 150.00
TO REMOVE & INSTALL REAR PARKING ASSIST
M SUNDRY 80.00
TO APPLY BODY SEALANT
M SUNDRY 80.00
PERFORM RUST PREVENTION

M SUNDRY 80.00

TO TRANSFER REAR RH RIM INCLUDING—BALANC ]

A WHEELALIGNMENTBP 240.00
To Conduct Computerize Full Wi ig

A 54900099 80.00

CHECK ELECTRICAL SYSTEM

A 10028901 240.00
TO CARRY OUT DIAGNOSTIC CHECK USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST
USING HI-SCAN PRO TEST

M SUNDRY 50.00
SUNDRIES

M ALLOY WHEEL 6.5 J16 CH5-47 1.00 588.00 0.00 588.00
Confirm & accepted by Parts 588.00
Labour 2,330.00

Standard Menu 0.00

Specialist Job 0.00

) Diagnostics Job 0.00

Authotized sianat nd " ! Sundry/Others 290.00
N804 compmy HaTD Total (W/o GST) 3,208.00

Validity of this estimate 15 14 days from date of quote. This is a p generated d no sig e i3 required.

Estizated costs quoted are excluding GST. We would wentfon that the above estimate {s based on our fnitial {nspection and does mot Ymclude any additional parts or labour which may be
required after repair work has commenced, Occasfonally worn or dassged parts are discovered after work has started and needed for repairs or replacesent. However, should this eccur,
we would advise you. Please be informed that a deposit of 50% of the ahove estimate {s payable before commencement of the work, Payment for this may be made 1n cash, credit card or
cheque. You must also agree to pay full amount for renewal of the windscreen in the event of imadvertent breakage in the course of renewing the rubber seal or other repair requiring
the resoval of the windscreen.
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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 5:29 PM

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit; 'sur@Ilkkauto.com’; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Manivel Priyadarshini

Subject: RE; TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019
Attachments: [Untitled].pdf

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Please conduct a survey on TP vehicle SLB6553D and let us have your report urgently.
This claim will be handled by Ms Priya.
*Kindly upload this survey request email to merimen.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

o INDIA
® ¥) INTERNATIONAL

lNSURANCE
SINGAPORE
Serving the reglon since 1967
64 Cecil Street; #05 - 0B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit [mailto:kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: 11 November, 2019 1:56 PM

To: Motor Claim - lll <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019

Dear All,

e We choose LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Thank You & Best regards
Kevin Leong

Claim Division Operations . (
209 Pandan Gardens C,m((&/ \L[A\)\ \*‘d

Singapore 609339
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CYCLE & CARRIAGE 1 =/
Exceptional Journeys !

Cycle & Carriage Singapore * 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4501 « F: +65 6565 1240 » H: +65 81680997 « www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

; A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

From: Motor Claim - Il [mailto:motorclaim @iii.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 1:34 PM

To: Kevin Leong Wai Kit

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019

This email was sent from outside of your organisation
Dear Sir / Mdm,

We acknowledge receipt of your email.

We proprose using one of the following motor surveyors:

e LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
e Vicom Assessment Centre Pte Ltd

Please notify us within 02 days of receipt of this letter for surveyor agreed on or if you have any objections to the
above list.

Best Regards,
Gabriel Wee

' [N DIA
=) (] lNTERNATlONAL

INsurRANCE
SINGAPrPORTE
Serving the region since 1987
64 Cecil Street; #05 - |0B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6100, Ext — 248

From: Kevin Leong Wai Kit [mailto:kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg]

Sent: 11 November, 2019 12:06 PM

To: Motor Claim - Il <motorclaim@iii.com.sg>

Cc: Don Bong Kiong Hua <kionghua.bong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Edwin Abcede Caina
<edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Andre Chow En De
<andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019

Dear All,

Our Client : SLB6553D vs your insured : SHA2025R



Above attach SAS report and repair quotation for your reference.

Please let us have the liability.

Thank You & Best regards

Kevin Leong
Claim Division Operations
209 Pandan Gardens

Singapore 609339
@ @ ‘ CELEBRATING
I
CYCLE & CARRIAGE 1 @mns
Exceptional Journeys

Cycle & Carriage Singapore « 209 Pandan Gardens, Singapore 609339
T: +65 6568 4501 « F: +65 6565 1240 « H: +65 81680997 » www.cyclecarriage.com.sg

& A member of the Jardine Cycle & Carriage Group

DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use o.f the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the mtendf:d
recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachmept 1s
strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify us immediately by return ema{l and
destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of the individual sender, and not necessarily
the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its related corporations.

Kindly note that by submitting this claim to us, you are deemed to have agreed to us collecting, using,
disclosing and processing your personal data, sharing your personal data with our service providers (located
both inside and outside Singapore) and/or with other insurers in the general insurance industry, including
the General Insurance Association of Singapore. This enables us to ensure proper processing, handling
and/or dealing with your claim, which includes investigating the said claim, and complying with applicable
laws. If you do not agree to the same, kindly let us know immediately.

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



CeCilia Chong (LKK AUto) —— —_—————————

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 4:11 PM
To: ‘Coco Lu Ting'
Subject: RE: TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your ref: SLB 6553D
Our Ref: CC4/11119020039/gb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLB 6553D AND SHA 2025R ON 05/11/2019
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option but
to submit our report to our principal for closure.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

13 74 7dE
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Save the Earth- Frint only when necessary-

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 19 February 2020 1:51 PM

To: Coco Lu Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TP CLAIM : SLB6553D AGAINST YOUR INSURED : SHA2025R DOA : 05.11.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Coco,



