
PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST – SLZ1385D vs SCY7808Z (OI) on D.O.A.: 23/09/2019
From: Hor, Yinrul
To: 'assignments@lkkauto.com', Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com)
Cc: Fong, Andy-SY, Fan, Winnie-LW, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Shi, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur, Parthiban, Theerthan, Subramaniam, Div
Sent: 11/12/2019 8:40:34 AM
Attachments: PRS 1385 SCY7808Z.pdf

Hi,
 
Please refer to the enclosed request from Team AutoPro Pte Ltd.
Kindly carry out Policy coverage verification first before conducting the pre-repair inspection within 48 hours
 
If you have any queries/concerns, please let us know.
 
Thanks & Regards,
 
Hor Yin Rul (Viviane)
AIG
FNOL Adjuster I
Singapore FNOL | Claims Operations – Auto
 
Tel: 8001206556 | Ext: 1002208
Yinrul.Hor@aig.com | www.aig.sg
 
 
 
From: TeamAutoPro North [mailto:teamautopl@gmail.com] 
Sent: Monday, November 11, 2019 4:29 PM
To: Chan, Yoke Shi; Chin, Lee-Ying; Fong, Andy-SY; Kaur, Baljit; Lim, Sheng Yang; Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa; Supramaniam, Darshene; Tan, Lily (AIG); Hor, Yinrul
Subject: [EXTERNAL] 2 Days Notice: SLZ 1385 D (Our Ref) and SCY 7808 Z (Your Ref) Dated 23rd September 2019
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SLZ 1385 D (Our Ref) and SCY 7808 Z (Your Ref)
Dated 23rd September 2019, Time around  08:30HRS
@ ALONG TELOK BLANGAH ROAD
 

We represent our client; MKM CAR LEASING PTE LTD, to no�fy you of the aforesaid road traffic accident involving our client‘s vehicle registra�on number: SLZ 1385 D and your
insured’s vehicle registra�on number SCY 7808 Z.  
 
Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.
 
For efficiency purpose, we are agreeable with the appointment of  Mr Lim -LKK   as the SJE for subject claim.   Please let us know within 2 working days from today your agreeing to
the above otherwise kindly send us your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following personnel:-
 
 
Contact
Person Eric Lee 8269 9999
 
Email
Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey
Address 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14   Singapore 575722  
 
 
 
-- 
*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages
and consequential loss in relation to his personal injuries.*
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------
Cheers,
Peach
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955
Fax: 6258 1956
 
(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or
other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American
International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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