Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 21 November, 2019 1:53 PM

To: Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU4658Y /SDL3212A AND SHA6791K on 10/11/2019 -
LKK REF CC3/AIG19019937/Eha3

Attachments: img-Y21103458.pdf; SJU4658Y-10NOV2019.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Ms Jenny,
We refer to your below email and the contents were duly noted.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

Save the ELarth- Print only whenr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Wahhong motors & credit pte Itd [mailto:motor@wahhong.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 21 November, 2019 1:43 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJU4658Y /SDL3212A AND SHA6791K on 10/11/2019
Hi Vic,

Good day to you.

With reference on the letter dated 14/11/2019, Your Ref:
CC3/A1G19019937/ha3

We are representing our client AMA Rental Pte Ltd, Vehicle number SJU4658Y.

Please be informed that our client is claiming against 3rd party SHA6791K which caused the chain collision on
10/11/2019.

Below are the evidences attached.



Thank You and Best Regards,

Jenny Ng

Admin Manager

WAH HONG MOTORS & CREDIT PTE LTD
ROC:199806235M
ENTERPRISE HUB

38 TOH GUAN ROAD EAST
#01-57 S(608581)
Tel:(65)67737377

HP :(65)87783555

Website: www.wahhong.sg
Mail : motor@wahhong.sg



