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This mail is associated with :

*FBH5129P (9193700674SG)
[SKX1983A]
TP

BAN HOCK HIN (LEASING)
Sep 28 2019 9:05PM
[Leong Shi Jun (Liang Shi Jun)]
Ban Hock Hin Co. Pte Ltd
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From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 16/12/2020 15:40 PM.
To LKK_HQ
Subject

Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$126.81) - FBH5129P - Claim Handler: Goh, Jeremy-CX

Approved:126.81:Mandate approved. Please check with insured if he wants to private settle. Please informed insured before settlement NCD will be
affected.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Leong Shi Jun <outlookO0O@hotmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 27 February 2021 11:47 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Private settlement / Accident involving FBH 5129P and SKX 1983A on the
28/09/2019

Attachments: IMG_20210227_0001.pdf
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Dear Jasper;

Please kindly see attached.

Thank you

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, February 23, 2021 11:22:37 AM

To: Leong Shi Jun <outlookO0O@hotmail.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Private settlement / Accident involving FBH 5129P and SKX 1983A on the 28/09/2019
Dear Mr Leong,

You may make payment via GIRO or bank transfer.

Below payment details and payment amount :

1. $ 136.81 payable to BAN HOCK HIN CO PTE LTD - DBS Current Account No. :
0250085663
2. $ 354.17 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD - details as below :

Name of Bank Account LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS

PTE LTD

Name of Bank UOB

Bank — Branch No. 7375 -016

Account No. 116-311-126-3

Email address for remittance advice | account@lkkauto.com

PAYNOW ID 199607198R001

Please assist to screen shot both payment details and return together with the mutual settlement to us for our
necessary action.

Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance.

Thanks

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Leong Shi Jun <outlookOO@hotmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 22 February 2021 9:49 PM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Private settlement / Accident involving FBH 5129P and SKX 1983A on the 28/09/2019
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Is there any other mode of payment?

Thank you

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, February 22, 2021 2:58:03 PM

To: OUTLOOKOO@HOTMAIL.COM <OUTLOOKOO@HOTMAIL.COM>

Subject: Private settlement / Accident involving FBH 5129P and SKX 1983A on the 28/09/2019

Our Ref: CC6/A1G19019932/Ubb3

Your Ref: SKX 1983A

Dear Mr. LEONG SHI JUN (LIANG SHI JUN),
The above matter and e-mail as trailed refers.

Enclosed below is the breakdown of Third-Party’s claim if you would like to settle the matter privately to
protect the NCD:

1. Repair Cost(w/gst) $ 114.81
2. Loss of Use (1 days x $20) $ 20.00
3. GIA Search Fee $ 2.00

Total $136.81

4. LKK Professional Fee (w/GST) § 354.17
Please issue the following 2 cheques:
1. $ 136.81 payable to BAN HOCK HIN CO PTE LTD

2. $ 354.17 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

You may send your payment by post to:
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Blk 51 Ubi Avenue 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933



With the following attachments:

1. your cheque payment;
2. the signed private settlement letter as attached (scan copy will do) to protect your No Claim
Discount (NCD).

Kindly call the undersigned should your need further assistance.
Please let us have your decision within the next 10 days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Sent: Monday, 1 March 2021 10:26 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A

Subject: RE: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AIG19019932/Ubb3
Attachments: FBH5129P_PS Form.pdf

Dear Jasper,

We attached the signed Mutual Settlement Form for your perusal.
Appreciate for your kind assistance.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg

Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN
Ca., Pl L1d

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410 www.bhh.com.sg |

e
MOTORCYCLE ACCESSORIES | SERVICE CENTRE | MODIFICATIONS | SPRAY PAINTING AND BODY WORK | METAL WORKS | L
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 1 March 2021 9:59 AM

To: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AIG19019932/Ubb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Raymond,

Refer to screenshot attached, please assist to check on payment at your end.



Kindly request BAN HOCK HIN (LEASING)(TP claimant) to sign the mutual settlement form attached and
return to us for our necessary action.

Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 25 February 2021 10:12 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AIG19019932/Ubb3

Dear Jasper,
Have your insured transferred the private settlement payment to our account?
Please advise.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN
Ca., Pl L1d

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410 www.bhh.com.sg |
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From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 10:42 AM

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'hasrianah@bhh.com.sg' <hasrianah@bhh.com.sg>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/A1G19019932/Ubb3

Dear Jasper,
Thank you for your email.

Please advise your insured to transfer the amount of $136.81 to our company DBS Current Account No.
0250085663.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969

Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg
Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN
Ca., Pl L1d

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410 www.bhh.com.sg |

e
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From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 23 February 2021 10:36 AM

To: raymond@bhh.com.sg

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AlIG19019932/Ubb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Raymond,

Our insured intend to do a private settlement and he is agreeable with the LOD amount of $136.81.
As spoken, kindly provide the GIRO details for our necessary action.

Thanks



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Jasper Chua| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 February 2021 10:57 AM

To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AIG19019932/Ubb3

Dear Jasper,
We refer to our Letter of Demand on 02/12/2020.
Please advise the payment status of the above third party claim.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Raymond

Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 220 | Fax: (65) 6284 2969
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg

Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg

BAN HOCK HIN
Ca., Pl L1d

No. 6 Defu Lane 4, Singapore 539410 www.bhh.com.sg |
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From: raymond@bhh.com.sg <raymond@bhh.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 10:22 AM

To: 'Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)' <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your ref : FBH 5129P / DOA :28/09/2019 / LKK ref : CC6/AIG19019932/Ubb3
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MUTUAL SETTLEMENT FORM AI G
FOR MOTOR ACCIDENT

L .|

1. WE, THE, UNDERSIGNED HEREBY AGREE 1(©) MUTUALLY SETTLE AMONG OURSELVES A MOTOR ACCIDENT :

AS FOLLOWS
 Date / Tims: 28/09/2019 21:05
Along: ~ BUKIT PANJAI\—IMC;RING ROAD CARPARK BJ4;~ENTRANCE
”I_nvolving Vehwicle Numb;:(;):— 4- SKX 19&% & I;BH 5129P

| 2. BOTH PARTIES HAVE AGREED TO SETILE THIS MATTER AMICABLY ASFOLLOWS:

*Delete (A) and (B} as applicable.

(A) Neither party shall be liable to compensate the party for any loss or damages (direct or indirect) incurred or to

be incurred as a result of the accident.

(B) Without admission of liability, LEONG SHIJUN (LIANG SHIJUN) _ (Name) (Parly paying compensation) has

paid a sum of $$_136.81 (Amount) which _BAN HOCK HIN (LEASING) (Owner

of vehicle receiving compensation) herewith acknowledge receipt in full and final setilement of damages and

costs incurred as a result of this accident.

Signature: C#) Signature: Q@&
4

Name: Name: * »

" b, S Jun 0 Gl 1o
I/CT\IO. AB20|SDF I/CNo: T\ §31250y

Address: BIK 609 Buki+ Po, T : o
_ RinaRol 4(F-8%0 ¢ gpo) 6 Ve Lane 4 <(S440)
Vehicle No.: SKX 1983A Vehicle No.: FBH 5129P

Contact No.: 7368 I 7 93 ‘ Contact No.: t/,j,(g‘ bg—)‘b G . 220

Dute oQ:f % &OQ’ Date: O\ \b'?\'lD'll

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
AIG Building 78 Shenton Way #07-16 Singapore 079120
Tel: 6419 3000

Co. Reg. No. 201009404M Copyright © 2015 AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. All rights reserved.



Transferred

Amount in

SGD

POSB eSavings Account
127-8366/-0

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
UEN 19960/198R001

SHARE TRANSFER DETAILS




Transferred

Amount in

SGD

From

POSB eSavings Account

1271-88667-0
SGD

To
BAN HOCK HIN PTE LTD

DBS/POSB 025-008566-3
SGD

SHARE TRANSFER DETAILS




