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Yourref:  D19007084MFSH

Our ref: CS/FCHI901 9898/ Avi3 Date ; 5/3/2020

The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREIUDICE
MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLU 2518H

We thank vou for your instruction on 11/11/2019

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

1971172019 an the premises of M/s N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount t §56.991.60

Revised Estimate Amount : §%4.200.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check” ltems Amount : 5%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 53

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
ofs body .

Comments/Present Status;

Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING WAl PING
B.Eng AMSOE AMIFTE. AMSAE-AMMATAJ
Licensed Appralsar



M5 Firsn Capital invurance Limited (s TUSOUHLUED €31 Mew v M2 COUBLIRIEH
MS@FirstCapital —_—

B Rallles Quay ¥21-00 Singapore
Tl (B5] B222 2311 Fax (S5)E222 3547

Chaimmms. | P Unnsberassineng Duget: 303 Rolannzn Road BLE-0L City Howse Srgapons 0GEETT
Tet (B5) E507 3846 Faw (BS5) G507 T845
we i i apITal com g

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 08-11-2019 Our Ref No. D19007084MFSH
Accident Date 06-11-2018 Clalm Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC1140L Third Party Vehicle. SLU2518H
Survey Location 2 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 2 #01-18 KAK] BUKIT AUTOHURB
Contact Person. ZITING
Contact No. 68420051/ 0 Fax No. 67410510
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
fAppoiiles LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No, 68416315
Contact Number. NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST
51 A
Cc : Workshop o LTOMOTVEFTE Attention. NIL
LTD
Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge MAY CHUA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submil the survay report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection
This is & computer generated lettar, no signature required




- Veron Chen !LKKAutnz

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 5 March 2020 2:51 PM

To: CWS Motor Claims; SUR

Cc 'May Chua'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1-SLU 2518H
Attachments: S5LU 2518H PRELI ADVISED pdf

Dear Sir/Madam.

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLU 2518H
Date of survey: 19/11/2019
Number of days (estimated) : 6 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 8:35 AM

To: CW5 Maotor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Ce: 'May Chua' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1-SLU 2518H

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on 19/11/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

S5ent: Monday, 11 November 2019 10:03 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims’' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>: SUR
<sur@kkauto.com>

Cc: 'May Chua' <maychua@mstirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/ 1




Dear Sir/fMadam,
Thank you for the assignment,

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Repirds,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-3315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>
Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 9:22 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.s
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal,

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Waorkflow System

Motaor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



" Veron Chen !LKKAutn!

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 8:35 AM

To: CWS Motor Claims; SUR

Cc: ‘May Chua'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1-SLU 2518H
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle on 19/11/2019.

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards.

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6256-3561 | email sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 11 November 2019 10:03 AM

To: 'CWS Motor Claims' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; SUR
<gur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'May Chua' <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: pssignments@lkkato.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclai msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 9:22 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWS Motor Claims <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com sg>; May Chua <maychua@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: PRI; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D19007084MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,



~ We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Note: All the accident reports are uploaded into CWS for your perusal.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Maotor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This Is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



C .M Afran

*-@-51 AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AuroHub

2 Kaki Bukit Ave 2

#01-17 / #01-18 ' Heavy Vehicle #01-08 « Spray Painting #02.27 Yor=. e
Singapore 417921 Tel No, - +65 6842 (5] Fax No . +6% 674] 0510

E-Mail : sales@iinS 1 com.sg

Company Reg. No. : 20061 6038C

GST Regismation No_ - 200616038C

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD 0 1% Go
I8 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY | ESTIMATE
SINGAPORE 573960 \aron Repair Code : CLM15746

Datein: 06/11/2019
Vehicle Num. . SLU2518H

Model - HONDA VEZEL HYBRID | 5X AUTO
Chassis’Eng# - RU31 226488/ LEB5926499

Conmer » 66350005-GRAB 834539016

Parts and Labour Assesment

Description of part Oty Linlt Price At
FRONT RH DOOR M&' | 450,00 o 5000
FRONT RH DOOR FRAME BLACK STICKER M9 | 15.50 " 1850
FRONT RH DOOR INNER SEAL COVER Mot A | 1550 X 1530
FRONT RH DOOR LOWER SEAL | 28,00 A= 2800
FRONT RH DOOR VERTICAL SEAL NA I 35,00 A s
FRONT RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP SEAL . 48,00 4 98m
REAR RH BUMPER RETAINER N Ao ! 2100 T.8Bm
REAR RH BUMPER SIDE &TJ i 105,00 A 19500
REAR RH DOOR ~ “Deashtd | 930,60 o 930,60
REAR RH DOOR CENTER SEAL A€ Al I 16,50 X 3650
REAR RH DOOR FRAME BLACK STICKER Alee | 18,50 - 1850
REAR RH DOOR GLASS CHANNEL N Al | 75.00 A 9sm
REAR RH DOOR GLASS REGULATOR ~ @on 8 | 190,00 v 30000
REAR RH DOOR INNER SEALCOVER AT M4~ ! 1550 4 550
REAR RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD pualeed I 498,00 v 498.00
REAR RH DOOR LOWER SEAL N At ! 14,90 4 1400
REAR RH DOOR TRANSPARENT STICKER M ec | 35,00 =~ 35,00
REAR RH DOOR VERTICAL SEAL Akt pée I 18.50 4 1850

*4* This is a computer-gencraied docoment which requires no signature ***

page |



@N-51 AuTomOTIVE PTE LTD

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kaki Bukin Ave 2

#01-17 / #01-18 ' Heavy Vehlcle #01-08 / Spray Painting #02-27
Singopore 417921 Tel No_ - 465 6842 0051 Fax No. - +65 6741 0510
E-Mauil : salesi@n5i.com.sg

Company Reg. No. - 200616038C

GST Regsmation No : 200616038C

GRAB RENTALS PTE LTD
I8 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY
SINGAPORE 573960

Contact - 66550005-GRAB 83459016

ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLMI15746
Date in: 0&/11/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLU25|8H
Model - HONDA VEZEL HYBRID 1.53X AUTO
Chassis'Eng# = RU3I 1226488/ LEB5926499

REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH WA
REAR RH FENDER INNER SHIELD N Alke
REAR RH SPORTRIM  Lad

Pe—y e
REAR RH WHEEL BEARING a0

RH SIDE ROCKER PANEL GARNISH Lfk
Percenituge discount  20%%

FRONT RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS - SET M4
REAR BUMPER CLIPS - SET N A

REAR RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS - SET  Alec
REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS - SET Alze.
REAR RH FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS - SET A8 At
RH SIDE ROCKER PANEL GARNISH CLIPS - SET M

Percentage discount 1%

bersbo
359568

Subtown | before discoum

Sub-total 1

e,

Subrtotal before discount

Sul-total 2

Paris-total

page 1

*** This is o computer-generniell document which reguires no signature ***

193500
14750
§13.00
263,50

P77 S0

S0,.00
S0, 00
20000
.00}
20.00

S0.00

19500
A 147
L Jwsw s
¥ 2350
v TS50

325200

I 05040

4,201 60
30 st
A 5000
20 W
20 jmff

F

ZLT/SBT.H

280,00

280,00
448150




“@R-51 auTomoTIvE PTE LT

Kaki Bukit AutoHub

2 Kak) Bukn Ave 2

#1-17/ #01-18 / Heavy Vehicle #01-08 / Sproy Painting #02-27
Singapore 417921 Tel No. - +65 6842 005] Fax No, : <65 6741 0510

E-Majl | salex@nS ] comag
Company Reg. No. : 200616038C
G5T Registration No. @ 2006160330

GRAB RENTALS PTELTD
18 SIN MING LANE #01-08 MIDVIEW CITY ESTIMATE
Repair Code : CLM15746

SINGAPORE 573960
Date in: 06/1122019

Vehicle Num. : SLU2518H
Model | HONDA VEZEL HYBRID 1.5X AUTO
Chassis/Engs ;. RU3 1226488/ LEB5926499

Contact : 66550005-GRAB 83459016

LABOUR
Tis remove. restistall window gliss (1o FR) 2 U 'l;Mﬁ
To remove, change reay suspension parts, axle carmage, aheorber, lower arm, rop arm;, ling semn, <
kmcke arm, wheel besring, bearing hub and e, 2 i;ﬂfﬁ
To road test driving, check and resetting wheel alignments systen SO :}m'
To remove. reinstall roof top rrim uphoelsiery, cushion seat, mm gamish, 1m liner carper. e FR) ’.]-" 1 0HL (M0
To trusifér Goor gliss, regulator gesr, fotor, ralling, channel, bt board, mechankin lock sid handle )640 90 Lo
-
Tor re-apray puinting on the change badyparts, repair portion, and where consistent 1o the accident. 6,;[:; Lmﬁ‘r
To provide labour, workmanship 1o change the above damaged bodyparts, repair, re-construct and re- ﬁ‘l.:':' o
align hody structure, body alignments and damaged consistent 1o the nccident. o0
To apply anni-rus chemical on repaired and replaced panel ﬁ ) }mﬁ
Labour Total LE10.00
Farts & Labour Toral 6,991,460

2 Thisisa cnmpmw dicument which requires no signature *** B N
page 3
Fotal Ket168

L} ¢ A2
e 05074

the Repairer of the following: o

* To resurvey bekoraafer spray painiing TN
o Te dinplay Eorhases st SN TEBun \
* P2y prices ae sabined t sememgmon ’—{ 1": l
* SIpA Ty e 5] = De wurog e podg

3 BLtwaCt ) Sl srorova from MRULETICE Cornpay
Acnowieoged by Repaiter
Sgrature;
Ciin:




’ V ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ui Indusinal Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: B258 3561 FAX: 6255 4315

Reg. No: 199607186R GST Reg. Mo, 18-860T188-R

MS FIRST CA.F‘lTAL INEURA.NCE LTD Ref : GEI'FCHQNBBWAVEHZ‘

resrtensetnaoneosssr oo e[| NN
.  Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Inaurul Veh.  SHC 1740L Veh. Inlptl:ud SLLI 2518H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D19007084MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
l..l:l.lgﬂ From MAY CHUA A,“Ign Dﬂ. 11 v2me
Make I. Hnd-l HONDA 'U’EEL HYBRID c.C 1496
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. am7
Chassis No. RU31226488 Colour BRONZE
Odometer 165586 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Hudleﬁ?llinn SPORTS RIM

R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD 6 mm
R/M Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 HABILEAD 6 mm

'I‘HE VEHICLE SUETAII\ED DMU-GES AT THE. Qfs BODY,
IJ-‘M!.GEE SEE DETNLS

Amidml Date wﬁmm Inspection Date 19#11?21)19

Survey held at  N-51 AUTOMOTIVE PL

2 KAK| BUKIT AVE 2
#01-17 KAKI BUKIT AUTOHUB
SINGAPORE 417821

A}MGEB CONSISTENT TOD ﬁ'DGIDEHT REPORT.
BiTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
IN ACCORDANCE Tﬂ- ?GUH II'*I-GTHUCTIGNS WE I"IM."E NOT hUﬂiDRISED REPAIRS.




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusinial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL G256 3581 FAX: B258 4315
Reg No: 198607168R GST Reg. No. 16-8807188-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLU 2518H

FRONT RH DOOR

FRONT RH DOOR FRAME BLACK STICKER
FRONT RH DOOR INNER SEAL COVER
FRONT RH DOOR LOWER SEAL

FRONT RH DOOR VERTICAL SEAL

FRONT RH DOOR WEATHER STRIP SEAL
REAR RH BUMPER RETAINER

REAR RH BUMPER SIDE

—_ - 4 A A A A

REAR RH DOOR
REAR RH DOOR CENTER SEAL

REAR RH DOOR FRAME BLACK STICKER
REAR RH DOOR GLASS CHANNEL

REAR RH DOOR GLASS REGULATOR
REAR RH DOOR INNER SEAL COVER
REAR RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD
REAR RH DOOR LOWER SEAL

REAR RH DOOR TRANSPARENT STICKER
REAR RH DOCR VERTICAL SEAL

REAR RH FEMDER ARCH GARNISH

REAR RH FENDER |NNER SHIELD

REAR RH SPORT RIM

REAR RH WHEEL BEARING

RH SIDE ROCKER PANEL GARNISH

LESS 20% DISCOUNT

—_ ks o ek ek ok b =k sk bk ek e ek

SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS (SN)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI19019898/Avfan2

SET FRONT RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS (SN)

SET REAR RH DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS (SN)
1|SET REAR RH FENDER ARCH GARNISH CLIPS (SN)

DENTED
NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY

TO REPAIR SEE
LABOUR

DENTED

NOT MNECESSARY
NECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY
DAMAGED

NOT NECESSARY
CRACKED

NOT NECESSARY
MECESSARY

NOT NECESSARY
cuT

NOT NECESSARY
cuT

DAMAGED

cuT

NECESSARY
NOT NECESSARY
NECESSARY
NECESSARY

950.00 850.00
18.50 1850
35.50 =
28.00 -
35.00 .
88.00 .
23.00

185.00 =

930,60 930.60
36.50
18.50 18.50
95.00 .

380.00 3390.00
35.50 .

488.00 488,00
14.80 .
35.00 35.00
18.50 .

185.00 185.00

147.50 o

B13.00 813.00

263.50 263.50

377.50 I7T.50

-1,050.40 -897 92
4,201.60 3,591.68
50,00 30.00
50.00 -
50.00 30.00
30.00 20.00




! V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: 6258 3581 FAX: B258 4315

Rag Mo 1838071887 GST Reg. No 19-B807198-R

1 SET HEAR RH FEHDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS {SH}
1|SET RH SIDE ROCKER PANEL GARNISH CLIPS (SN} NECESSARY

LABOUR
TO REMOVE, REINSTALL WINDOW GLASS (TO FR). 120.00 80.00
TO REMOVE,CHANGE REAR SUSPENSION PARTS,AXLE 150,00 50.00

CARRIAGE ABSORBER LOWER ARM,TOP ARM TRAILING
ARM KNUCKLE ARM WHEEL BEARING BEARING HUB
AND ETC.

TO ROAD TEST DRIVING,CHECK AND RESETTING 100.00 80.00
WHEEL ALIGNMENTS SYSTEM.

TO REMOVE,REINSTALL ROOF TOP TRIM NOT NECESSARY 100.00 -
UPHOLSTERY,CUSHION SEAT. TRIM GARNISH.TRIM
LINER CARPET (TO FR).

TO TRANSFER DDOR GLASS REGULATOR 160.00 80.00
GEAR,MOTOR, RAILING CHANNEL TRIM
BOARD,MECHANISM LOCK AND HANDLE

TO RE-SPRAY PAINTING ON THE CHANGE 1,100.00 B00.00
BODYPARTS,REPAIR PORTION,AND WHERE

CONSISTENT TO THE ACCIDENT.

TO PROVIDE LABOUR, WORKMANSHIP TO CHANGE THE 700.00 600.00

ABOVE DAMAGED BODYPARTS, REPAIR,RE-CONSTRUCT
AND RE-ALIGN BODY STRUCTURE.BODY ALIGNMENTS
AND DAMAGED CONSISTENT TO THE
ACCIDENT.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR RH
BUMPER SIDE

TO APPLY ANTI-RUST CHEMICAL ON REPAIRED AND BO0.00 50.00
REPLACED PANEL.

2,510.00 1,540.00

R&purt Ref No. CBJFCHBNBBSBMM

ADRIAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng. AMSOE.AMIRTE AMSAE-A M MATAI

Licensed Apprainer
MSCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIFD PARTIES. - This Report is made solsly i the uss snd benalil of the Clisn nams:d on the et pegs of this Raport.




