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- Pom Liet Company Ragisiration No. 1006071808

S5 U AVE 1, #3-25 PAYA U] INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAORE S08933 TEL @ a5y 2503361 FAN 1 il a2fadlls

Your Ref: CMTD 1905 |82/AGC Date: 11 November 2019

Our Ref: CS/SMO19019858/Ksd3

The Motor Claims Department

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _GBE 2175K .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle on
08/11/2019 at the premises of M/s Yee Auto Pte Ltd and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount ;8§ 13.835.80 [
Revised Estimate Amount (8§ 7.014.45 5
*Check™ Items Amount : 58 §90.70
Market Value i T -

LTA Reimbursement Value - 88 .

Neu Value : 88 -
Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages
at the n/s front portion.

Comments/ Present Status:
Damages Consistent.
Repair days: 5 days

Yours faithfully

Kenneth Kong
Automotive Assessor



Shirlﬂ Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LEK Auto)

Sent: Maonday, 11 November 2019 4:43 pm

To: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'

Cc: ‘Chan, Shu Hui Agnes’; 'Henry, lrene James'; SUR; assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Urgent: Pre-Repair Inspection: Your Vehicle: GBH 7690 X; Our Ref: YeeAuto-GBE
2275 K; Accident Involving GBE 2275 K & GBH 7690 X on 6 November 2019 Cur ref:
CMTD1905182/AGC

Attachments: PRELI ADVISE - GBE 2275K pdf

Dear Melvin,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBE 2275K.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall: Sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Alk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 10:02 am

To: 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Ce: 'Chan, Shu Hui Agnes' <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; 'Henry, Irene James' <irene.henry@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Urgent: Pre-Repair Inspection: Your Vehicle: GBH 7690 X; Our Ref: YeeAuto-GBE 2275 K; Accident Involving
GBE 2275 K & GBH 7690 X on 6 November 2018 Our ref : CMTD1905182/AGC

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards

G.NIVITHA

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gesignments@lkkauto.com | fax: f256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubil Industrial Park, Ubi Avenoe 1, #02-25 | S(408033)



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvinye@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 419 FM

To: sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: Chan, Shu Hui Agnas; Henry, Irene James; yeeauto pteltd; bonnie kwok

Subject: RE: Urgent: Pre-Repair Inspection: Your Vehicle: GBH 7690 X; Our Ref: YeeAuto-GBE
2275 K; Accident Involving GBE 2275 K & GBH 7690 X on & November 2019 Our ref
1 CMTD1905182/AGC

Hi LKK,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for GBE2275K.

Best Regards
Melvin Ye

Claims Division
D: 6322 45657 | T. 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO ' A Century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Website: www sompo com.sg | Facebook: www facebook.com/SompoSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission' & Product Purchase® via Sompo 5G

8 oo Sioro Jl P> Googepir

Far Travel, Perwonal Accident & Home insurance | # For Travel, Personal Accigent. Homa & Private Martor [nsurance

Download now @

Disclaimar: This e-mall, Including attachments, Is inlendad lor the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unautharised disclosure, copying of use of this information may be unlawful and |s prohibited
I you are not the iInlendad recipient, please dalele this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Ple Lid. may collecl, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
slated in our Privacy Policy. This may include disclosure to holding and associaled companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosire is parmittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalfl), Plaasa click here for
our Privacy Palicy

From: bonnie kwok <litigation@bonnlekwok.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November, 2019 3:44 PM

To: Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye @sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Chan, Shu Hul Agnes <agnes.chan@sompo.com.sg>; Henry, Irene James <irene henry@sompo.com.sg>; yeeauto
pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.caom>

Subject: Re: Urgent: Pre-Repair Inspection: Your Vehicle: GBH 7630 X; Our Ref: YeeAuto-GBE 2275 K; Accident
Involving GBE 2275 K & GBH 7690 X on 6 November 2019 Qur ref : CMTD1905182/AGC

Drear Sirs,



Our client ngrees to LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid as the Single Joint Expert (SIE).
Please let us have their report in due course,
Kindly request for the SJE to contact the repairers, M/s Yee Auto Pte Lid at 6457 5768 to make the necessary arrangements.

Regards,
ST

BONNIE KWOK LLC
Advocates & Solicitors

101A Upper Cross Street

#08-12 People's Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6536 6026

FAX: 6536 2279

email : hitigation(@bonniekwok.com
GST Reg. No.: 20120354772

We do not accept service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays to
Fridays from 9 am to 6 pm and we are closed on Saturday, Sundays and Public Holidays.
-- Email Disclaimer --
This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it from your system and notify the
sender. You are advised to carry out your own checks on this message for computer viruses and other
defects. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused by computer viruses and/or
other defects.
On Thu, 7 Nov 2019 at 15:05, Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ve@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference: CMTD1205182/AGC

Your Reference: YeeAuto-GBE 2275 K

P dice

Date: 07 November 2019

Attention:



BONNIE KWOK LLC

Dear Sir / Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE2275K & GBH7690X ON 06.10.201%

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 07/11/2019.

The handler for this case is Ms Agnes Chan.

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with your
client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to conduct
the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Selection (Indicate as

Motor Surveyor Surveyor tick)
1 | Raleigh Services Andrew Ow Yong
Vincent Ng
Kenneth Kong [North
2 | LKK Auto Consultants area)

Marcus Chua (East area)
Mohd Rasul (West area)
Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 | Priority Services Jimmy Lee
Lawrence Ng
leffery Ong

4 | In House surveyar Teo See Ling

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors, We will bear the cost of
the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert



Best Regards

Melvin Ye
Claims Division

D: 6322 4667 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3302

@ SOMPO A century of Trust

INSURANCE

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
50 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623
Wabsite: www. sompo.com.sq | Facebook: www facebook com/SompaSG

Quick & Easy Claims Submission® & Product Purchase via Sompo 56

anicad o the

[ 18 hpp Store

Download now @ or

For Travel, Personal Accident B Home Insurance | # For Travel, Parsonal Accldent, Homa & Private Motor Insurance

Disclaimer; This e-mall, including attachments, is intended for the person{s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged infarmation Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be uniawful and is
prohibied If you are not the inlended recipient, pleasa delete this message

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompa Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Palicy. This may include disclosure to halding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties 1o whom
disclosure is parmittedirequired by laws, our third party service providers and agents {acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Palioy

From: bonnie kwok <litigation@bonniekwok.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November, 2019 10:33 AM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MaotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Urgent: Pre-Repair Inspection: Your Vehicle: GBH 7690 X; Our Ref: YeeAuto-GBE 2275 K; Accident Involving
GBE 2275 K & GBH 7690 X on 6 November 2019




Urgemt
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter

We hereby give you 2 days' notice to conduct a pre-repair inspection of vehicle no. GBE 2275 K at M/s Yee Auto Pte Lid,
Block 160 Sin Ming Drive #02-17 Sin Ming Autocity Singapore 575722.

Regards,

BONNIE KWOK LLC

Advocates & Solicitors

101A Upper Cross Street

#08-12 People's Park Centre
Singapore 058358

TEL: 6536 6026

FAX: 6536 2279

email : litigation/@bonnickwok.com
GST Reg. No.: 2012035472

We do not accept service of documents by facsimile or email. Our business hours are from Mondays to
Fridays from 9 am to 6 pm and we are closed on Saturday, Sundays and Public Holidays.

— Email Disclaimer --

This message contains information that may be privileged and confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this message is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please delete it from your system and notify the
sender. You are advised to carry out your own checks on this message for computer viruses and other

5



defects. Please note that we disclaim liability for any loss or damage caused by computer viruses and/or
other defects.



Tel G457 5768 Fax: 6252 8450 Mobile: BSET 4031
Email yeeautoptaltd@gmail com

Registraton No- 201719251W GST No: 201718251W

YEEAUTOPTELTD - -

160 Sin Ming Drive  #02.17/807-12 Sin Ming AutoCily Singapore 575722

M/S:  Sompo Insurance Singapore Pre Lid
50 Raffles Place Estimate No:  ES1900114
#03-03 Singapore Land Tower Date: 08 Nov 2019
Singapore 048623 yav; Palicy No:
o7 ##AMM Veh Reg No: GBE2275K
ATTN: Motor Claim Department / /! .ﬁr 6) .? ?‘? ﬁ Make/Model:  TOYOTA TOYOTA
DYNA 150 MANUAL
Your Ref No: - %fm.? ,4',% ,ﬂ Chassis No: JTFAT35YX0K205087
ClaimType:  Third Party S*7 EngineNo:  1KD2557751
Accident Date;  06/11/2019 5.2 Reg. Date: 30/09/2015
TP Veh Reg No:  GBHT7690X <y,
Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBE2275K
Description UiPrice  Quantity List Price Amount
Ss S8
Net Price
| FRONT NUMBER PLATE 60,00 1 PC _‘! 000 Z 5/
60,00 60.00
Spare Paris
2 DASHHBOARD 1,867.50 1ee Jea 186750 X
3 ERP IU BRACKET 40,00 IPC A, 4000 Zd/m
4 FRONT BUMPER 672,80 | PC L I B —
§  FRONT CORNER FENDER - LH 223.90 1 PC 4!, 22390 —
6 FRONT CORNER PANEL TOP GARNISH BLACK - LH 85.10 I PC fi~ 510 (
7 FRONT DOOR - LH I, 66850 I PC 166850 m—"
8 FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM 42 50 | PC 4" 8250 ¥
9 FRONT DOOR HINGE TOP 8250 I PC N g0 &
10 FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM - LH 420,00 | PC '~ 12000
Il FRONT DOOR LOCK - LH 28500 | PC T 28500 X
12 FRONT DOOR OUTER MOULDING - LH 152.90 1 PC fo 13290 X
13 FRONT DOOR STICKER ‘COMPANY' - LH 40,00 1PC Ae a0 Z8p.
14 FRONT DOOR STICKER ‘LOGO' - LH rer 260,00 VPC (Brwy) 26000 = (S sn
15 FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP - LH 125,60 1pe Fe 2560 x
16 FRONT GRILLE 38050 | PC M$em 35050 -
17 FRONT GRILLE 'LOGO' 105,10 IPC Mo 0510 1,/"
I8 FRONT HEADLAMP - LH 638,40 IPC €M 63840 —
19 FRONT PANEL T81.20 | PC A w20 X
20 FRONT PANEL EMBLEM 'DYNA' 95,10 1 PC e 9510 ~—
21 FRONT PANEL TOP GARNISH ‘BLACK’ 18350 IPC B 18550 X
22 FRONT SIDE MIRROR ‘BIG - LH 135.90 1PC i 13590 —
23 FRONT SIDE MIRROR SMALL” - LH 165,90 s AL 16590 —
24 FRONT SIDE MIRROR BRACKET - LH 195,10 | PC Ay 19510 —"
28 FRONT SIDE MIRROR COVER ‘SILVER' - LH 125.90 | PC B 12590 ¥
26 FRONT TOF STEP GARNISH - LH 185.30 1pc R 18530 x
27 FRONT WINDSCREEN 1.170.10 IPC Cat LITON0 —
28 FRONT WINDSCREEN RUBBER 265,50 IPC My 29550 fﬁ’;a_. 1R,
29 FRONT WIPER ARM COVER - LH 30,00 IPC S 3000 X
30 FRONT WIPER ARM COVER - RH 30,00 1re S 3000 X
?jt 10,545.80 10,545,850
Labiur
31 TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS, PANEL BEAT  1.200.00 1 0B 1,200.00 {ﬁ{
WHERE NECESSARY



YEE AUTOPTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #02-17/807-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Tel B457 5788 Fax 6252 8450 Mobile: 9887 4031
Email yeeautopteltd@gmall com
Registration No - 201719251W GST No: 201718251W

M/S:  Sompo Insurance Singapore Pre Lid

50 Raffles Place Estimate No:  ES1900114
#03-03 Singapore Land Tower Date: 08 Nov 2019
Singapore 048623 Policy No:
Veh Reg No: GBE2275K
ATTN:  Motor Claim Department Make/Model:  TOYOTA TOYOTA
DYNA 150 MANUAL
Your Ref No: - Chassis No: JTFAT3SYX0K205087
Claim Type: Third Party Engine No: IKD2557751
Accident Date:  06/11/2019 Reg. Date: 30/09/2015

TP Veh Reg No:  GBH7690X

B Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No :GBE2275K

Description U/Price  Quantity List Price Amount
SS 9 SS
12 TOPUTTY, APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY-PAINT ON THE L200.00 110B 1,200.0:0 ﬂaf
AFFECTED PORTION,
33 TOREMOVEREPLACE DASHBOARD LABOUR 480,00 1 18 480,00 Ej'.s(
3 TOREMOVEREFIT FRONT WINDSCREEN TO FACILIT ATE 200,040 1 108 200,00 ( ﬂf"
REPAIRS
33 TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS, 150.00 1 108 15000 Zef
323000 1.230.00
Totul S5 13,835 80
Add GST @ ™% 968.51
Total Amount Payable SE 14,804.31

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR FOURTEEN THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED AND FOUR AND CENTS THIRTY ONE ONLY

For Yee Auto Pte Lid




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Uil Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Indusirial Park. Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3581 FAX: B256 4215

Reg. No: 139807 198R GST Reg. No. 18-B807198-R

Affiliatad to Federation Intemationale Des Exparts En Automobile

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE PL

50 RAFFLES PLACE
#05-01/08

SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623

Ref : CS/SMO19019858/Ksd3n2

Date; 25-11-2018

A

Code: SMO
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 7600X Veh. Inspected GBE 22T5K
Palicy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD18051B2/AGC Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From YONG KANG MELVIN Assign Date 07172018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTADYNA c.c 2982
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. JTFAT3SYXOK205087 Colour SILVER
Odometer 161452 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |185R15XB YOKOHAMA, g mm
L/H Front Tyre |185 R15X8 YOKOHAMA 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155 R12X8 (D) ALUSTONE 8/8 mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155 R12X8 (D) AUSTONE 8/ mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  06/11/2018 |Inspection Date 08/11/2019
Survey held at 160 SIN MING DRIVE #02-17
Repairer YEE AUTO SERVICE
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b, Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




¥

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: A258 3561 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No. 19960T188R GST Reg. No. 19-DE0T186-R Page MoV of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBE 2275K
Qy| | Dsscriptonofpats conditon | et e B
[REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|DASHBOARD SERVICEABLE 1,B67.50 -
1|FRONT BUMPER BENT 672.80 G72.80
1|FRONT CORMNER FENDER-LH BENT 22190 22380
1|FRONT CORNER PANEL TOP GARNISH "BLACK™-LH TO REPAIR SEE 8510 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR-LH BENT 1.668.50 1.668, 50
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM TO REPAIR SEE 8250 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR HINGE TOP TO REPAIR SEE B250 .
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR INNER TRIM-LH SERVICEABLE 420.00 -
1|FRONT DOOR LOCK-LH TO REPAIR SEE 2B5.00 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER MOULDING-LH SERVICEABLE 152.80 -
1|FRONT DOOR WEATHERSTRIP-LH SERVICEABLE 125.60 -
1|FRONT GRILLE MTG CRACKED 380.50 380,50
1|FRONT GRILLE "LOGO" MNECESSARY 105.10 105.10
1|FRONT HEADLAMP-LH CRACKED 658.40 658 40
1|FRONT PANEL TO REPAIR SEE 781.20 -
LABOUR
1|FRONT PANEL EMBLEM "DYNA" MECESSARY £85.10 8510
1|FRONT PANEL TOP GARMNISH "BLACK" SERVICEABLE 185.50 *
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR "BIG"-LH BROKEM 13580 135,80
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR "SMALL"-LH BROKEN 165.90 16590
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR BRACKET-LH BENT 18510 185.10
1|FRONT SIDE MIRROR COVER "SILVER™-LH SERVICEABLE 125.80
1|FRONT TOP STEP GARNISH-LH SERVICEABLE 185.30
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN CRACKED 1,170.10 1.170.10
1|FRONT WIPER ARM COVER-LH SERVICEABLE 30.00 -
1|FRONT WIPER ARM COVER-RH SERVICEABLE 30.00 .
LESS 25% DISCOUNT - -1,367.83
8.810.30 4.103.47

Report Ref No. CS/SMO19019858/Ksd3n2




_’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

e 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408533
- TEL: B258 1561 FAX: 8258 4315
Reg Mo 199607188R GST Reg. Mo, 18-8607198-R Page No. 2 of 2
aty Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Pt - - " [Workshop ()| (S)
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|ERP IU BRACKET (SN) NECESSARY 40.00 26.00
1|FRONT NUMBER PLATE (SN) BENT B0.00 25.00
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER *COMPANY“-LH (SN] MNECESSARY 40,00 2500
1|FRONT DOOR STICKER "LOGO"-LH (SN} NECESSARY 260.00 150.00
1|FRONT WINDSCREEN RUBBER (50%)(SN) NECESSARY 20550 147.75
595 60 ATATE
LABOUR
TO DISMANTLE & REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS PANEL 1,.200.00 &00.00
BEAT WHERE NECESSARY INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR
OF FRONT CORNER PANEL TOP GARNISH "BLACK™-
LH,FRONT DOOR HINGE BOTTOM, FRONT DOOR HINGE
TOP.FRONT DOOR LOCK-LH AND FRONT PANEL.
TO PUTTY APPLY PRIMER & SPRAY-PAINT ON THE 1,200.00 800.00
AFFECTED PORTION
TO REMOVE/REPLACE DASHBOARD LABOUR. 480.00 250,00
TO REMOVE/REFIT FRONT WINDSCREEN TO 200.00 B0.00
FACILITATE REPAIRS.
TO CHECK WIRING FUNCTIONS. 150.00 20.00
3.230.00 1,830.00
GRAND TOTAL 13,835.80 6,307.22
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS ; 4,900.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No, CS/SMO19019858/Ksd3n2

ASe

KOMG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD FARTIES: - This Report I8 made salely for the uss snd banafit of the Cliant named on the fromd page of Bus Repon.




