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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

T

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, August 21, 2017 10:27 AM

To: kitty.teo

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Lynn Khong

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7M000ZS FBL8607K DOA: 13.08.2017
Dear Kitty,

The market value for FBL 8607K is $9,300 - $9,800 (EST) as at August 2017

Thank you.

Best Regards, L
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: AutoProbe Admin [mailto:admin@autoprobe.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, August 18, 2017 11:15 AM

To: admin <admin@Ibs-auto.com>; chowauto <chowauto@singnet.com.sg>; rta <rta@rta.com.sg>; cynthia.ong
<cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg>; LKK Valuation <valuation@lkkauto.com>; kee <kee@asphoon.com>; motorsurvey
<motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>

Cc: kitty.teo <kitty.teo@axa.com.sg>; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Lynn Khong <lynn khong@axa.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7M000ZS FBL8607K DOA: 13.08.2017

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.

Jessie Ong

AutoProbe Consultants

Blk 151A Serangoon North Avenue 2,
#02-81 Singapore 551151

Main: 62699235 Fax: 62691446



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: AutoProbe Admin <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, August 18, 2017 11:15 AM

To: admin; chowauto; rta; cynthia.ong; LKK Valuation; kee; motorsurvey

Cc: kitty.teo; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; Lynn Khong

Subject: Re: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7M000ZS FBL8607K DOA: 13.08.2017
Attachments: Log Card-FBL8607K.pdf

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.

Jessie Ong

AutoProbe Consultants

Blk 151A Serangoon North Avenue 2,
#02-81 Singapore 551151

Main: 62699235 Fax: 62691446
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: 5232D
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: FBL8607K
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-re ipstration ‘/\/\ \\‘\J
DAt 9 17 Aug 2017 '
ate:
Vehicle Make: YAMAHA
Vehicle Model: SNIPER T150
Primary Colour: Black ;\5’0 ce .
Manufacturing Year: 2016
Engine No.: G3EBE0237533
Chassis No.: MH3UG0740G0039631
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $1,999.00
Original Registration
Date: 08 Apr 2017
First Registration Date: 08 Apr 2017
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: $300.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: No
PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:  $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

lCOE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

07 Apr 2027~
D - Motorcycle
10

$8,081.00
$7,790.00
$7,790.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Aug 2017

https://vrl.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/pubfunc?ID=EnquireRebateBeforeDeReg
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