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Janice Lée (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, July 31, 2017 10:50 AM

To: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0440943/P1863188
Dear Kitty,

The market value for SLK 4027Y is $95K - $96K (EST) as at JULY 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler P ad
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd Q\J”' ~

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2017 10:00 AM

To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK
Valuation; admin@|bs-auto.com; kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0440943/P1863188

This mail is associated with :
*SLK4027Y (C0440943)
oD
Jun 27 2017 10:00AM
[OPTIMA WERKZ PTE. LTD.]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]

Sent by : Kitty Teo (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



Janice Lae (LKKAuto)

m

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>
Sent: Tuesday, July 25, 2017 10:00 AM
To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg;

cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation; admin@Ibs-auto.com;
kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: kitty.teo@axa.com.sg
Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-C0440943/P1863188
Attachments: Log card (if available).PDF

This mail is associated with :
*SLK4027Y (C0440943)
oD
Jun 27 2017 10:00AM
[OPTIMA WERKZ PTE. LTD.]
Optima Werkz Pte Ltd
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to kitty.teo@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]

Sent by : Kitty Teo (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



TI242017

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

hltpsjlwi Ila.gov.sghitahl/action/publunc?ID=EnquireRebateBeforeDeReg

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Ow ner ID Type:

Ow ner 1D:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be
Exported:
intended De-
regisiration Date:

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:

Manufacturing Year:

Engine No..

Chassis No.:

Maximum Pow er
Qutput:

Open Markel Value:

Original Registration
Date:

First Registration
Date:

Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Company
2455w

SLK4027Y

No

24 Jul 2017

TOYCTA

AQUA HYERID 1.5S A
White

2016

1NZB043268
NHP106538586 M c_uf
73.0 KW (97 bhp)
$20,467.00

16 Jan 2017

16 Jan 2017

a¢.qb

0
$5,000.00

Intended PARF Rehate Details

PARF Bligibility:
PARF Higibility
Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate
Amount:

Yes
15 Jan 2027

$3,750.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COL Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Peried(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate
Amount:
Total Rebate
Amount:

16 Jan 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & B7kW (130bhp})
10

$50,951.00

$48,280.00

$52,030.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 24 Jul 2017

hittps:vrllta.govsg/tahrifaction/publunc?ID=EnquireR ebateBeforeDeReg
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