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Janite Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, July 31, 2017 9:24 AM

To: "Tham, Pauline’

Ce: priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com; assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: Veh : SFF8686R - Market value request , Oref : 29220292685G

Dear Pauline,

The market value for SFF 8686R is $35K - $37K (EST) as at JULY 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 2:50 PM

To: 'Tham, Pauline'; SUR

Cc: priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com; assignments

Subject: FW: Veh : SFF8686R - Market value request, Oref : 2922029268SG

Dear Pauline,
Thank you for your email.

Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assisnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham @aig.com]
Sent: Friday, 28 July, 2017 2:47 PM
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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

M

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, July 28, 2017 2:50 PM

To: '"Tham, Pauline'; SUR

Cc: priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com; assignments

Subject: FW: Veh : SFF8686R - Market value request , Oref : 29220292685G
Attachments: SFF8686R - doa 22-7-2017 pdf

Dear Pauline,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 28 July, 2017 2:47 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Subject: Veh : SFF8686R - Market value request , Oref : 29220292685G

Dear Ashley/Catherine,
We would like to request for Market value for SFF8686R

Date of accident : 22/7/2017

Thanks.

Pauline Tham

AlG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 7791J

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SFF8686R

Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended De-registration

Date: 25 Jul 2017

Vehicle Make: VOLVO

Vehicle Model: S80 T6 AT ABS D/AB 4WD 4DR GAS/D TURBO
Primary Colour: Grey

Manufacturing Year: 2008
Engine No.: B6304T04020815274
Chassis No.: YV1AS995681073756

Maximum Power Qutput: 210.0 kW (281 bhp)

Open Market Value: $54,033.00
Original Registration
Date: 18 Apr 2008

First Registration Date: 18 Apr 2008
Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid; $54,033.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry 17 Apr 2018
Date: P

PARF Rebate Amount: $27,016.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 17 Apr 2018 /(, _ ‘B 7
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above) ’g

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $19.501.00

COE Rebate Amount:  $1,423.00

Total Rebate Amount: $28,439.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 25 Jul 2017
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