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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

M

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, July 31, 2017 10:56 AM

To: 'ANG Yvonne'

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7MO00FY-SIM7767M

Dear Yvonne,

The market value for SIM 7767M is $28K - S30K (EST) as at JULY 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 S~
p
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933) b

From: ANG Yvonne [mailto:yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, July 21, 2017 5:14 PM

To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta; cynthia.ong; LKK Valuation; admin; Wendy Tan
Cc: admin; HO Winnie; KHONG Lynn; TEO Kitty; ONG Birdie -
Subject: FW: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7MOOOFY-SIM7767M

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

Yvonne Ang
Assistant Manager
Motor (Property) Claims

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sq
Email: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg
DID: 1800 880 4888




Ve on Chen (LKKAuto)

From: AutoProbe Admin <admin@autoprobe.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 21 July, 2017 5:08 PM
To: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg;

cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation; admin@Ibs-auto.com;
motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: HO Winnie; ONG Birdie; Kitty Teo Poh Guek
Subject: Re: Checking Market Value (MV)-S7M0O00FY-SJM7767M
Attachments: Log Card-SJM7767M.pdf

Dear Yvonne.
To check Market Value. (CTL Case)

Best Regards

Jessie Ong

AutoProbe Consultants

Blk 151A Serangoon North Avenue 2,
#02-81 Singapore 551151

Main: 62699235 Fax: 62691446

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for
in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either

whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

WVehicle Owiner Particulars

Churer 10 I'yos
(Gwnor 10,
Vehicie Details

Vohicle Na.:

Conipany

C7igD

HIMTTETH

VMahiclz to ba Exported  Yes

Intended Da-registration

Date:

Vehicls Moke:
Vehick Madal
Frimary Colour,
Manulacluring Year.
Fngine No

Chassis Mo
Kaxzimum Paesar
Cutpul

Chpon Markat Va'ua:

Chiging1 Rag stration
Dale:

Firsl Regisliativn Dalz

Transfer Count.

Actusl ARF Paid:

i dul 2017
VOLKSWAGEN
TIGUAN 207 AUTC SKA2T3 4WD

Biack

A0as

CAWG1HIES

MVGR225NZONMH 7870 /

125.0 k¥ (167 bhp) )&’3 ?
$26,621.00
21 Jan 2008
21 dan 2009

[

526,621 00

Intendled PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Elg bikty:

PARF Flghilly Ex;
[rate:

FARF Rebale Amount

L+H

WY 50 Jan 2019

394,641 0D

Intended COE Rebate Details

COC Expiry Date:
COC Categosy:
COE Pediod|Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rabale Amounl

20 Jan 201¢

G- Car (1G04ce & above)
10

$3.089.00

EA4G5.00

Total Rehate Amaunt: §45,106.00

Tha information conleined hargin is correst as al 17 Jul 2017
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