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Janicé Lee (LKKAuto)

M

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, July 17, 2017 2:09 PM

To: 'Hannah Choo'

Co: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Hannah,

The market value for SFZ 5466Z is $26K - $28K as at JULY 2017

Thank you. ) eV

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 10:51 AM

To: 'Hannah Choo'; SUR

Cc: 'Derrick Quok'; 'Kenneth Lim'; 'Aaron Wang'; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto); assignments
Subject: RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Hannah,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Jest Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5§(408933)

From: Hannah Choo [mailto:hannah.choo@directasia.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 12 July, 2017 10:48 AM




Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

#

From: Hannah Choo <hannah.choo@directasia.com>

Sent: Monday, July 17, 2017 3:01 PM

To: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: [EXT] RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)
Hi Janice,

Please advise if this vehicle is repairable, what is the economical limit?

Please provide LTA rebate. a
p I —
Thank you

/"

‘ (. V \, Mp: f\" (
Hannah Choo /Claims Specialist c‘@”‘/ '(f ‘@I’m“ W\«dﬁ K
Direct : 6603 3607

DirectAsia Insurance O\ %

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555

Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, S(058716)
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From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto) [mailto:JaniceLee@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, 17 July, 2017 2:09 PM -

To: Hannah Choo e Gun 2’ he Arn Aot

Cc: assignments; SUR
Subject: [EXT] RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Hannah, l"" )S WA £ e A dva <A Ay /7” ;
L\/

The market value for SFZ 5466Z is $26K - $28K as at JULY 2017

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, July 12, 2017 10:51 AM

To: 'Hannah Choo'; SUR
Cc: 'Derrick Quok'; 'Kenneth Lim'; 'Aaron Wang'; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto); assignments
Subject: RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Hannah,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hannah Choo [mailto:hannah.choo@directasia.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 12 July, 2017 10:48 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Derrick Quok <derrick@directasia.com>; Kenneth Lim <kenneth@directasia.com>; Aaron Wang
<aaron.wang@directasia.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Naz (LKKAuto)' <Naz@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Sir,
Please assist to provide market value.

Thank you

Hannah Choo /Claims Specialist
Direct : 6603 3607

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, S(058716)
www.directasia.com

(flvIsTinlolo)



From: Naz (LKKAuto) [mailto:Naz@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 July, 2017 9:07 AM

To: Hannah Choo

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Aaron Wang; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: DAI Claim No. 71479 ; SFZ 5466Z (Fire Case)

Dear Hannah,

| have received the assignment and will proceed with the investigation.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Naz | Technical investigator

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | §(408933)

From: Hannah Choo <hannah.choo@directasia.com>

Sent: Monday, 10 July 2017 3:10 PM

To: Naz (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Aaron Wang

Subject: New Matter : SFZ5466Z caught Fire ; Claim: 71479, Claimed Policy: MT/00378709 , Policy Holder: Andi Chendra
Purnomo

Dear Sir,
We would like to appoint LKK to investigate this fire case.
The vehicle is now at Ah Lim Motor (Sin Ming Branch)

Thank you



Hannah Choo /Claims Specialist
Direct : 6603 3607

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, S{058716)
www.directasia.com
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DENTIALITY NOTICE: iny attachment) is intended only for the attention of the ddresses 1 may ntain leg grivileged andy/o

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally privileged and/or
confidential information. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted. If you are not
the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender.

Click here to report this email as spam.
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Singapore NRIC

Owner ID: B8417E s 6 k/
Vehicle Details 1 ‘ (/ ﬂ i

Vehicle No.: SFZ5466Z ‘

Vehicle to be Exported: No

::r;;?;ded De-registration 17 Jul 2017 )

Vehicle Make: NISSAN ‘(\'] Q " .2\”. @ a — é\’ 7«? \5&';.\, ;
Vehicle Model: MARCH 1.4C S

Primary Colour: Yellow

Manufacturing Year: 2005

Engine No.: CR14044048A

Chassis No.: BK12724040

Maximum Power Qutput:

72.0 kW (96 bhp)

Open Market Value: $14,170.00
Original Registration Date: 20 Oct 2005
First Registration Date: 20 Oct 2005
Transfer Count: 2

Actual ARF Paid: $15,587.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Forfeited
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

19 Oct 2020

A - Car (1600cc & below)

COE Period(Years): b

PQP Paid: $28,399.00
COE Rebate Amount: $18,489.00
Total Rebate Amount: $18,489.00

Message

Please note that the 5-year COE for this vehicle cannot be further renewed. The vehicle must be de-registered upon COE expiry or when the
vehicle reaches its statutory lifespan (if applicable), whichever is earlier.

The information contained herein is correct as at 17 Jul 2017
| OK |

Land Transport Authority
Please read through the Privacy Statement, Terms of Use and Disclaimer.
Please do not use the Back or Forward buttons on your browser as this may alter the results of the transactions.
‘ Best viewed with |IE 6.0 SP3 and above. 1024 X 768 resolution
Copyright © 2017 LTA | Privacy Statement | Terms of Use | Disclaimer | Rate the Website | Rate this e-Service
Last updated on 01 Jul 2017 at 12:50 AM
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Used March Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 1

Al
jSGLz_\RMART.COM SGCARMART = :
{EOKLY PLACE FOR SMART CAR BUYERS AP DOWNLOAD Al Seprc
HOME NEW CARS USED CARS SELL CARS MOTOR DIRECTORY PRODUCT GUIDE ARTICLES FORUM TOOLS & TIPS
'FREE HELP R SRR
FOR DIRECT BUYERS & SELLER o " SRENG BOrERS b3 SebmiES)

100% FREE SETTLEMENT ON LOANS, INSURANCE & PAPEﬂWC!Rt{

= Nissan S BA er Sal E TIL 0872021
Post an Advertisement issan Sunny 1.6A Super Saloon (CO! ! i

Sell it yourself! Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

1 CERTIFIED PRE-OWNED
MERCEDES-BENZ

Direct Owner Stara

Ways of Selling

SRR EEE L L]

Browse by Category So-rtibyj Détp Pgste& ::m_] 20 résuitsfpage 'L.

3 vehicles March advanced Search M) Submit (
lake Model Price Depreciation Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Statur
Search Selection  March Any Any 2z muﬁ"’r“} Any Any Any Available
Nissan March 1.0A (COE till $26,800 $6,770 /yr 20-Dec-1996 998 cc = Hatchback Available
06/2021)

All Our Cars Have Undergone A 120 Point Check At Qur Veery Own Workshop Before Being Parked At Our Showroom So That We Make Sure You Are
Buying A Great Car! Buy With Trust And Assurance! Expect Cnly Ho...

& Datails

Posted: 13002017 Tags: 1996 Nissan March, Nissan March, Nissan, March, Used Nissan

Nissan March 1.4C (COE till $37,800 $7,920 fyr 24-Apr-2007 1,386 cc - Hatchback Available
04/2022)

All Our Cars Have Undergane A 120 Point Check At Qur Very Own Workshop Before Being Parked At Our Showroom So That We Make Sure You Are
Buying A Great Car! Buy With Trust And Assurance! Expect Only Ho...

g Details
07-2ui-2017 Tags: 2007 Nissan March; Nissan March, Nissa h, Uset Nissan
Nissan March 1.4C (COE till $22,800 $8,770 [yr 22-Feb-2005 1,386 cc 123,000 km Hatchback Available
02/2020)
Most Wear And Tear Replaced. Genuine Mileage. Zero Mishap, Evaluation Welcome. Owner Consignment Unit. Viewing By Appointment.
5 Mssan March, Nissan March, Nisgan, March, Usad Nissan REE
Save this search criteria, to get email alerts whenever a match is found.
MaKe Model Price Depreciation Reg D Eng Cap Mileage Veh Type Sty
. . =1
For old advertisements, view Expired ads 20 | ¥ | results/page

sgCarMart is the number one car classifieds for paraliel import cars, Toyota, Honda, Nissan, Mitsubishi & BMW. There are plenty of cars for sale, from vans, trucks, sedan cars, luxury cars,

Sy, MPV, hatchback, to COE tars & OPC cars. You can also buy from a car auction, look up car loans, low mileage cars, car brands, carpark rates & car insurance Find bi

sed March, used vehicles Singapore or even buy used March Singapore. We have new car dealers comprising paraliel importers. authorised car dealers,

used
nd new car price

s, new car launches and hew car promotions, Visit our partner sites for job openings for Singapore jobs, massage services, real estate properties for sale, mover, car

g & COE results.

arts, car discussion, forum discussion, commercial vehi

65 and other information displayed on sgCarMart.com aie gathered from sources and based on algorithms that are believed by sgtarMart.com to be reliable, but no assurance can be given that this

sn s accurale, complete or current. sgCarMart.com does not assume any respansibility for errors or omissions or warrant the accuacy of this information
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@© 2004-2017 sgCarMart. All rights reserved.
* Terms of Service
* Privacy Policy
* Personal Data Protec

Compare

http://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=10&MOD=Marc... 17/7/2017



