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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregnetessorissn)
51 Ubi Ava 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tal: G256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email sur@ikkauto.com;assighments@ikkauto.com

To: ECICS Limited Fram: LKK Auto Consultanis Pie Lid
10 Eunos Road B 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25
#09-044A Singapore Post Centra Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408600 Singapore 408933
Altn: Date: 28 Nov 2019
Preliminary Advice
Insured Vishicle No : BLJ40135
TP Vehicle Mo : SLWATOC Accident Date 02Mmnroie
Wk : HONDA CIVIC Assignment Date 0712019
Date of Inspection : DBIM/2018 Est. Duration of Repair . 5.00
Inspaction At : 5&H MOTOR PTE LTD (HQ)
BLK 11201-83 SIN MING ROAD, SIN MING INDUSTRIAL ESTATE
SINGAPORE 575655

Paint of Impact | General Description of Damages
‘rhnuhbciemuimdlmpactfdnmnguwsmmudrpmnmﬂpmunhlwudmmnllmthmm“

Rapairer's Estimate (Gross) ‘5% 8,458.90
Revised Amount 5% 6.722.20
Check ltems (Estimated) 55 0.00
Total 55 §,722.20
Lump Sum Repair 55 5,350.00
Total Loss Consideration

Mew for Old Value 5%

Pre-Accident Valua 85

COE ! PARF Rabate 8§

Salvage Valua 8%

Margin for Repair 5%

{ ) Thnvuh‘.dnhrmnimmmwrmymnmm.ﬁamuuhnmﬁm-nmnmmm.mwhlmm
your guthorisation,

{ }  The vehicle Is uneconomical to ba repaired, you are advised to Invite tender far the wreck.

{ = } Other comments - Survey on wp



Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Elizabeth Chew Ming Lai (ECICS, Claims) <Elizabeth_Chew®ecics.comsg>

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 4:10 PM

To: Enquiry

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR; assignments

Subject: RE: Accident involving our vehicle no : SLW4170C claiming TP vehicle no : SL/40135
D.O.A 02/11/2019 ECICS REF: DMPC1900281H

Attachments: VID-20191102-WADQ08. mp4

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

SAVE AS TO COSTS

Dear Ms Wong,

We refer to the above matter.

Without prejudice to any other related claims we agree to have a direct settlement with your company on behalf of
our insured, subject to our surveyor's recommendation on costs of repair and number of days for LOU/LOR. As for
gquantum on the LOU/LOR we follow the NIMA Protocol Benchmark.

Kindly forward us all the supporting document to enable us to consider your client’s claim,
Aside to LKK, please refer to the below email and conduct PRI.
We shall forward the documents to you shortly.

Besl regards
Elizabeth Chew

AVP | Claims
e
i!':ufﬂ”( &

DID (85) 6303 0182 Tel (65) 6337 4778

Emall gl Web www scics com sg
Address 10 Eunos Road 8, Singapore Post Centre, #08-044, Singapore 408600,

From: Enquiry [mailto;enquiry@sh-motor.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 November 2019 10:44 AM

To: Elizabeth Chew Ming Lai (ECICS, Claims)

Subject: Accident invalving our vehicle no : SLW4170C claiming TP vehicle no : 5LJ4013S D.O.A. 02/11/2019
Dear Elveabeth,

\s per requested. pls see anuched video footage for vour perusal.

Thanks & Best Regands.

Ms W Ol
SEHMOTORPTE LTD



160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singupore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

From: Wong [mailto:wong@sh-motor.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 10:06 AM

To: 'elizabeth_chew@ecics.com.sg'

Subject: Accident involving our vehicle no : SLW4170C claiming TP vehicle no : SLJ4013S D.O.A. 02/11/2019

Dear Elizabeth,
Kindly check whether did your Insured make any report and what is the status of liability?
Thanks & Best Regards,

Ms Wong

S&H MOTOR PTE LTD

160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02
Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

Tel: 6453 4730 Fax: 6457 1931

This message may contiain privieged and confidential information Bnd I8 onty intanded for use by Ihe addresses. Mo represantation, warrenty, guarantes or undertaking
expressed of imphed (s made by ECICS Limited, a9 to the fmmess. accuracy of compietaness of any infarmation, projections or ogirmons contsined in this message. Any
unputherired dacioaure, use o Sasemnption aither 1n whole or in pan is peohitied, If you sre not the addresses indicated in his message (or responsible for dedivery of
e MESSAQH 10 Such parmon), you may not copy or daliver this message 1o anyone, in such cass, you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply
email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinlona of the sandar and da not necessarlly represent the views of ECICS Limited
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vahicle Owner Particulars

Owrier 1D Type: Singapore MRIC

Owner (D EO7F

Vehicle Detalls

Vehide Ma. LW LTOC
Vehicle to be Exported: e

|ntended Deregistration Date: 0d Nov 2019

Vehicke Make: QPEL

Viehicle Model: INSIGNIA GRANDSPORT B1ADTH
Primary Calour: Sllver

Manufacturing Year 2017

EngineNo: A2172858GKCX0404
Chassin No WOVZMAEFX 11069131
Pelanimum Power Outpot: 100.0&W (134 bhal
Open Markst Value: $26.980.00

Original Registration Date: 09 Feb 20118

First Registration Date: 0% Feb 2018

Transter Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: §2%772.00

Intended PARF Rebate Detalls

PARF Eligibility: Yirs

PARF Eligibll ity Expiry Date 0 Feb 2028

PARF Rebate Amount: §22329.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Espiry Date: 08 Feb 2028

COE Category: E - Open - all except motorcyche
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Pald: $44.000.00

COE Rehate Amount: $34, 12800

Total Rebate Amount £56,457.00

The infarmatian contalned herein b6 correct as at 04 Nov 2019

OK



S&H

Motor e Lid

TEO TAT YONG File No

BLK 130A #19-510 Date 07-November-2019
LORONG | TOA PAYOH

SINGAPORE 311130

Estimated cost of repair for vehicle no: SEW4170C 'OPEL
Accident involving vehicle no: SEW4170C & SLJ4013S an 02-November-2019

Description Quantity List Price
% sos00 —

Lh front fender 1 s
LH front fender signal lamp 1 s Jet 17500 —
LH front fender wheel cowling | $ Sy 185.00 —
LH front fender wheel cowling clips | s T o3s00
Front bumper 1 5 41 1.795.0) ~—
LH bumper retainer | s s 18000 —
LH head lamp [ s 1.250.00 o
LH front bumper parking sensor I s T 3m0.00 X
LH alloy wheel (torcheck) ! S, e gs0.00 —
LH wheel bearing (te-eheek) 1 Ay ( P gonon A~
LH knuckle arm (tocheek- 1 s S soom 7
LH front bumper bottom rubber i s T jes00 X
Wheel cowling and gamish clips @ set | s M 3300 —
Front LH door front rubber (s-echeel) 1 s fi. 28500 ;(
s 7,951.00
Less 10% 5 795,10
s 7,155.90
Labour to panel beating LH front door and respray damaged areas ! s Is0.00 &
To spray punting front bumper . LLH front fender and bonnet . and accident 1 s m.uud;"(
damaged arcas
To check and reset front wheel and steering alignment. 1 s 65.00 “—
Labour to check LH front suspension , to remove , install and repair front knuckle , i s 2000 oy
front wheel bearing.
To remove and remnstall LH front tyre 1 s 18.00
Vor Aurs oV
/4!&”& g*/ﬂ:ﬁ $
T/Party: ECICS LIMITED
5#:’* 7

Lthy 8 53544

Page 1 of |

Workshop: 160 Sin Ming Drive #07-02, Sin Ming AutoCity, Singapore 575722. Tel: 64534730 Fax: 84571931 E-mail: enquiry@sh-motor.com
Co. Reg. No.; 196701322K  GST Reg. No.. M2-0076268-0



Adjuster Report

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (ce reqne 19sso718m)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: BB44-8805 Emall: sur@lkkaulo com;assignments@ikkaulo.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Page | of 4

Our File No: CS/ICS180187TI/KTDINZ
Date: 28112019
REFERENCE
Handling . ;
e ECICS Limited Policy No:
Claimant ;
Vehicle No : SLw41T0C Insured Vehicle No : SLJ0138
Date of Loss:  02/11/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: DMPC1900281H
DESCRIFTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SLW41T0C
Make & Model: Tobe (g CNA GRANDSPORT BIEDTH. 18 gngine No:  A2172858GKCX0404
Reg. Date: DB8/0272018 (Man. Year 2017) Chassis No: WOVZMBEFXJ1069131
Colour: Metallic Light Blua Odometer: 4T4T1 km
Engine Capacity: 1588 cc
Market Value/Mew Car NIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Stearing (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 245/45R18 Rear Tyre Size: 245/45R18
Front Lelt Side; Hankook 7 mm Rear Left Side: Hankook 7 mm
Front Right Side: Hankook 7 mm Rear Right Side: Hankook 7 mm
The sbowe values represent s smairing hes eads oepth
COST OF CLAIMS Rapairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Pars 7.1565.90 5,659.20 1,496.70 20.92
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.303.00 1.063.00 240.00 168.42
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) B,458.90 B6,722.20 1,7T36.7T0 20.53
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 5,350.00
(S%) B.458.90 5,350,00 3,108.90 36.75
+ GST 7.00/T7.00% (S%) 59212 3r4.50 217.62 36.75
Nett Amount (S§) 9,051.02 5,724.50 3,326.52 36.75
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: ori11r2019
Date Inspected: 08/11/2019 Inspected At: S&HMOTOR PTELTD

Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days

160 SIN MING DRIVE

#O7-02 SIN MING AUTOCITY

SINGAPORE 575722

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG

Manager: DEMNISE TAY KWEE CHENG

https://singapore.menmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 28/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

NOTE: This report represants our findings at the time and piace of inspection siated harsin. Such inapection has been carmiad out fo Ine beat of our
knowisdge and abidily Dul any other habyity undar amy offier CIrcamEBnces 5 heraby arpressly escluged,

hitps://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 28/11/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised; 28 Nov 2019)

Parts; 143 OPEL INSIGNIA GRANDSPORT B160DTH 1.6 Turbo (A) (Calalogue:Merimen Singapore
1.0)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLW4170C)

Validity: These eslimales are valid only if they contain the prinl code (above) on all estimatle pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimale page

Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslerisk *

Recommended Parts

*LH KNUCKLE ARM

*LH FRONT BUMPER BOTTOM RUBBER

*SET WHEEL COWLING AND GARNISH CLIPS
14 "FRONT LH DOOR FRONT RUBBER

FaFranchise part. L=LisitemDisc

No. Qty Part No. Particulars
1 1 *LH FRONT FENDER
| 1 *LH FRONT FENDER SIGNAL LAMP
3 1 *LH FRONT FENDER WHEEL COWLING
4 1 *LH FRONT FENDER WHEEL COWLING CLIPS
5 1 “FRONT BUMPER
B 1 *LH BUMPER RETAINER
7 1 *LH HEAD LAMP
8 1 *LH FRONT BUMPER PARKING SENSOR
G 1 *LH ALLOY WHEEL
10 1 ‘LH WHEEL BEARING
"M 1
12 1
1
1

Condition

Bent
Scralched
Distorted
Necessary
Buckled
Distorted
Ccut
Serviceahle
Danted
Bent/Jammed
Serviceable
Serviceable
Necessary
Serviceable

Sub Total (S§)

- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (5%)

Total Parts (58)

Repairer's

B85.00FL
175.00FL
185.00FL
35.00FL
1,785.00FL
180.00FL
1,250.00 FL
380.00FL
850.00FL
BB0.00FL
BOD.OOFL
188.00 FL
33.00FL
285.00FL
7,951.00
79510

7,155.90

Amount

*895 00 FL
*175.00 FL
*185.00FL
*35.00FL
*1.795.00 FL
*180.00FL
*1,250.00 FL
“-FL
*850.00 FL
*890.00 FL
*-FL

“.FL
*33.00FL
-FL

6,288.00
628.80

| Ropaort was unsubmitied dur!rng this print-out.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 28/11/2019



Adjuster Repont Page 4 of 4

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 LABOUR TO PANEL BEATING LH FRONT DOOR AND New 350.00 350.00
RESPRAY DAMAGED AREAS

2 TO SPRAY PAINTING FRONT BUMPER,LH FRONT MNaw 850.00 600.00
FENDER AND BONNET AND ACCIDENT DAMAGED
AREAS

3 TO CHECK AND RESET FRONT WHEEL AND STEERING New 65.00 65.00
ALIGNMENT

4 LABOUR TO CHECK LH FRONT SUSOENSION.TO MNew 220.00 30.00

REMOVE, INSTALL AND REPAIR FRONT
KNUCKLE FRONT WHEEL BEARING

5 TO REMOVE AND INSTALL LH FRONT TYRE New 18.00 18.00

Gross Labour Cost (55) 1,303.00 1.063.00

Report was unsubmitted dunngﬂiﬂ print-out |

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 28/11/2019



