" Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg cntaiping.com:

Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 7:25 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto), Admin A

Cc Chee So Chow; Irene Tay; Alfred Toh; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM190205267-SLZ2815Z-THP- Accident Invalving SLZ2815Z (O] : CTI -
TBA) and SHD2649A (TP : LKK REF -CC&/CTI19019762/eb3 } on 06.11.2019

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF - CC6/CTI19019762/eb3
CTPIS REF —SNM19D205267C02/thp

Dear Asher
You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 57,881.36.

We await your payment advice to enable our Irene to act accordingly

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Email; claimsde .cntaiping.com
alfred.tohi@sg.cntaiping.com
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: XJEW Taiping SG

Disciaimer: This e-mail and any fites transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information,
Any unauthorired disclosure. use or dissemination of this message. alther in whole or partial, (s prohibited. If you are not the intended recipiant,
plaasa notify the sender immediately. Please delele the e-mail and any copies of I thereafter.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Monday, 16 December, 2019 2:08 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CT1 <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205267-5LZ2815Z-THP- Accident Involving SLZ28152 (01 : CTI - TBA) and SHD2649A (TP :
LKK REF -CC6/CT119019762/eb3 ) on 06.11.2019

Your ref : SNM19D205267-5L22815Z-THP

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter,

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 is

applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured's favour,
We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.
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- We seek your approval to offer repairer " PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE LTD" at 57,881.36 (all-in).

The summary Is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) 510,701.84 5 7,046.56
2. Loss of Rental {6days x $138.80) 5 B32.80 5 832.80 (bdays x $138.80)
3. LTA Search Fee S 2.00 5 2.00

Total 57,881.36

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal,

For your approval please,

Thank You.

Best Regomd
Asher Sng | Code Hanciles
LEK Auvio Consullants Pte Lid

phone: 454 |-8051 | emal: gshesngahkkautg com | fax 674 1-4108

Bl 51 Peotwd LB Inchisiiol Park. L Avenue | 802-25 | 5[408%33)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 4:49 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg cntaiping.coms

Cc: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205267-5LZ2815Z-THP- Accident Involving SLZ2B15Z (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SHD2649A (TP :
LKK REF -CC&/CTI19019762/eb3 ) on 06.11.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair

Preliminary advice

Thank you.



* Best Regards,
Shu Pel| Admin
LKN Auto Consultants Pre Ltd
Phone: 5366-0055 | emall: shupei@lkkauto com | fan: 5741-4108
Bik 51. Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1 #02-25 | S[408933)

From: Irene Tay <irene tay@sg.cntalping com>

Sent: Friday, 8 November 2019 9:52 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@ikkauto com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <Ashe kauto.com>

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM19D205267-5LZ2815Z-THP- Accident Involving SLZ2B15Z (01 : CT1 - TBA) and SHD2649A (TP :
LKK REF -CC6/CT119019762/eb3 ) on 06.11.2019

Dear Mdm,

Enclosed herewith our insured GIA REPCRT for your attention
Regords.

Irene Tay

Exacutive

Clgims Department [Motor Division)

China Toiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleat Tower Singapore 079909
DID: [65) 63896192 | Fil65) 62247478/62247175

W: www.sg cntaiping.com | FB: www.locebook comichinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & T WHR Taipinag 5G

Disclaimer: This &-mail and any files fransmitted with it is infended only for the nomed recipients and may
cantain confidential information. Any unauthorzed disclosure. use or dissemination of this message. either in
whole or partial, is probibited. If you are nof the intended recipient. please nofify the sender immediately,
Flegse delere e e-mail and any copies of it thersafter

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Thursday, November 7, 2019 5:36 PM

To: Irene Tay <irene. tay(@sg cntaiping. com=>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntalping.coms>; Shu Pei (LKKAuto)
<shupel@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng [LKKAuto) <AsherSng@kkauto cams

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D205267-5L22815Z-THP- Accident Involving SLZ2815Z (Ol : CT1 - TBA) and SHD2649A (TP : LKK
REF -CC6/CTI19019762/eb3 | on 06.11.2019

Dear Irene,
Please revert LKK.

Note : officer in charge = Irene Tay 63896192,

Reqards
Claims Depariment



. China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Spningleal Tower Singapore 078809
T: (65) 63886116 | F (65) 62247175

W: www sq cntaiping.com | FB: www facebook com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: & "% ¥ Taiping SG

Digciaimes This e-miwi and a@ny files ransmified with o & arhended only for the named recipreats snd may contisn oonficential nformabon Any
snguihomed disciosure use or dissamination of ihis massags aahar in whoke or partial 8 profdited. i you am nal e ntended mopent. plsexe nobify
the sender immeadiately. Please oeleta e e-mail and any cogues of o fhoaoealfer

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@|kkauto. com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 November, 2019 4:23 PM

Ta: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred toh@sg cntaiping com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
<AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SLZ2B15Z (01 ; CT1 - TBA) and SHD2649A (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI19019762/eb3 | on 06.11.2019

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have received a new assignment from M/s Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd and TP repairer proposed for a
direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP's GIA report

Please be informed that preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Asher and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 6051.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Agmin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6366-0055 | email; shupei@ikkauro.com | fax: 6741-4 108
Blk 51, Paya Lbi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit hitp:/www, symanteccloud. com
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Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
GST Reg. No . 201606560M

6 Benoi Place Singapore 629927

Tel: 6861 0908 Fax: 6515 2648

PRIME GROU=

Prate: 19112019

e mf: SHI2GA9A .l'{"]i_'_-_"dcd
Your Rel: S1.728157

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte i

3 Anson Road # | 6-00 Withow prejudice
Springleal Tower lFax: 6224 7175
Singapare 079909

Aun: Motor Claims Dept

Dear Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 06,1 1.2009 INVOLVING VEHICLES SHD2649A & SLZ2RISY

We are on behall of M/S Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Ple Lud the owner of vehicle
SHD2649A in their third party claim against your insured - driver of SLZ2BIS/

Appended below our elient’s ¢laim:-

|. Cost of repair $ 7044650
2 Loss of rental @ $138 80 x 6 Jays (nel. | Sun) $ 83280
3, GIA search Fee 5 2 01}

Lol ST.REL 36

We enclosed Herewith our invoice 4638, GIA search receipr. letier of authority & Letter of
Certification for your retention, Please ackeowledge receipt.

I'or amicable setthement, please et us have your olfer
Regords

Yours faithfully.

Alice | .u(“_llg
F-mail: aliceleong i primeaytoclims.comm

nicl



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAutD)

Sent: Maonday, 11 November 2019 11:45 AM

To: BEN. TEO®CAMELNUTS.COM

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 2815Z AND SHD 26494 ON 06/11/2019

Our Ref: CCo/CTTI9019762Eehd

11 NOV 2019

SENG HUA HNG FOODSTUFF PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLZ 2815Z AND SHD 2649A ON 06/11/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie Lid to resolve
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident repont and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish 10 further discuss on the matter prior 1o our negotiations and settlement, please contact
us within 10 days from the date of this letter,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersne @ lkkauto.com

ee. China Tuiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre Lid
(Maror Claims Depr)



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To: PRIME AUTO CLAIMS SERVICE PTE. LTD.

Re: ACCIDENT ON 06.11.2019 INVOLVING SHD2649A & S1LZ28157
ALONG AIRPORT BOULEVARD

I/ We, M/S PRIME CAR RENTAL & TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD hereby authorized you to
carry out repairs of the damage caused to my / our vehicle no. SHD2649A in the above

accident.

I/ We further also conlirm and agree that all sums of money to be recovered by vou on my/ our
behalf shall be paid to you. I/ We hereby also authornise the third party insurer to release to you

such sums of money recovered on my / our bekalf.

S A\
L |

Signature (Company s stamp if applicable)
Name:
NRIC:



MOTOR_CIATHS D1SCHARGE VOUCIHER
Folicy No ¢ BMPCENIB1642190] Slaim Mo : SXMISDZO52E7COR/Chp
Claimant ¢ PFRIME CAR WENTAL & TAX] SENVICES PTE LTD
Amorants i 557,881,586

DOLLARS SEVEN THOUSAND EIGHT WHUNDRED BIGHTY ONE AND CENTS
THIRTY 51X ONLY.

I/Me agrie to accept the above menticnsd smmount o be mmld to mefus in full &
final settlement of all claims, coats & diaborsements for dnjuries / damagea

sustained by me/fus through an sccidunt involving

Claimant Vehicls MHe. @ SHD 264BA
Insured Vehicle Wa. = 3EX 28152

Dare of Loss : Q871172035
Place of Accident : AIRPORT BOULEVARD

TN CONSIDERATION of thne paymont madn to mesus of Etho aforomentioned. sum by
CHIKNA TAIPING INSURANCE (STNGAPORE) FTE. LTD., 1/We agreec ebsolutely o
discharge CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (STNGARCOHE) PTE. LTD. and/ior

Tnpurod Wemo 1 SENG HUA HNG YOODSTIUFFT PFTF 27D
Delves Nt oAl QLAN MU pEAR T

from all claims, proesent or foture in resppect of all loas, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the ssld sc=ident .

I acknowimdge tha: this payment is made without admission of liabllity on the
part of CHINMA TAEPING INISURANDE ISINMGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) Ganeral Damages 33
i2) Cost of Bapalir/Sxesss 5% 1, 046.56
{1} Loss of Use/Rental/Earning 5% B32.80
i1) GIA/Police Repocts/
Inveatigation Rosulos/Scarch Foos 55 2.00
%) Madical Beports/Expeonnes 55
18) Survey Fess/Towing FeciDlskyrsiment 29
iT) Cost including Disbursesept =8
TOTAL o & o s % o % s o » & & o a0 5B T.881.36

=

Efimimant Hame - PEIME CAR RENTAL-—& TAKI SEPVICER DL HREC %o 3 1OOG0£393%

&
Sigmatire i %

Dato 1 I?h’:{ﬁ_

“ The contents of this document apply to
vehicles damages only. All personal
injuries and damages arising therefrom
are excluded from the ambit and
application of this document”



TAX INVOICE NO.: 4581
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd
6 Bano Place Singapore 6288927
Tel 6861 0808 Fax 6515 2848
GS5T Reg. No; 201606560M
Ran No. 201806560M
MESSRS  CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD DATE: LS11/2019
3 A Road WORKS ORDER NO : 4638
#16-00 Springleaf Tower VEHICLE NO ; SHD2649A
SINGAPORE (079909
ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Make! Model : TOYOTA CAMRY
Repur Date : 6112019
Terms of Pavment - 7 DAYS
THIRD PARTY CLAIMS
TO SUPPLY
1 1 PC REAR BUMPER COVER 4 127350
2 1 PC REAR. BUMPER LOWER COVER £ 56,58
3 1 PC REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT b ] 20284
4 1 PC REAR BOOT LID b 1 1130 69
5 1 PC REAR BOOT LID WEATHERSTRIP 1 17483
[ 1 PC REAR BOOT LID LOCK $ 65 TR
7 1 PC REAR BOOT LID "TOYOTA" EMBLEM 1 6B 00
8 1 PC REAR BOOT LID *"HYBRID SYNERGY" $ 5500
EMBLEM
9 1 PC RIGHT REAR TAIL LAMP COVER 1 137
10 | PC LEFT REAR TAIL LAMP COVER $ 1127
11 1 PC REAR END PANEL b 54037
12 1 PC REAR END PANEL GARNISH b 1 I180.22
SEIRT-33140-C0
13 1 PC LUGGAGE COMPARTMENT DOOR STICKER b1 25,70
COVER 64749-33030-C0
14 | PC SPARE WHEEL COVER 64770-33140-C1 s 46751
15 1 PC SPARE WHEEL COVER TRAY 5 457 40
6477033260
6 | PC EXHAUST TAIL PIPE BUFFLE $ 199,80
Emtﬁnmd w FE“ mn:t;rt of 1% per month
ROUNDING ADJ 5 0.03
NEXT PAGE ...



TAX INVOICE
Prime Auto Claims Service Pte Ltd

& Banoi Place Singapore 620927
Tel. 6861 0908 Fax 6515 25948
GST Reg No: 201606560M

Reg No. 201806580M

NO.: 4581

MESSRS CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD DATE 1/11/2010
3 A Road WORKS ORDER NO : 4638
#16-00 Springleaf Tower VEHICLE NO - SHD2649A
SINGAPORE 079909
ITEM DESCRIFTION UNITPRICE  AMOUNT
BALANCE BF $ 5,676.76
Make/ Model . TOYOTA CAMRY
Repair Date  &@1172019
Terms of Payvment TDAYS
17 LESS 25% DISCOUNT $ -1419.19
TO SUPPLY SNETT PARTS
18 | SET REVERSE SENSOR s 200,00
19 | SET FLOOR PAN SEALANT % 30.00
20 | SET REAR BUMPER CLIPS 1 30,00
21 | PC REAR NO PLATE $ 3800
n | PC "PRIME TAXI" STICKER 5 55.00
yi) | PC "PRIME LIMOUSINE® STICKER $ 35.00
LABOUR CHARGES
24 TOWING CHARGES (USE KING-TROLLEY) s 100.00
25 TO TUFF KOTE s 40.00
26 TO REMOVE & REPLACE RECERSE SENDOR & $ 5000
ELECTRICAL KEY ANTENA, CHECK WIRING.
17 TO TRANSFER REAR BOOT LID TRIM BOARD & s 50,00
MECHANISM PARTS.
8 $ 900.00
TO REMOVE REAR BUMPER, REARE BOOT LID, CUT / WELDING END
FANEL, FLOOR PAN & REFLACE THE AEOVE PARTS. ADJUST % ALIGH
REAR BUMFER & REAR BOOT LID.
29 s £00.00
TC PUTTY, ERESPRAY PAINTING REAR BUMPER, REAR BOOT LID IMLET &
DUTER; END PANEL, FLOOPR PANEL. TC POLISH.
S 1,940.00
* Compound interests at the rate of 1% per month SUB TOTAL 5 .57
will be charged on late payment ” GST ™% 5 ﬁ'ﬁ?m
ROUNDING ADJ % -0.03
TOTAL § 704656

PREPAREDEY

1 S
mamuwmm



‘ PRIME CAR RENTAL
| & TAXI SERVICES PTE LTD

Co. Cert. No: 1996062932
Gst Reg. No: 19-9606293-Z

Your Rel : Please advise Our Ref: SHD26494
Date :12.11.2019
To : Whom It May Concern
From : Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Lid
. RE: LETTER OF CERTIFICATION FOR MR. TAN KOK YEOW

This letter serves to confirm that Mr, Tan Kok Yeow, Nric Number S1696158B is a
Taxi Master for Prime Car Rental & Taxi Services Pte Ltd hiring the Vehicle Number
SHD2649A at a daily rate ol Singapore Dollar One Hundred and Thirty Eight and Cents
Eighty ($138.80) Only.

Should clarification require | can be contacted at 94524182,

Thank vou with Best Regards

L

Yours Sincerely »
i / \

Vd .

............................

Mr. Lim Huan Hiang
Waorkshop Manager



MTROS

GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Involce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operaling Hours: Monday to Friday 8am 1o 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ral No: GR-18-183928

Date of Request: arr2oTe Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Prime Auto Claims Service Pie Lid
& Benol Place
Singapore 6249927

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enguiry Date o7/112019

naquiry By Chrissy Teo Ye En
Vehicle No. SLZ2B15Z

Accident Date 06/11/2019

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insuror Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No
SLZ28152 China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd 27/0472018-26/04/2020 63Ba 611
Thank You.

The images provided to you ane taken from the ariginal reparts forearded to the cantre by the mambers of the General Insurance Association af
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their sccuracy of contents and shall be under no linbility whatsoever for any loss or damage ansing out of

of in connechon with the repars or their IMagos.

‘5 is a computer generated document and requires no signature

hitps Msingapore.menmin. cam/caimsingex clmMusebox-MTRsas8luscaction=dsp genimvipArafid=23387158CFID=62085801 ACFTOKEN=e73.
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"GENERAL
INSURANCE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Cur Raf No; GR-19-183928
Date of Request: QrN1/2019

Prime Auto Claims Service Pio Lid
& Beno| Place

Irvoce

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raflles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
GST Regsiration No; MADD0TTT35

TAX INVOICE

Your Ral Na: Oinline Purchase

Singaporo 629927

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Dato 0711/2018

Enguiiry By Chnssy Teo Ye En

Vehicle No. S5L.7228152

Accident Date 06/11/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87

GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Tharik You.

This is a computer genorated document and requires no signalure

For GIARMC Official use:

Date:

|X] GIRO [ ] Cash [ | Cheque
r'ltrnl'mmnanuru.menmn.mmfclnm'lmr.chn?'rumbm—-MTRﬁsuhmnmn==uapganmmﬁmﬂd=?33&?15&t:Fll‘J=ﬂ?ﬂ&5&UI.IH:FI‘GKEN-=?3 212



