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Bt Wm Pre Lo Company Ragistratian No. 199607 198R

S1UHEAVE 1, S02-2%5 PAYA LB INDUSTHRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE JO8933 TEL @ (Id5) 62563501 FAX 1 (045) 2564315

Yourref:  To Be Advised Date: 08.11.2019
Our ref: CCHLPC19019746/Khb3

The Motor Claims Department

Mis LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

Dear Sin'Madam,

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. GBHS171R
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 07.11.2019

at the premises of M/s Tong Luck Auto Pre Ltd and have the following to report:-
Workshop Estimate Amount ' 5% 4,863.20

Revised Estimate Amount : 55 2,993.20

"Check” Items Amount : 8% 680.00

Marker Value : 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value ' 5% -

Nett Value : 5% -

Descripuon of Damage: e —
The vehicle sustained damages at the

/S Frant portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4  days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



MS :DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT S'PORE PTE LTD
1 GATEWAY DRIVE
#1508 WESTGATE TOWER
SINGAPORE BDB531
TEL 68498118 FAX -
ATTN - ACCOUNTS DEPT s? Asth >
Pty A £
YOUR REF NO
CLAIM TYPE THIRD PARTY
TP INS. CO. LONPAC INSURANCE BHD ;’&fj

ACCIDENT DATE @ 0111172019
TP VEH REG NO . YNG515C

Estimate Repair Cost to Vehicle No : GBH5171R

ESTIMATE

DATE

POLICY NO
VEH REG NO
MAKEMODEL

L
*7 cHAsSSIS NO
ENGINE NO
REG. DATE

TONG LUCK AUTO PTE LTD

160 SIN MING DRIVE #07-01/08 SIN MING AUTOCITY, SINGAPORE 575722
Tel 6250 D0B8 Fax: 6250 5545
Email cperation@tlauto.com sg

GST No: 201700521W UEN No: 201700521W

L

PAGE: 1
: QUOT201911-000013(00)
06/11/2019
899995580
GBHBE1TIR

MERCEDES BENZ VITO 114
CD| PANEL VAN LONG AT ABS

S5DR

WDF44760323334100

: 65185034 1596832
2017

Description Quantity Unit Price Amount
11 5§
NET PRICE
1 Talllamp assy - RH 1 73300 €M) 73300 —
2 Talllamp lower garnish - RH i 14000 &*v 14000 ~—
3 Rear bumper 1 PGy | 24000 1.240.00 —=
4 Rear bumper clips 15 800 M 13500
2.248.00
Less 10% 224 .80
202320
SPECIAL NET
5 Rear bumper sensor (sel) 1 38000 fen 38000 X
380.00
LABOUR f
6 Toremove and refix rear bumper sensar 1 100.00 100.00 -
7 To check and rectify wiring system 1 §0.00 80.00 &f
B To panel beat and straighten RH rear fendar, RH laillamp panel 1 B00.00 800.00 _fﬂ,?,
RH rear chassis frame including replacement of parts and align
where necessary, to refit and adjust the same ﬁq?,
8 To putty and spray same on affected ameas 1 B00.00 800.00
10 To supply and paste logos/letterings on RH rear fendear 1 ( Aite ) 680.00 GBOO0 7k
2.460.00
TOTAL 5% 4,.863.20
ADDGST @ 7% 140 42
GRAND TOTAL 5% 5,202.682

SINGAPORE DOLLAR FIVE THOUBAND TWQO HUNDRED THREE AND CENTS SIXTY-TWO ONLY

FOR TONG LUCK AUTO PTE LTD

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE



Nivitha SLI{K Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 4:24 PM

To: Operation / Yu Ching; MT_Claim_SG; assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO: GBHS5171R & YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @
1540 HRS ALONG 415 ANG MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Qur Ref
19/19/19/VC05,/022601 .S 2p) 1@ £/ Il'jpl

Attachments: GBHS171R - NOAPDF 4 r

viln A

Hi Nivitha

oﬂfuc( Ly on 300

Please arrange Kenneth Kong to conduct TP survey.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senlor Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

S —

The all ©%% lonpac.com.sg

From: Operation / Yu Ching [mailto:operation@tlauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 4:13 PM

To: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: GBH5171R & YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415
ANG MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref: 19/19/19/vC05/022601

Dear Li Li,

We hereby confirmed and agreed to nominate your Kenneth Kong to conduct the pre-repair inspection of our
client’s vehicle

Thanks & regards,
Yu Ching

fa

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive

#O7-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6250 DOB8 Fax: 6250 5545
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg

From: ONG LI Ll <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 6 November, 2019 3:34 PM




- To: Cperation / Yu Ching <gperation{@tlauto.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: GBH5171R & YNS515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415
ANG MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022601

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm

We Intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s
vehicle jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor
surveyors named in the following list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint
expert.

Kalvin Ang

Xing Guo Qiang
Mohamad Taufikh
Mohammed Rasul
Adrian Ling
Marcus Chua
Kenneth Kong
Bryan Ang
Nicholas Tey
Jackson Quek

O |w|om |~ |on|un |5 [l B =

—

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any
of these motor surveyors as a single joint expert.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

‘--* - The all (4% lonpac.com.sg

From: Operation / Yu Ching [mailto:operation@tlauto.com sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 3:01 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: GBH5171R £ YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415 ANG
MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK

Dear All,
We have our client's instruction to notify you the above accident

Please find attached documents for your attention and necessary action

2



‘Kindly let us have your surveyors list and arrange for the PRS of our client’s vehicle at an earlier date

Thanks & regards,
Yu Ching

oy

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive

#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6250 0088 Fax: 6250 5545
Email: cperation@tlauto.com.sg




Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

—_— Y = e ———
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpaccom=>
Sent: Saturday, 9 November 2019 11:40 AM
To: Shu Pel (LKKAUto)
Cc Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: GBH5171R & YNI515C ON 01/11/2019 @

1540 HRS ALONG 415 ANG MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref;
19/19/19/VC05/022601 [External Confidential]
Attachments: 09112019113719.pdf

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Shu Pei,

Attached copy of insured’s report for your attention.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

Lm
#‘ The all {¥w ) lonpac.com.sg
———e T r
‘ —

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Shu Pel (LKKAuto) [mallto:shupel@lkkauto,com]

Sent: Friday, B November, 2019 4:45 PM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.: GBH5171F. & YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415
ANG MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref: 19/19/19/vC05/022601

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We have inspected TP vehicle GBH 5171R at M/s Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd on a WP basis and TP repairer proposed
for a direct settlement.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice



Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

| ——

¥
#' r The all C¥% 3} lonpac.com.sg
s F

From: Operation / Yu Ching [mailto:operationi@tlauto.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November 2019 4:13 PM

To: ONG LI LI; MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.; GEH5171R & YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415 ANG
MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref: 19/19/19/vC05/022601

Dear Li LI,

We hereby confirmed and agreed to nominate your Kenneth Kong to conduct the pre-repair inspection of our client’s
vehicle

Thanks & regards,
Yu Ching

\

U

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive

#07-01/06 Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722

Tel: 6250 00B8 Fax: 62505545
Email: operation@tlauto.com.sg

From: ONG LI LI <llang@lonpac_com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 November, 2019 3:34 PM

To: Operation / Yu Ching <operation@tlauto.com.sg>; MT_Claim_5G <mt claim@lonpac com>

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO.;: GBH5171R & YN9515C ON 01/11/2019 @ 1540 HRS ALONG 415 ANG
MO KIO AVE 10 OPEN CARPARK Our Ref: 19/19/19/VC05/022601

Without Prejudice
Save as to Costs

Dear Sir/Mdm
We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's/your customer’s vehicle

jointly with your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors
named in the following list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

1 1 | Kalvin Ang |




. #07-D1/06 Sin Ming Autocity

Singapore 575722
Tel: 6250 O0BE  Fax: 6250 5545

Email: operation@tlauto.com sg

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW_3ve com



! ” ” LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

H#‘_. &1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Payn Ubi Indusinal Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6255 1581 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg No: 169607198R GST Reg No. 18-9607158-R

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD Rel : CCA4/LPC18018746/Khadn2

300 BEACH ROAD _
#17-04/07 THE CONCOURSESINGAPORE 100565 Do 27022020 I“I'III"“II“II

GBH51TIR

Insured Veh.
Policy No. Z19VC05003489 0.00
Claim No., 1818/18//C05/022601 Excess (§) 0.00

Assign From  GERALD Assign Date 06/11/2018

Fakimla E T N o |
Faniele Fralticuliarns o WUrmaisian

Make & Model MERCEDES BENZVITO 114 |e.c 2143

COI (A)
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. WODF44780323334100 Colour RED
Odometer 55211 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN CRDER Maodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM

R/H Front Tyre |215/60 R18 CONTINENTAL 8 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 9 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 CONTINENTAL 8 mm

215/60 R168 CONTINENTAL 9 mm

THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PCI

0209

Survey held at TONG LUCK AUTO PL

160 SIN MING DRIVE #07-01/08
SIN MING AUTOCITY
SINGAPORE 575722

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE” BASIS.
___ TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

""_j"._ AT Bl

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR " 4 Working Days




I 74 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Al A8 51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Uti Industrial Park, Singapore 408833
- TEL: B258 3581 FAX: 6258 4315

Reg. No. 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607188-R Page No./1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GBH 51T1R

1| TAILLAMP ASSY -RH (N} CRACKED ¥33.00 732.00
1| TAILLAMP LOWER GARNISH -RH (M) cut 140.00 140.00
1|REAR BUMPER (N) DENTED / CUT 1.240.00 1.240.00
15|REAR BUMPER CLIPS @58.00 (N) NECESSARY 135.00 135.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -224.80 -224 80
2,023.20 2,023.20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SET REAR BUMPER SENSOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 380.00
380.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND REFIX REAR BUMPER SENSOR . 100.00 50.00
TO CHECK AND RECTIFY WIRING SYSTEM. B0.00 20.00
TO PANEL BEAT AND STRAIGHTEN RH REAR 800.00 500,00
FEMDER ,RH TAILLAMP PANEL RH REAR CHASSIS
FRAME INCLUDING REPLACEMENT OF PARTS AND
;:L‘G;l WHERE NECESSARY .TO REFIT AND ADJUST THE
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY SAME ON AFFECTED AREAS, 800.00 400.00
TO SUPPLY AND PASTE LOGOS/LETTERINGS ON RH 680.00 400.00
REAR FENDER.
2.460.00 1.370.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,863.20 3,393.20

= e T e T ey ¥ -y
= Py R E R T E \E REPAIRS : M= i) l- EE
 RECOMMENDEDCOSTOFREPARS | | | 3393.20]

Report Rel No. CC4/LPC18018746/Kha3n2

Y 4vs

KONG SENG CHEONG
Licensed Appraiser

CHBCLAIMER OF LLARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES - This Mapart is mads salsly i the uss and enaiit of the Clisnt named on the g peags ol this Reper




