T T 1
G TR oo !
1 NPLARAR R /e W L -
[l !
n\ﬁhofﬂ B LA - 1
LSA I ‘] A | ‘I
2% June WX ‘ l
S T N AT TN I A LU Lipinkheey e
TP o0 BT CATT Y - e T A
IR R R
(1 kB skeesey it b e e
22 Jacuary FOE it T S N
| “
N Jewowga0\® \ i i . i
ot ] SRR 1
I T i ‘..im‘ :fu"..‘.‘"!ll\‘Ii-i,l;_“"l‘.:' i
i T LATN RS W Hh‘ ‘““'“M I"!I!!"‘-"-"! | i
: : b af iy l=|'
Py % ALK (G ':-U-‘l“ it TN
A
sl ittt
f L 1] A I.L A Wi
Rt “‘ v M L":\U[‘h-'{f"], AR . i “ W ' -|‘ | I
g T e b 4l
: B | Q‘)';:!‘“‘H"q” I illi "‘. y AEL i LRI L 1! £
y i lyeli ot EORUN
' I'”‘IIIH i e .;! JI‘J;! 3 ‘ I‘-‘ ; R
e ity {th kit :
find LA i g ‘
LA T e ill.." B g “‘_{ |
R R TR ] R L e
AT TR (L ”a]} ﬁﬁtw‘!.lmw i
EIL i ‘.,«,‘. e W ' 1&»‘!:"‘;"}‘!{}1"-&"'?.:' i
N T e R R it fi.lllf I A r{l !JH } ":ul‘i‘j‘irian:lﬁijz‘l;éwl‘\ :
L e B
; ! : & s SUTWH L (7 1) AR i mli r:im?g(‘j‘ Q.,f,:.:r;!,'ﬂw|'|fu i ; I'w !
R T AR TR L ';‘ ik -‘H ,‘l'lﬂlil‘”"\ !I'"”-l'“’l\l:%l
‘ el | ‘.- '.,\'._'_\ LR " \\ i yik
' | Hl i G TP 1 | i & fy
| o ! 4 i Gt i i) v | ! i
| STB AN | M fc1ampama W Do GG 2o ' !
| i I g
's f R i I"il‘ii:\},‘f";h{|\l.¥f
i 5 1wy i | ]
; ‘l ‘| I"
i |
1 1 H
| bl
i }‘ ; J 144 | ;
[} { i ‘ 3 l.‘l “I l ! L4 L
H’?"‘::l ” i "il‘":‘ﬂ\"‘l;]w‘ ) ik
[ | . Bt “'
i | R
L {
i

i

L% b R4

'

AR l-'i:.'.5)’.3:"?5‘.4"\""‘\“*}‘4'&1

RN

ey

i J;|“41 .li.: | ."I"‘;.‘,"ﬁ_l“!
M "I"‘h R



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

LY
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From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, June 29, 2017 11:48 AM

To: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV)-/GA048046
Dear Lynn,

The market value for SJB 7067H is $13K - $15K (EST) for Jun 2017

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]

Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 2:00 PM

To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg; cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK
Valuation; admin@Ibs-auto.com; kee @asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-/GA048046

This mail is associated with :
SJIB7067H
oD
Jun 23 2017 1:00PM
[YEEN PEI PEI RACHEL]
Charn's Customcraft
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to lynn.khong(@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address |

Sent by : Lynn Khong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From:’ Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>
Sent: Wednesday, June 28, 2017 2:00 PM
To: chowauto@singnet.com.sg; rta@rta.com.sg; admin@autoprobe.com.sg;

cynthia.ong@priorityservices.sg; LKK Valuation; admin®@Ibs-auto.com;
kee@asphoon.com; motorsurvey@fta.com.sg

Cc: lynn.khong@axa.com.sg
Subject: Checking Market Value (MV)-/GA048046
Attachments: Log card (if available).PDF

This mail is associated with :
SIB7067H
oD
Jun 23 2017 1:00PM
[YEEN PEI PEI RACHEL]
Charn's Customcraft
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to lynn.khong@axa.com.sg within 48 hours.
Thank you

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address |

Sent by : Lynn Khong (AXA Insurance Pte Ltd)



Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

é

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration
Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Qutput:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registraticn Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC

53277

SJB7067H

Yes

28 Jun 2017

KIA

KIA CARENS 2.0 A/T
Beige

2006
G4KABH306005
KNAFG521377063598
108.9 kW (146 bhp)
$17,599.00

22 Jan 2008

22 Jan 2008

: /'1)/ {f

$19,359.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: 21 Jan 2018

PARF Rebate Amount:

$9,679.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

21Jan 2018

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$15,989.00

$902.00

$10,581.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 28 Jun 2017

Please do not use the Back or Forward buttons on your browser as this may alter the results of the transactions.

SSRGS |

Land Transport

Dofy: 23/6 /2017

Authority

Please read through the Privacy Statement, Terms of Use and Disclaimer.
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