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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 16, 2017 12:13 PM

To: 'Tham, Pauline'

Cc: assignments; SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR SCR7797H - DOA 26/5/2017

Dear Pauline,

The market value for SCR 7797H is $84k - $88k (EST) as at May 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 14, 2017 3:54 PM

To: 'Tham, Pauline'; SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: FW: MARKET VALUE FOR SCR7797H - DOA 26/5/2017

Dear Pauline,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tham, Pauline [mailto:Pauline.Tham@aig.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 14 June, 2017 3:50 PM
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:
Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-
registration Date:

Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power
Output:

Open Market Value:

QOriginal Registration
Date:

First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Singapore NRIC

30788

SCR7797H

No

27 May 2017

TOYOTA

TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6L CVT
Black

2015

1ZRX545254
MRO53REH 104543681
90.0 kW (120 bhp)
$19,589.00

22 Jan 2016

22 Jan 2016

Singapore Gavernment
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$19,589.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

Yes
21 Jan 2028

$14,681.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category:
COE Period(Years}).
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

21 Jan 2026

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$45,002.00

$38,929.00

$53,620.00

The information contained herain is Corect as at 27 May 2017

Lond Transpurd & Aathiority

27/05/2017




