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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

e e S N e e S SRSl L B MR

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, June 23, 2017 12:19 PM

To: 'Janet Tan'

Subject: RE: DM17H001378/JT-Prevailing market value of SLB2026K
Dear Janet,

The market value for SLB 2026K is $116K (EST) as at JUNE 2017.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janet Tan [mailto:janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 2:40 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin; aasschee @singnet.com.sg; Ml; jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; Motor JP Knights;
SUR

Subject: DM17H001378/JT-Prevailing market value of SLB2026K

Dear all,
Please advise us the prevailing market value of this vehicle:

SLB2026K (DOA: 19/6/17)
Model: SUBARU LEVORG
Registered on : 23 April 2016

Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan
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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janet Tan <janet.tan@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, June 22, 2017 2:40 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; admin; aasschee@singnet.com.sg; MI;
Jimmy.lee@priorityservices.sg; Motor JP Knights;, SUR

Subject: DM17H001378/JT-Prevailing market value of SLB2026K

Attachments: 21062017090235-0001.pdf

Dear all,

Please advise us the prevailing market value of this vehicle:
SLB2026K (DOA: 19/6/17)

Model: SUBARU LEVORG

Registered on : 23 April 2016

Thank you.

Regards,

Janet Tan
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Trazk To Complele Moloring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 44¢6|
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: SLB2026K

Vehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration

Date: 21 Jun 2017

Vehicle Make: SUBARU

Vehicle Model: LEVORG 1.8GT-S AWD CVT
Primary Celour: Grey

Manufacturing Year: 2018

Engine No.: FB16A90339¢

Chassis No.: JF1VM4K55GG002510
Maximum Power Qutput: 125.0 kW (167 bhp)

Open Market Value:  $25,228.00 W

Criginal Registration o

Date: 23 Apr 2018 )
First Registration Date; 23 Apr 2018 “ b C@ il &.Ava

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: §27,320.00

OPC Cash Rebate Details

CPC Cash Rebate
Eligibility:
OPC Cash Rebate
Eligibility Expiry Date:
OPC Cash Rebate
Amount:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes

PARF Eligibility Expiry
Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:  $20,490.00
Intended COE Rebate Details

No

22 Apr 2026

COE Expiry Date: 22 Apr 2028

COE Category: B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $30,000.00

COE Rebate Amount:  $24,000.00

Total Rebate Amount: $44,490.00

ﬁ’ Singaprone Gover nmwnt

Feedback | Contact Info
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