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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, June 12, 2017 9:17 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: MARKET VALUE FOR SGK57X - SNM17D03293C01/7
Dear Joel,

Please ignore previous email. We had checked and revised the market value as below :

The market value for SGK 57X is $84K- $88K (EST) as at May 2017.

Thank you. N

Best Regards,
Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, June 07, 2017 11:39 AM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: MARKET VALUE FOR SGK57X - SNM17D03293C01/7

Dear Joel,
The market value for SGK 57X is $74K- $77K (EST) as at May 2017.

Thank you.

Regards,
Janice Lee

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, June 5, 2017 3:50:29 PM

To: Joel Goh; SUR; Simon Ho (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: FW: MARKET VALUE FOR SGK57X - SNM17D03293C01/7

Dear Joel,



" Thank you for your email.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Simon / SUR Dept,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkautc.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.eoh@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 5 June, 2017 2:55 PM

To: Joel Goh <joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: MARKET VALUE FOR SGK57X - SNM17D03293C01/7

Dear Sir

Attached please find a copy of COE rebate for SGK57X.
Accident occurred on 31/05/2017.
Kindly let us know the estimated market value at the time of loss.

Best Regards

Joel Goh
Claims Executive (Motor Division)
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-02

Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6184

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
joel.goh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer : This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte.
Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please
notify the sender immediately.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 1
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Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars N ~
: J 0 2| /5" /f'_;)
Owner ID Type: Singapore NRIC
Owner ID: 8641I

Vehicle Details

n %
. N N
Vehicle No.: SGKETX l\/) \! 3% ng( S84 _..—-—/X‘ ? %‘\“Q
Vehicle to be Exported. No .
Intended De-registration 05 Jun 2017

Date:

Vehicle Make: B MW
Vehicle Model: 5231 A
Primary Colour: Black

Manufacturing Year: 2011
Engine No.: 07887736N52B25AF
Chassis No.: WBAFP32080C866027

Maximum Power Output: 150.0 kW (201 bhp)

Open Market Value: 541,687 00

Original Registration
Date:

First Registration Date: 26 Aug 2011

26 Aug 2011

Transfer Count: 0

Actual ARF Paid: $41,687.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: Yes
PARF Eligibility Expiry
Dale: 25 Aug 2021

PARF Rebate Amount: $2%.180.00
Intended COE Rebate Details 7 7
COE Expiry Date: 25 Aug 2021 7 ¢ o
COE Category: B - Car (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10
QP Pazid $65,621.00
COE Rebate Amount:  $27,652.00

Total Rebate Amount: $56,832.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 05 Jun 2017
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