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3-Aug-17

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 501-02

SINGAPORE 4806443
TEL. 63446676 ' 65446689 FAX 62141511
CO. REG2007077430D  GST REG:2007077431D

ESTIMATE REPAIR BILL FOR NISSAN SYLPHY REGN NO: SLK 610 P

1pc
1pc
1pe

SINETT

e

Front rvs fender »~— Pnt 2
Front n/s steel rim — form
Front bumper n/s side bracket x’-""

Front n's headtamp 1’; o I||
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Front bumper 4 ~jel

Sunary
To check wheel algnment
To labour charge for dismantie and ranew the accident

damaged parls Including knock-oul siraighten, repaw
reshape and adjusi of the front nis dogr stz

To putty and spray painling on front bumper. fronl rvs fender
frant n's door. n/s mirror

To apply rustproching on the repaned and replaced panels

( ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJE§TED TO GST )

ABQVE ESTIMATED COST OF REPAIR NOT INCLUDE
Y UNFORESEEN DAMAGES. "
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Register New Vehicle (Acknowledgement)

Vehicle Particulars
Vehicle No. SLKB10P
Vehicle Type: R10- Private Hire (Seif-Drive) Molor ygiyese schame: Norms!
Vehicle Aftachment 11 No Attachment
Vehicle Attachment 2: - Vahice Attachment 3- -
Vehicle Male: NISSAN Vehicle Model: LPML 1S CVTARS DIAMRAR
Chassis No.: MNTEBAB1720026781 Engina No.: HR169830958
Motor Na.: - Trailer Chassis Nou .
Propeilnnt Petral Passenger Copacity; 4
Engine Capacity: 1598 ce Power Rating. .
Manimum Powar Output:85.0 KW { 113 bhp )
Unladen Waight: 1205 hg Mamamum Laden Waight: 1605 kg
Primary Colour: Sihver Snacondary Colour: -
First Regisiration Date: 04 Jan 2017 oginal RegBuation o4 yan 2017
Manuiacturing Year, 2015 Cpnn Mariet Valus: $16,2683.00
PARF Eligivdiy: Yes Minimum PARF Banefit: $8,141,00
No of Transferss: O Addifonal Regisiration  rit $15,263.00 (100%)
Actusl ARF Paid: $16,263.00

Owner Particulars
Ownar Name PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE. LTD.
Ownar ID Type: Cempany
Owner ID: 200812923
ot s P 0
Registerad BlockiHouse
No..

Regisiared Streel Name:CHANG] SOUTH AVENUE 2
Registared Unil No.: #0q-03

Registersd Bullding ~

Nama:

Regisiend Postal Code: 466443

COE No. | Expiry Date:  2016100101003687C/ 03 Jan 2027
A - Car (up 1o 1600cc & BTHW

CORBlo Cateaon: 113000p)

aF Pag: $50,000.00
Transaction Details

psiness Transaclion  20170104090643693302
SSMARE THRSIDY 04 45 2017

Business Transacton 060643



Merimen e-Claims Page | of 2

View Received Message

This mail s associated with |

“SLEG10P (CO446674)
[SHEBT63S]
™

PRAEMIER RENT & CAR FTE LTD
| 28 2017 8100PM
[TRANS-CAR SERVICES FTE LTD)
Pramens Adtomotive Servces P Lid

Reply | Meply AN |  Mork ws Unresd | Print Message | Delete Message | Forwara |
From AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) (AXA_SG), sent 0n 06/11/2018 15:38 PM.
To LEE_HO; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@ikkauto.com
cc AMA_SG; kitty.teofaxe.com.sg

Subject Re: <Seek Mandate> CD446674

i Ml Kwian

Mpndaie 18 Approved.

Fram: LKK_HQ

[T kitty.tooBaxs com.sg

|cC: AxA_SG

Sent On: 21/10/2019 03:10 PM
Subyject A COM4GETY

Cwar Kitty,

We refer {0 the above malter

Please be Informed that both party (01 and TP) confirmed that they do not have CCTV Pootage for this sccident, In wiew of conflicting versions, we ane
of the wiew that lnbiity |s to be shared equally by both parties involved.

Lisbility: 50%. Corflicting version, O monaged to counterclaim S0%.
Surmmary to offer to repairer Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd 5 as follows:

TP CLAIMED (%) REVISED - TO OFFER ($
Cost of Repair 2,354,00 2,354,00

Loss of Use (4200 = & days) 1,200.00  ($60 = 4 days) 240,00
Subtotal 3,554,00 2.584.00

0% 1,297.00

We scek your mandate at §1.297.00. Windly refer (o our sdjustes report in Merimien for your perusal,
Eindly ksl us Have your approval/instraction.
I'I'h.nh WO

Mk wan

- Origiral Message —»

From: LKK_HG

To! kitty, teo@ s com. 49

CC: Ak _SG

Sent On: 04/10/2019 04:08 PM

Subject: Re: COA4EET4

Dear Kitty,

Wa rafier to the abowve mattor

Please b (nformed that both party (O and TP) confirmed that they do not have CCTV footage for this accident, In view of conflicting versions, we are
of the waew that lability |s te be shared equally by bath parfies invelved

Lisbillity: 50%. Conflicting version. O managed to counterclaim 50%.
Summary to offir to repairer Pramier Autometive Services Pte Ltd s & follows:

TP CLATHED (8) REVISED - TO OFFER (§
Cost of Repair 2,354,00 2,354.00

Loss of Use ($200 = 6 days) 1,200.00 (560 = 4 days) 240.00
Subtotal 3,554.00 2.564.00

50% 1.297.00

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_... 7/11/2019



Mernimen e-Claims Page 2 of 2

We seok your mandate at §1,257.00. Kindly refer to our adjuster roport in Menmen for your perums.
iismdly lok w1 meve your aporoval/nstruction

Thank you
Meikwan

< Drigeal Melsage —>»
From: LKK_HQ

To: sasne.gomsfiane. com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; admin-a@ikauto.com
Sent On: 260972019 01:34 P
Subject: COMEETS

Dear Sashe,

war refer 1o the abave malter.

Ploase be informed that Soth pary (O and TP} confirmed that they go not have CCTV footage for this sccident. In view of conflicting versions, we e
of the view that liabiity 1s to be shared egually by both parties imvolved.

Liability: S0%. Conflicting version, Of managed to counterchsim S0,
Summary o offer to repairer Promier Aytomotive Services Pie Ltd is & foflaws:

TP CLAIMED (3] REVISED - TO OFFER (§
Cost of Rapalr 2,354.00 2,354,00
Loss of Usa ($200 » & days) 1,300.00 ($60 = 4 davs) 2140.0
Suiotel 3,554.00 2.554.00
] 1,797.00

Wi seek your mandate at 41,297.00. Kindly refer to our adjuster report |n Marimen for your porusal.
Kindly lot @i fave your apgrovalfinstruction

Trank you
Muikwan

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There 8re No CoCUEMonES.

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmul& fuseaction=dsp_... 7/11/2019



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

> :ﬂ R E M l - R QFFICE: 23 Changl South Ayenye 2 001-02 SI4BE44])
—~{ c TEL S5430078 | AS4ISE80 FAX 63141511

W AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES CO RED NO - 2007077410 GST. REG. NO.. 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD DATE 21-Aug-2017
23 CHANGI S0UTH AVENUE 2 #01-03 PAGE 10F1

SINGAPORE 488443

ITEM Description aTy U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR NISSAN SYLPHY 5 2,200.00
REGN NO: SLKB10P
TOTAL REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR s 2,200,00
GST@7%| § 154.00
GRAND TOTAL| § 2,354.00

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG200707743D

Our Ref: SLK610P/GS
Dic

21* August 2017

(By Email Oniy)

Attn: The Motor Claims Depariment
AXA Insurance Pte Lid

No.8 Shenton Way
#27-01
Singapore 068811

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLK610P & SHBY9763S ALONG ZION ROAD ON
28.07.17

We have been authorized by Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd, the owner of vehicle number:
SLK610P, to claim against the perty/parties responsible for the damages arising from the
above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SHB9763S at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr Teoh Chee Seng

As a result of the accident caused by your Insured Driver's negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’'s Vehicle Number: SHB9763S, our client's vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair £ 235400 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 6Days @$200.00per day $ 1200.00
§ __3554.00

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SLK610P

(2) Driver's I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Our Ref: SLKGI10P/GS

We would appreciate iff vou could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable o the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us your discharge voucher as for our client's signature and
payment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd".

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days, we will have no
alternative but 1o appoint our solicitor 1o act on our behalf to commence proceedings
against you without further notice 1o you.

Email; pory shifpremieniaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email 1o expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no whien replying

c.c. Client = Premier Rent A Car Pte Ltd



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Dirert Seitlement

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
| Case | Notified Est Submitted  |Ad) Assigned | Adj ot [A8) Submitied | ins Auth'ed Status
o 03 Aug 2017 i Pending for Survay
wan |03 Aug 2017 ey $$2,200.00  $$2,200.00
' s ady mot | mmw]l view ipt_| cancet Case. |

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS [Created by insurer]

Tnsured. TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD, Co. Rng. No.: 700303878K, Email: CLAIMS@ITRANSCAB.COM.5G
E'I';_m, PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 200612929
Vehicle Reg, | [z8707/2017 20:00 - :59
po“e R isike10p |Date of Loss: [ Manths and 24 Days From LTA leg Date (Man ¥r)]
1 I
Claim Type: TP / CO446674 (Folicy/Cover | py6a0520 (Third Party Only)
Vehicle Reg, ;
| No. SHES7835 ol oy | BaBSBATAMCY I
| [nsured): |
| Excesy 545,000.00

| Repairer: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd (HG) 23 Clsngl South Ave 2, 901-02, 486443 Chang| - Tel: 62148880
ety AXA Insurance Pre Ltd [HQ) - Tel: 6338 7288 . [Handied by Kitty Teo - S840 4602]

(Chaimant's
Lingagres:

MSIG Insurance (Singapors) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel| <65 6327 TRES

Adjuster: LK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (WQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 _ [Handied by MALVIN ANG WEI KUN | ... [ih'ill Rpt dus
T 11/11/2019]

Deriveer/Carsta

dimn YEAMN CHEQ SEMG (), NRIC: SD2820741, Tel: +6598331461 Emall:

[Vrured):

Addf Asg

Rinridarics: Ploase get video from insured driver, Come back on kability,

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Casa Madl |

s ANA SG(06/11/2019): Re: <Seek Mandate> CO446674
« AXA_SG [I1/10/2017) Ret <NO CCTY/PHOTOS 8Y BOTH PARTIES> Re: New TP Assignment - CO446674/PLEB0520
o AMA_SG (03/08/3017) New TP Assignment - CO446674/P1680520

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= view all | Search Tusks | Creste Mew Task | compiete |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject Handier Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No rosults.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 18/11/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 2
Claim Documents
*SLE610P (CO446674)
[SHB97635]
L
PREMIER RENT A CAR PTE LTD
Jul 28 2017 8:00PM
[TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD]
Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Assessment Reports i ~] &
PELERRS

Me |Finalieed On LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) | Thumbnail | Print
1 |21/08/17 16:36 | Adjuster Immadiate Advice @ | tosg i |
Photos/Images [perpage  Tv] W |
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HO) Thumbnall | Print
L |07/oas17 08:19 | General View 0 s | H
2 |owmasizosiie | General View 0| oiiic | B2
3 |o7me/17 08:1% | Ganersl View 0| tesirc | BA
5 |07/08/1708:19 | Genaral View 0| aaws | A
5 |07/08/17 08:19 General View 0 | Losd s E_
6 |07/0A/1708:19 | General View 0| badwc | A
7 |orjos/i7oB:12 | General View 0 | Load PS5 &
8 |07/08/1708:15 | General View 0! weerc | A
% |OT/OB/1708:19 | Genersl View 0| weows | BF
|10 |07/08/17 08:18 | General View 0| wers |
{11 |o7/08/17 08:19 Genaral View | oadirc | A
12 |OF/0E/1T 0812 | General View 0! lasws | A
113 [o7/08/17 08:19 | General View O edws | B
14 |07/00/17 08120 | Genersl View 0 wuwrs | @A
115 |07/08/17 08:1% | General View 0 weews | B
116 |07/0817 08115 | General View 0| Ledirc | A
17 | 07/08/17 08112 | General View D | laaies | A
16 |G7/06/17 08119 Goneral View D! wedirc | A
19 |O7/06/17 08:49 | General View O waows | B
20 |21/08/17 05118 Reinspection Photo 0| weews | B4
21 |21/08/17 09118 Relnspection Phote 0| icadwc | B
22 |21/08/1708:18 | Reinspection Phote 0| adws | A
23 |71/08/17 09118 | Relnspection Photo 0| wearc | A
24 |21/08/17 09118 | Reinspection Photo 0| waws | B
25 |21/08/17 09118 | Reinspection Photo 0| weaws | A
Documentation 1 per page El )
No_ | Finalized @n AXA Insurance Pto Ltd (HG) Thumbinall | Print
1 |owon/i7 12012 | EMAIL_ABS Load POF

2 |D0}ORJIT 12112 SHBS7635 INSD GLA_ABS Load POF

3 |03/08/37 12112 SLKG10P CO CLATMANT & TP GIA_ARS Load POF

No | Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pta Lid (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 [11/08/17 1530 |EMAILTO OO Load POF

2 |11/00/17 17-31 | TP ESTIMATE - MARKED Load POF

k] Z1/0B/17 16:34 TP ESTIMATE - FINALIZED Load POF

4 | 22/08/17 12:28 EMAIL FROM O Load POF

5 |01/11/17 0830 | EMAIL FROM TP 0 | osapor

& |24/05/18 15:48 | EMAIL TO TP ) | Load PoF

7 |36/00/19 11:48 LOD ) | load FOF

B |236/D%/19 11:48 | WORKSHOP INVOICE ) | Load POF

§ |26/09/1912:02  |SCENE PHOTO 1 0 woars | A
10 |26/09/19 12:02 | SCEME PHOTO 2 0| teodirc | EA

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 18/11/2019




Mernmen e-Claims

Page 2 of 2

Assessment Reports 1 ~] @
[No_[Finalized On LKK Auto Cansultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnall| Print
11 |04/10/19 16:20 | EMAIL FROM MSIG - OFFER 50% B | @) | Losd FOF
(12 |04/10/19 16:20 | MSTG DV €@ | Losd PP

13 | 16/11/19 14:58 | AUTHORISATION TOACTFORM B | Losdror

14 | 18711719 14:58 PAYMENT m:nm_muss SETTLEMENT FORM !_ Load POF

Documents Checklist

DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

Thare are no document checklists configured.

= LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handiing Insurer
ate - FEMETEE are Dreowts enEEss you shoe iF D adher perte

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuscactior=dsp... 18/11/2019



Adjuster Report

Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1ssecr1ser

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapora 408833

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax; G844-8805 Email; sur@ikkauio.com;assignments@ikkauto. com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AXA1T015152/K1A302-1

Date: 18/11/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Lid Palicy No: P1680520
Claimant .
Vehicle No : SLKB10P Insured Vehicle No : SHBYTB3S
Dale of Loss: 281072017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No:  C044B674
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLKG10P
Make & Model: fésfg”; SYLPHY, 18 CVT ABSDIAIRBAG2WD proina No:  HR169838958
Reg. Date: 04/01/2017 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: MNTBBAB17Z00267891
Colour: Silver Ddomaler: 10868 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Market Value/New Car NIA
Price.
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Prica
CONDITION QF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition Steering (Serviceabls): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yas
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Ne Pre-accidenl Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/60 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 185/60 R16
Frant Left Side Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone B mm
Front Right Side Bridgestone 8 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone B mm

The above valbea represen| the reraining e teeds depth

\COST OF CLAIMS - Repairer's  Adjuster's  Differance  Diff %)
Parts 2.166.87 1,351 40 BOS 47 7T
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2.130.00 1.440.00 £50.00 32.39
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S§) 4,206 87 2,801.40 1,495.47 34.80
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,200.00
(S8) 4,206 87 2,200.00 2 096.87 48.80
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 300.78 154.00 146.78 48.80
Nett Amount (S§) 4,587.65 2,354.00 2,243.65 48 80
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x $360.00/day) (S$) 240,00
(8%) 2.504.00
Liable Amount (50.00%) (S5) 1,297.00
Global Sum Settlement (55) 1.280.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 03/08/2017
Date Inspected: 04/0B72017 Inspected Al Premier Automaotive Services Pte Lid
(HQ)
23 Changl South Ave 2, #01-02
Singapore 4868443

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 18/11/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: KALVIN ANG WEI KUN Manager: HOW MEI KWAN

NOTE: This report represents our indinga at the fme and place of inspeciion staled herein, Such inspaction Nag BOKN comed out fo the besl of our
knowiedge and mbilly but any other Fabilly under any ather circumstances is hemby saprassly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 28 May 2018)

Parts: 143 NISSAN SYLPHY 1.6 CVT ABS D/AIRBAG 2WD 4DR (A) (Catalogue:Menmen Singapore
1.0}

Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominated Standard Lisl)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SLEG10P)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the las! estimate page

Further Info: Hemsivalues not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an aslerisk "

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER Dented 470.00FL  *470.00FL
[CONSISTENT)

2 1 *FRONT N/S STEEL RIM (CONSISTENT) Grazed B70.00FL  “BV0.00FL

3 1 *FRONT BUMPER NIS SIDE BRACKET Sarviceable 22.10FL *~FL
{CONSISTENT)

4 1 *FRONT N/S HEADLAMP (CONSISTENT) Serviceable 1,100.00FL *FL

5 1 *FRONT BUMPER (CONSISTENT) Deformed 562.00FL  *562.00FL

6 1 *SUNDRY Neceassary 50.00FS *30.00FS
[CONSISTENT)

F=Frnchise parl. 5=Spchstt. L=ListhemDsc
Sub Total (S5) 3,074.10 1.932.00

- List ltem Discount an L Items 30.00/30.00% (SS) 807.23 570.60

Total Parts (S§)  2,166.87 1,361.40

Repor was unsubmitted during this print-oul.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
Thers are no new miscellancous iems selected.
Recommended Labour
No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT New B0.00 60.00
2 TO LABOUR CHARGE FOR DISMANTLE AND RENEW THE = New 900.00 600.00
ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS .INCLUDING KNOCK-
OUT ,STRAIGHTEN ,REPAIR,RESHAPE AND ADJUST OF
THE FRONT N/S DOOR ETC
3 TOPUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING ON FRONT New 900.00 580.00
BUMPER ,FRONT N/S FENDER JFRONT NIS DOOR NIS
MIRROR
4 TO APPLY RUSTPROOFING ON THE REPAIRED AND New 250.00 100.00
REPLACED PANELS
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 2,130.00 1,440.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. I
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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