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Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

From: Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, February 01, 2018 9:44 AM

To: '"Woon Choo Kwok'

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: OUR REF : M547867 VEH NO :SJS3774L DOA: 26.01.18

Dear Woon Choo,

The market value for SIS 3774L is $44K - $45K (EST) as at Jan 2018.

Thank you. L

Best Regards,

Janice Lee (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: janicelee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Woon Choo Kwok [maiIto:WoonChoo_Kwok@sg.msig—asia.com]

Sent: Tuesday, January 30, 2018 3:35 PM

To: 'admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg' <admin@vinsautogroup.com.sg=; 'mail@vpappraisal.com’ <mail@vpappraisal.com>;
Wendy Tan <motorsurvey@fta.com.sg>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: OUR REF : M547867 VEH NO : $JS3774L DOA: 26.01.18

OUR REF : M547867
VEH NO : SIS3774L
DOA: 26.01.2018

Dear All,
Attach a copy of PARF & COE Rebate and some photos for your perusal.

Please advise market value.

Best Regards

Kwok Woon Choo
Senior Administrative Officer, Claims Services
Direct line +65 6643 1330 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | woonchoo_kwok@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

M S | G Team of the Year

) _§ 2016

MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220
9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 2004122126 | msig.com.sg @ O
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Page 1 of 2

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner ID Type:

Owner 1D:

Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:

Intended De-registration Date:

Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:

PARF Rebate Amount:

8462G

$30,555.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

Singapore NRIC

5J83774L

Yes

29 Jan 2018
TOYOTA

CAMRY 2.0

Gold

2005

1AZ3212580
MR0O53BK3106013035
106.0 kW (142 bhp)
$27,777.00

27 Oct 2005

27 Oct 2005

3

Forfeited

$0.00

AL~

https://vri.Ita.gov.sg/lta/vrlfactionfenquireReba,terPublicBeforeDeregInnut?FlH\‘CTl... 29/01/2018



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 2 of 2

COE Expiry Date: 26 Oct 2025

COE Category: B - Ca.r (1601cc & above)
COE Period(Years): 10

PQP Paid: $61,441.00

COE Rebate Amount: $47,551.00

Total Rebate Amount: $47,551.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 29 Jan 2018

OK

httns:f/vrl.lta.gov.sz/ltafvrl/action/cnquireRebateBqub]icBeforeDereaInDut?FUNCTI. .. 29/01/2018



Used Toyota Camry Car for Sale in 'Singapore, - sgCarMart http://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/info.php?ID=608002&DL=1000

saCARMART.COM

New Cars Used Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Articles

~ CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

1 of 3

TOYOTA CAMRY _Price Range | Depreciation > 10 year(s) ol: Veh_i_c!e Type A
Home » Used Cars » Direct Owners » Toyota Camry 2.0A (COE till 06/2026)
Tools & Tipa Toyota Camry 2.0A (COE till 06/2026)
Car Buying Overview Financial Accessories Similar Research Photos Map
Car Selling Add to Shortlist Add to Compare Add a Note Report Error More Actions

Car Tyres

Car Aftermarket

Car Ownership

On The Move

Lifestyle

Compare

Car Details
Price
Depreciation

Reg Date

Manufactured
Mileage
Transmission
Engine Cap
Road Tax

Power

Curb Weight

Features

Accessories

Description
COE

oMV

ARF

Dereg Value
No. of Owners
Type of Veh
Category

Availability

$48,800
$5,810 /yr

26-Jun-2006
(8yrs 4mths 24days COE left)

2006

255,000 km (22k /yr)
Auto

1,998 cc

$1,452 [yr

106.0 kW (142 bhp)
View specs of the Toyota Camry (2001-2006)

1,475 kg

DOHC 16V VVTI Engine. 4 Discs ABS. 2 Electric Seats.
Rear Aircon. Cruise Control. Steering Control Button.
Retractable Side Mirrars. Auto Wiper.

Leather Seats, Walnut Trim. Remote Security Key.
Original Rims. Reverse Sensors. Front And Rear Arm
Rest.

Good Condition, Many Parts Changed With Receipts.
$48,479

$27,816

$30,598

$40,722 as of today (change)

3

Luxury Sedan

COE Car, Direct Owner Sale

Available

QO 000

LOIRECT OWNER ]

AS

Pretarrag Viswing A3

Seller Informat
Contact Person(s)
Contact No.

USEFUL FORMS

» Indemnity forn
» Receipt

» MO1

1/2/2018, 9:38 AM



