Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 February, 2020 11:38 AM

To: chan pick yuen

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMF1732D & SMA8895Y DOA 16.10.19 GIA *** LKK REF:
CC6/AIG19019683/Aha3

Attachments: PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-42-53.jpg; PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-42-54.jpg;
PHOTO-2019-11-05-14-42-54.jpg; SMF 1732D - GIA report (16.10.19).pdf;
CCF27022020.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.
We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LIRS

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 27 February, 2020 9:27 AM

To: chan pick yuen; Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SMF1732D & SMA8895Y DOA 16.10.19 GIA *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG19019683/Aha3
Dear Sirs / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Vic,

Kindly assist.



To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 27 February, 2020 12:17 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: Fw: SMF1732D & SMA8895Y DOA 16.10.19 GIA

Dear Sir / Mdm,

your refer : SMA8895Y -AlG
Please advise OIC & claim no .

Enclosed is the invoice, LOA, LTA & GIA
As request following :

1. RC $ 3959 ($3700 +7% GST - AS AGREED )

2. loss of use $700 ( $100 X 7 days- our client's car under rental company - 5 Days
recommend - 1 days waiting PRS + 1 days weekend )

3. ltafee $7.45

@ 100% ( DIRECT FROM BEHIND WITH SCENE PHOTOS )
TOTAL $4666.45

Please let us have your settlement soon. . Thanks

Best Regards

Chris Chan

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd

Hp:92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, November 5, 2019 5:30 PM

To: assighments@lkkauto.com <assignments@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Fw: SMF1732D GIA & Scene photo




Dear Sir / Mdm,,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report & scene photos .

| will call Mr Adrian survey tomorrow , please print estimate & report to him .
Please advise your OIC & claim number .

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen
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