Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 December, 2019 3:41 PM

To: tklee0247 @gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: LOD SJE7911E FWD SGQ7114L accident on 26.10.2019 at 1215hrs
Attachments: 23112019113605.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,
We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that we are currently looking into the matter and in the midst of clarifying accident details to
our Insured.

We will continue to follow up and will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ EIES

i, -

" Save the Larth Print only whernr necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 December, 2019 5:37 PM

To: tklee0247 @gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: LOD SJE7911E FWD SGQ7114L accident on 26.10.2019 at 1215hrs

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -



LKK ref Officer in charge
CC4/FWD19019641/Uhb3 Vic

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Adeline <tklee0247 @gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 23 November 2019 11:40 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: LOD SJE7911E FWD SGQ7114L accident on 26.10.2019 at 1215hrs

Dear Sir / Ma’am,

The following file attachment is LOD for SJE7911E for your settlement.
Do have your reply soon to settle the case.

Thanks & Best Regards

T K Lee Automotive Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

#02-47 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6509 5521

Fax: 6509 5523



