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(Paticy Condition) R: "

Remark: The veh had commenced Its Ni5
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> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

e Oty Parculais ™ T ey

Owner ID Typa
Owmer ID;

Singapore NRIC
245H

(SN DN E—.—— ST s - ==

Vehicle Na.
Vehicle to be Exported
Intended Deregistration Date
Vehicle Make

Vehicle Model;

Primary Colour:
Manutacturing Year
Engine No.:

Chassis No

Maximum Power Qutput
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date
First Registration Date
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid;

PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:

COE Expiry Date:
COE Category
COE Perind(Years):
QP Paid
COE Rebate Amount
Total Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Nov 201%

SBU&921T

Mo

07 Nov 2019

B.MW,

5201 2.0L AT D/AB 2WD 4DR GAS/D NAV
White

2011
A2370042M20B208
WBAXG12090C9461494
1350 kW (181 bhp)

$44 326.00

30 Mov 2011

30 MNov 2011

2

§44 324600

Yes
29 Nov 2021
£26,595.00

2% Nov 2021

B-Car (1601cc & above)
10

£77,340.00

$15.940.00

$42,535.00

OK I



PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION REQUEST - SBUES21T ve GBJIET43H (O on D.0O.AL pIN1A0e
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Hi.

Mlense refer to the enclosed requost from AVANTAGE VAG. F‘ &1”‘

Claim ao + 2HERSEINGESGO0N
Cuie Owner | Wam Nur Suliha Binte Syed Yusallf T ”'G)n-r’

11 you have eny quenewvconcemns, please bet us Know,
Kimadly cersiet s annign Mohsmmed Ravul ar Simgle Juind Expert as regusiod v M

Thanka & Regards.

G
o Y Wul |(Wivoana

ANG

FNOL Adjusir |
Simgapmte FNOL | Cuies Opeeationg - Auln
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Tyl Hheilim o | men e e

From: claimsBvag s [meito:damsSvag s3]

Sant: Tuesdsy, November 05, 2019 2:49 FM

Tot Haf, Yiraul

Subject: AE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACTIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE GB)ET45H AND SBUGS2IT ON 02/11/2019

Dear sipimdm,

lwmaidHiu:mtppwuHuluwnmdhndfmLk.laumﬂmmﬂhnumleulluwwywl‘uwalim'lwhiﬂmmmmmmmmmmtmmw
an appointment with our client to bring in the car for survey,

1 the measntime, please do get back to us on the liability clenrence us soon as possible. Thank you

Best regards,
Jeffrey

From: Hor, Yinrul

Sent: Tue. & Nov 20019 05:47:14 +0000

Toi claimsivag.sg

Ce: Fong, Andy-SY, Fan, Winnie-LW, Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa, Azlan, Syazairdina, Chan, Yoke Sh, Lim, Sheng Yang, Mithoosingh, Asshweenjectiaur, Parthiban,
Theerthan, Subramaniam, Divyeshni

Subject: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR [MSURED VEHICLE GRJGT49H AND SBUSR2IT ON 6271172019

Without Preludice

Yot Reference . SBUSNILT

Chur Reference 264658 09850003
Deat Sis'Madum,

We refer 1o vour Notice of Accident of even date.

We imtond 1o conduct & pre-repoir aurvey of the dumage 1 your clenl s your customet s vebicle jomtly with yous client'your mowor workahop We propose o wse one of the motor
surveyors named in he smched bt 1o conduct the jomt pre-repair survey su 3 single jom expert

MName of Surveyar Company Name
AIG In House Surveyor AIG Asea Pacific Insmrance Ple Lid
Lawrence Ng Chun Kee Prionity Services

Jefirey Ong Leng Kiat Priority Services
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IMPORTANT NOTICE

The information in this email {and any sttachmenis) is confidential. If you are not the imended recipient, you mist not use or duscrinate the information. If you have
received this email in eror, please immediately notify me by "Reply” command and permanestly delete the ariginal and sny copies or printouts thereof. Although this
mllux!lnyﬂhnhnﬂlmhﬂmdnh&mdﬂyhﬂluﬂrﬁﬁﬂwﬁﬂﬁmwmmwmiﬂnn”hiﬂhhilfﬁﬁvﬂlldnpﬂld.i‘thm

sesponsibility of the recipient 1o ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Ine. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
Jolsitly or severally, for any loss or domage arising in any way from s use

IMPOHTANT NOTICE

Tha lelcsrrrlion ir thin amail (w0 wmy astachmenis) i confidarial. i you sre not e iMended recipend, you must not uee of dissaminate the nfmmaton, | pou have mceived this emai n ermorn, phaese
Wm_nwm.lm_ﬂmﬂﬂ engies or prinkouts thereal, ARough this emes end eny stachmerns e beieved 10 be fres of @0y vin o Gtter

affact Briy cCOMputAr ByEian iNta which it 16 recesved and cosned, |t i ihe resaonsility of e recoient b snsure that 1| & virgs Bee and o ssaponasity In pecmping by Amsscan
Irvlrmadionsl , e o Ien wubmidiarins. o affilinsns mithar jointly or severslly. for Bny iDss o demage wising n sny way fom i e



Vic !LKI(Autn]

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 3:24 PM

To: Syed-Yusoff, Saliha

Cc Admin A: Vie (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref 264658309856 - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBI 6749H AND SBU
69217 ON 02/11/2019 - LKK REF CC4/AIG19019631/R1hb3

Attachments: Mutual Agreement.pdf

Dear 5aliha,

We refer to the subject matter.

Please be informed that both parties agreed to settle the matter mutually and signed the form that both parties will
not claim each other (please refer to the attached).

As such, we will proceed to close the matter and submit WP report.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phatie: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Uln Industrial Park, Ubt Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

SLERIT ST save the Earth Print only when necessary

This e-mall contain confidential sna prvieged maianal, and are for the sole use of the itended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. I you believe that you recaived this e-mall in error, please do nol
read this e-mall or any attached ltems. Please delele the e-mall and all attachments, Including any coples thereal, and inform the
sandar (hal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachmeanis and any copias thersol. Tharik you
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Our Ref: CC4A/AIGI9019631/R1hb3

11 NOVEMBER 2019

LNC PTE LTD By Post & By Email
15 WOODLANDS LOOP

#02-10

SINGAPORE 738322

Dear Sit/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBRJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre
Lid to resolve the claim against you andfor your authorized driver under the Auto

Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the asbove said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third pany claimant. Unless proven otherwise.

Should you however wish 1o further discuss on the matler prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD — if applicable) will be withheld for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal A1G
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

-

Vic .ﬁlpd:
Elasc Handler
KK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | emul: vicalpeh @ lkkauo.com | fax: 6741-4108
BIk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue |, #02-25 | 5(408933)

..  AlG Asia Pacific Insarance Pre Lid
{Marar Claims Depi)
uxtin, gixuan akfnodse @ gmail. com

{Emeil)



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Maonday, 11 Novemnber, 2019 11:28 AM

To: Justin.gixuanang.okfoodsg@gmail com

Ce: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: Your Ref GBJ 749H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBI 6749H AND SBU 69217 ON
02/11/2019

! [[ v Auto

g Consutiants
ads B.Ea & Pres L3

S1LBEAVE L8025 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGATHORE Q08933 TEL : (0651 62563501 § AN 10GS)6T414108

Our Ref: CC4/AIG19019631/R1hb3

11 NOVEMBER 2019

LNCPTELTD By Post & By Email
15 WOODLANDS LOOP

#02-10

SINGAPORE 738322

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven otherwise

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter,

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD —if applicable) will be withheld for the time being. Pending for final
allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phone: 6841-2046 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

This e-mall contaln confidential and privileged matedidl, and are for the sole use of the inlesded recipiant. Lize ar distibulion by an
Unintended recipient is prohibited. and miay be a violalion of [aw. If you believa that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mall or any atlached ilems. Piease delele the e-mail and all attschments. including any copies thereal, and infomm the

sender that you have deleted the e-mall, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



Mernmen e-Claims Page 1 of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Revoked / No settiament

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
|  Case |hotifed [Eat Submitted | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rgt Adj Submitted | Ins Auith'ed Stetus
Hov Pending for Survey
wary |05 Nov 2019 foNov 3015 ss700.00 $$700.00 it
1 1 ’
foe Reg | it Ay net | tc txtumatas | | _view hot | Cancal Case |

CLATM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Tnsured; LMC PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No: 2005065598

Main _
Ciamant. | NORMAFIZAN BTE ATTAN, ID: S1702245H

Vehicle Reg 0271172019 14:00 - :59
ha.: SBUGS21T Pate of LOSE: |19k Manths and 3 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr]]

Cim Type: TP / 264658309856 POICY/COVE! | (Comprehencive)
Vehide Rep- 'l'olln- Ha,

Na | GEISTATH , | MT/O0545534
(Tnzwred): {Clairmant )

Exceas:
Hepalrer: VAG Singapore Pte Ltd [HQ) 48 Toh Guan Rosd East, #05-155 Enterprise Hub, BOG5SBE Jurong West - Tal: 6515-95135
Handling AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Pte. Ltd, (Exprass) - Tol: 65-6415-3000 .. [Handied by Syed-Yusoff, Sallha] Sallha Syed-
Ingurer: Yusolf@aig.com

m‘;‘“ Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 65322888
Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pta Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handied by MOHD RASUL| .- [Final Rpt due 15/11/2019]
ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED Wiew All |  Compase Case Muil |

There are no mail for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= View Al | Sescch Tasks |  Create Mew Task | cComplets |

Dum Dats  Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handier Assigned By Compieted On Croated On  Donai
o resufts.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of |

Claim Documents

*SBU6921T (26465830585G)
[GBIET49H]
TP
NORHAFIZAN BTE ATTAN
Nov 2 2019 2:00PM

[LNC PTE LTD]
VAG Singapore Pte Ltd
upsess Documents | usiosd Protes | Compose New Lesee | upicad videa | ustoas A | View [Vien in browss| v ]
Documantation ~] ¥
No | Relabel/Rearder | LMK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
|1 |D6/11/19 14:47 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 06112019 Load POF
(2 |Ooe/111%14:47 TP GIA REPORT Lead POF
31 |08M11/1917:06 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF
4 [11/11/1811:29 | EMAIL TO 01 Load POF
§ [11/111911:29  |LETTER TO O Load POF
i |09/12/19 15:20 | MUTUAL SETTLEMENT FORM Losd POF
7 |09/13/1915:25 | EMAIL TO AIG Lasd POF
Mo | Finalised On ALG Asle Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbnall | Print
i |08/11/1909:31 | OI GIA REPORT © | Lowapor
Documents Checklist
DOCUMENTS CHECKLIST feset | Seve | oot |

There are no docurment checklists configured

Show Remarks Ta: [ Handling Insurer
Pobe: Bermarks are Brivabe @i you SSow it £ cther perbes

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (Co Reg Mo 199607 188R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/A1G180186831/R1HB302
Date: 12M12/2019
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.  Policy No:
Claimant :
Vehicle No : SBUSS21T Insured Vehicle No : GBJE748H
Date of Loss: 02/11/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: 264858300856
RIFTION & | I I
Reg No: SBUs92AT
Make & Model: BMW 5201, 2.0 D/AB 2WD 4DR GASI/D NAV (A)  Engine No: A2370042M20B208
Reg. Date: 30/11/2011 (Man, Year: 2011) Chassis No: WBAXG12090C961484
Colour: White Odometer: 144291 km
Engine Capacity: 18687 cc
Market Value/New Car N/A
Price.
Sum Insured (S5): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-acciden! Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Frant Tyre Size; 225/55 R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/55 R17
Front Left Side: Pirelli 8 mm Rear Laft Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm
The abowe values repnasent the mmaming fyme (reads depth
'COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  DIff %)
Parts 1,790.00 0.00 1,780.00 100.00
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.540.00 700.00 840.00 54 55
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5§) 3,330.00 T00.00 2,630.00 78.98
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S§) 233.10 49.00 184 .10 78.68
Nett Amount (S§) 3,563.10 749.00 2,814.10 78.98
Global Sum Settlement (S§) 0.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 06/11/2018
Date Inspected: 06/11/2018 Inspectad At VAG Singapore Pte Lid (HQ)

Estimated Period of Repair 3.0 days

48 Toh Guan Road East, #05-155
Enterprise Hub
Singapore 608586

Adjuster: MOHD RASLUL

Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the iime and plesce of inspection sisfed hevein. Such inspection has been carmied out o the best of our
krowigdige and ability but any other Kahiffy wnder any ather circumstances /s horaby sxpressly erclided

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=...

12/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 4

REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
Mo. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repalirer's Amounl
1 1 *REAR BUMPER Repair 1,6800.00F “F
2 1 *MOUNT REAR RIGHT *Check 190.00 F *-F
F=Franghiss part

Total Parts (S$) 1,790.00 0.00

Reporl was unsubmitied during this print-oul.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no niew miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amaount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE/REFIT /PANEL BEAT OF REAR New B0O.00 200.00
BUMPER ,REAR QUARTER PANEL
2 TO PERFORM SURFACE REFAIR ,BODYWORK New 650.00 500.00
RESTORATION AND SPRAY PAINT OF REAR
BUMPER,REAR QUARTER PANEL
3 TO DIAGNOSE AND CLEARING OF FAULT CODES AFTER  Naw 80.00 0.00
REPAIR
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 1,540.00 700.00
Report was unsiubmitied during this print-oul.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 12/12/2019



