Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 9 December, 2019 3:19 PM

To: Justin Ang

Cc: Admin A; OK FOOD; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBJ 6749H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON
02/11/2019

Attachments: Mutual Agreement.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Mr Ang,

We refer further to the below email.

Please find attached duly signed Mutual Settlement Form for your reference.
We had already highlighted the matter to our principal.

We will now close the matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Justin Ang [mailto:justin.gixuanang.okfoodsg@gmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 29 November, 2019 11:59 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; OK FOOD

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBJ 6749H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019
Dear Vic,

Sorry for the late reply.

Please find the attached form for your perusal.

Thank you.



Warmest Regards,

Ang Qi Xuan Justin

Marketing Manager

HP: +65 9765 9084

LNC Pte Ltd

Blk 15 #02-10 Woodlands Loop Singapore 738322
Tel: +65 6752 1124

Fax: +65 6755 1124

On Tue, Nov 19, 2019 at 10:27 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Ang,

We refer further to our below email.

In view of conflicting versions, the claimant proposed drop the claim and each party will not claim against each other
and will proceed to repair their own vehicle at their own expense.

If agreeable, kindly chop and sign the attached Mutual Settlement Form and choose option A and forward back to
us a copy so we can let the claimant sign as well.

Once done, we will forward a copy to you (both parties signed) and will close off the matter and there will be no
further claim against each other for this accident.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 11:56 AM

To: Justin Ang

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: GBJ 6749H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019

Dear Mr Ang,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

“ Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Justin Ang [mailto:justin.gixuanang.okfoodsg@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 11 November, 2019 11:45 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: Your Ref: GBJ 6749H - ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019

Hi Vic,

It was a pleasure speaking with you over the phone earlier today.

As discussed, we will wait for your updates on the result of the settlement.

Hope to hear from you soon and have a smooth week ahead.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,



Ang Qi Xuan Justin

Marketing Manager

HP: +65 9765 9084

LNC Pte Ltd

Blk 15 #02-10 Woodlands Loop Singapore 738322
Tel: +65 6752 1124

Fax: +65 6755 1124

On Mon, Nov 11, 2019 at 11:28 AM Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh @lkkauto.com> wrote:
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51 UBRLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108



Our Ref: CC4/AIG19019631/R1hb3

11 NOVEMBER 2019

LNCPTE LTD By Post & By Email

15 WOODLANDS LOOP

#02-10

SINGAPORE 738322

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBJ 6749H AND SBU 6921T ON 02/11/2019

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other
information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your
insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. Unless proven
otherwise.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be withheld for the time being.
Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

" Save the Larth- Print only when necessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by
an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please
do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and
inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.



