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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 1:26 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SMK 7021G ESTIMATE FINALIZE

Dear Denise, 
 
We confirm COR at lump sum $4,500 (before GST) and 5 days. 
 
 
Warmest regards, 
Steven 
Thiam Heng Huat Pte Ltd 
82636295 
 
 
On Wednesday, 1 April 2020, 04:16:01 pm GMT+8, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Can confirm? 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6271-0351 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 24 March 2020 2:44 PM 
To: Thiam Heng Huat <thh176@yahoo.com> 
Subject: SMK 7021G ESTIMATE FINALIZE 

  

Dear Sir/madam, 
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Attached estimate of finalization lump sum $4500, 5days 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Denise Tay | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email:  sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


