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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 12:53 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019

 

Without Prejudice 
 

Dear Veron, 

 

We have yet to receive the letter from our client. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards, 

 

Terence Toh 

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

H/P: 8299 6103 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Tuesday, April 7, 2020 12:08 PM 

To: JWG CLAIMS; Naz (LKKAuto) 

Cc: SUR 

Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 

 

Dear Kalvin, 

 

Have you get  LTA letter? 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: JWG CLAIMS [mailto:jwg.claims@yahoo.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 24 March 2020 2:11 PM 

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 

 

Dear all, 

 

Offer accepted . 

 

Warmest Regard, 

JWG INTERNATIONAL JWG INTERNATIONAL JWG INTERNATIONAL JWG INTERNATIONAL 

PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.          

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

H/P: 9069 7882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

 

 

From: Naz (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2020 12:23 PM 

To: JWG CLAIMS 

Cc: SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 

 

Dear JWG Claims, 

  

Apologies for the late reply. I have checked with senior surveyors Adrian and Marcus. 

Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate following our check on part prices. We 

will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable with the amended Lump Sum COR of $38,100.00 

/ 10 REPAIR DAYS; 

  

Thank you. 

  

 

Best Regards, 

Naz| Technical Investigator 
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LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, 17 March 2020 5:04 PM 

To: Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019  

  

Dear all, 
 
Any updates on COR $42,000.00 as we are submitting the LOD to NTUC. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 

Warmest Regards, 
JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD. 
 

10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint 
Singapore 568047 
 

TEL: 6909 8882 | FAX: 6909 9592 
 
 
On Thursday, 27 February 2020, 11:32:34 am GMT+8, JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com> wrote:  
 
 
Dear all, 
  
As per Tele- conversation . Let’s close the amount at $42,000.00 /- 10 working days . 
  
Warmest Regard, 

JWJWJWJWG INTERNATIONAL G INTERNATIONAL G INTERNATIONAL G INTERNATIONAL 

PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

H/P: 9069 7882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

  
  

From: Naz (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, February 27, 2020 11:15 AM 
To: JWG CLAIMS 
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Cc: SUR; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  

Dear JWG Claims, 

  

Apologies for the late reply. Attached herewith is the amended marked estimate following our check 
on part prices. We will proceed to finalize if you are agreeable with the amended Lump Sum COR of 
$38,500.00 / 10 REPAIR DAYS; 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Naz| Technical Investigator 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6841-2157 | Email: Naz@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com> 
Sent: Monday, 10 February 2020 11:25 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019  
  

Dear All, 
  
Please let us have the finalization amount as it has been more than a month. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  

Warmest Regards, 
JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD. 
  

10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A 

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint 
Singapore 568047 

  

TEL: 6909 8882 | FAX: 6909 9592 
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On Friday, 10 January 2020, 10:30:08 am GMT+8, JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com> wrote:  
  
  
  
  

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
Change of vehicle’s number plate number invoice as attached. 
  
Thanks and Best Regards, 
  

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Phone: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

  
  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, January 9, 2020 8:17 AM 
To: JWG CLAIMS; Naz (LKKAuto) 
Cc: SUR 
Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  

Dear Sir, 
  
NAZ is on leave, will follow up with him once he is back. 
  
Refer to your after paint photos vehicle number is different. 
  
  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 8 January 2020 7:26 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  
  
  

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
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Kindly update us on the status of the finalization as it has been awhile since we’ve sent the marked estimate and after 
paint. 
  
Please confirm upon receiving this email. 
  
Thanks and Best Regards, 
  

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Phone: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

  
  

From: JWG CLAIMS 
Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2019 1:03 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  
  
  

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
After paint as attached. 
  
Thanks and Best Regards, 
  

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    

 

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Phone: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

  
  

From: JWG CLAIMS 
Sent: Monday, December 16, 2019 2:29 PM 
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  
  
  

Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
As attached, kindly confirm the finalized amount of S$73,400.00/- for stated vehicle with 10 working days. 
  
Thanks and Best Regards, 
  

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.    
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Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H    

 

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,  

#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,  

Singapore 568047 

Phone: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592    

 

E-Mail: jwg.claims@yahoo.com    

 

  
  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2019 9:30 AM 
To: jwg.claims@yahoo.com 
Subject: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019 
  

Dear Sir, 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  
Please forward estimate with parts prices as soon as possible. 
  
  
  
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
  
  
  
  
  

 

 


