Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: JWG CLAIMS <jwg.claims@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, 16 December 2019 2:30 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019
Attachments: SMJ9789S MARKING ESTIMATE.pdf

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,
As attached, kindly confirm the finalized amount of $$73,400.00/- for stated vehicle with 10 working days.

Thanks and Best Regards,

JWG INTERNATIONAL PTE. LTD.

Co. & GST Reg. No.: 201837488H
Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
#03-08 AMK AutoPoint,
Singapore 568047

Phone: 6909 8882 | Fax: 6909 9592

E-Mail: jwg.claims @yahoo.com

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, December 5, 2019 9:30 AM
To: jwg.claims@yahoo.com

Subject: SMJ 9789S-DOA: 2/11/2019

Dear Sir,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Please forward estimate with parts prices as soon as possible.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)






