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Nivitha (LKK Auto)

= =
From: Tang Hock Lye <hocklye.tang@sg.cntaiping.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 November 2019 3:15 PM
To: Winnie Chai
Cc: Claims Dept of CTl; Jeffrey Tay; assignments@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM19D205180-PA9060Y-CML- Request for pre repair inspection for

accident involving PC6933M & PAS060Y ( yr insured ) 31/10/19on

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Hi Winnie
We refer to your email below.

Without admission of liability, we are agreeable to Direct settlement subject to consistency of damages base on LKK
Auto findings with supporting documents.

By copy to LKK: Please assist to arrange for PRS survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 63896175 | F:(65) 6222 1033

W: www sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X ¥ifi Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please
notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, November 5, 2019 3:05 PM

To: Tang Hock Lye <hocklye.tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jeffrey Tay <lJeffrey.Tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: Re: OUR REF: SNM19D205180-PA9060Y-CML- Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving
PC6933M & PAS060Y ( yrinsured ) 31/10/190on

Hi Ben
No surveyor from LKK contacted me for the survey.
Pls kindly assist as LKK stated there is no assignment assigned to them for this case.

Thanks



On Mon, Nov 4, 2019 at 7:43 PM Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com> wrote:

Hi Qen

We would like Kalvin Ikk to attend the survey

Thanks & regards

On 4 Nov 2019, at 5:54 PM, Tang Hock Lye <hocklye.tang@sg.cntaiping.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Winnie

We refer to your email of 04.11.19.

We would like to conduct pre-repair survey of the vehicle at the appointed workshop.

We propose the following list of surveyors to be nominated as the Single Joint Expert to conduct
survey of the claimant’s vehicle:-

1. ADRIAN LING 6. KENNETH KONG
2. Kelvin Ang 7. SIMON HO

3. SEE CHEW SENG 8. CHUA WELIE

4. MOHD FADHILAH BIN OSMAN 9. MARCUS CHUA
5. XING QUO QIANG 10. HENRY NG

If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that
the surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

As per the NIMA Protocol, the survey by our appointed surveyor would include survey of your vehicle
pre-repair, after it is dismantled, and post repairs. Hence, you need to provide us / our surveyors
with the list of items that were damaged and required to be replaced or repaired to facilitate an
effective survey.



As stated above, please inform us and our surveyor after the claimant’s vehicle had been repaired
so that our surveyor can carry out post repair inspection before the vehicle is returned to your client.
Please co-ordinate with our surveyor immediately after the repair is completed.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: Al
Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you
are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Monday, November 4, 2019 5:30 PM

To: Tang Hock Lye <hocklye.tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Jeffrey Tay <Jeffrey.Tay@sg.cntaiping.com>;
connect3winnie@gmail.com

Subject: OUR REF: SNM19D205180-PA9060Y-CML- Request for pre repair inspection for accident
involving PC6933M & PA9S060Y ( yr insured ) 31/10/190n

Dear Ben,



Please conduct PRS for PC6933M.

Note : officer in charge — Ben Tang 63896175.

Regards,

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

T: (65) 63896116 | F: (65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: A i
Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential
information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you
are nol the intended recipient, please nolify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter

From: Winnie Chai |mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com|

Sent: Monday, 4 November, 2019 3:32 PM
To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: connect3lau@gmail.com

Subject: Request for pre repair inspection for accident involving PC6933M & PAS060Y ( yrinsured )
31/10/190n

Hi

Attached is the GIA report & estimate for yr ref.



Pls kindly assign yr surveyor down for the survey.

Thanks

Winnie Chai
Connect3

HP:9850-9666

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

Winnie Chai
Connect3
HP:9850-9666

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




11/20/2019

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

QOwner ID;

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date;
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount;

The information contained herein is correct as at 20 Nov 2019

PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Company
002G

PC&6933IM

No

20 Nov 2019

KING LONG
XMQ6129K DIESEL AUTO 51 SEATERS
Multicolor

2015
ISL8FES320B22084071
LA6A1IKBKAEB403283
$145,703.00

14 Apr 2015

14 Apr 2015

2

$7,286.00

No

$0.00

13 Apr 2025

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$55,011.00

$29,700.00
$29,700.00

OK

https:!!vrl‘lla‘gov.sg.-’namwdinn.-'enquireRebaleByPubIIcBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_IDnFOSNGOQTT

171



Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: Winnie Chai <connect3winnie@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 11 December, 2019 10:32 AM
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalization for PC6933M

Noted.

On Wed, Dec 11, 2019 at 9:23 AM Qi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winnie,

Please refer our finalize adjustment estimate update (PC 6933M). L/S amount $5,800, Repair day 5 days. (Lump
sum repair, before gst). If agree please update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: Sunpin@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Winnie Chai [mailto:connect3winnie@gmail.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 10 December, 2019 11:22 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto); Celine Fong (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: final Reminder - Finalization for PC6933M

Hi Sun Pin

Pls kindly revert on the finalization.



MHH 119145769 / Hua Hong Pte Ltd - Sungel Kadut Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
ENTRY DATE & TIME: D4/11/2018 14:20

SUBMITTED BY: Ng Ka Ye Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 04/11/2019 14:30

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report correclly the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.

2. This Farm must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to
repudiate policy liability.

4. The issue and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that coples of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to capies of the report being made available
aforesand.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 04/11/2019 14:20

Date Of Accident 31/10/2019 06:50

Exact Location Of Accident AT ANG MO KIO AVE 1 HEAVY VEHICLE CARPARK
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Number PC6933M

Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner GTS TRAVEL PTELTD

Co Reg No 201312002G

Email Address NOEMAIL

Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-83041121

Alternative Phone No OFFICE-83041121

Vehicle Particulars

Manufacturer KING LONG

Model XMQ6129K DIESEL AUTO 51 SEATERS

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair to your vehicle? NO

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy YES

Policy Number
Cover Note Number
Driver

Name of Driver
NRIC No

Date Of Birth
Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass
Driving Experience
Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number
Contact Number
EMail Address

5068503350-04

LAU LIANG MENG
S$1470495G

29/07/1961

OUTDOOR

01/04/2010

9 YEARS AND 6 MONTHS
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-83041121

NOEMAIL

Page 10of B



Address

Pdstcode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle)
involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

AS PER SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

APT BLK 405 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 10 #08-669
560405
YES

COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO

NO

YES

NO

NO

NO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

PAS0E0Y

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

Page 2 of 8



Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1

— o <~ "4

SKETCH PLAN

RTANT N

. Pleate report correctly the astails of the sccident 1o spesd up the claims process.

m’ﬁ"‘l‘lmh (ompieley G e AULhOTIse0 Ver.

- Information provided must be as truthtul and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or withhalding of material

facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy llability,

The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies i3 net an Admuuon of pohcy habdity on the part of the insurance
companies.

r ma to for ton,

. The report will be forwarded by the lnsurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance

Association of Singapore (GIA) for archiving and that coples of this report will for 2 fes he mare avallabls upon application by
Interested parties,

- By the ladgment of this report to the Insurers, you hereby consent o the atchiving of this report at the centre and ta ropies nf

the report being made available aforesaid,
Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (POPA)

| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

{2} My insurer, my workihop snd the General | A tion of Singapore [“GIA") may/are permitied to wwllect, use,
discdose and/or process my persanal datafpersonal Information set out in this [form] and any other persanal information
provided by me or possessed by my insurer (collectively the *Personal information®) and disciose and transfer such
Persanal Informatan ta all insucer(s] who have i d vehicle(s) involved «n thic dent |al insurer{s) who have insured
vehice{s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the *1 ") the | s’ lawyersflow firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singzpore and any relevant government agency/autheority (such as the palice), lor the purposels)
of:

i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the sertiement of the claims and any necessary
Iinvestigations relating to the claims;

{ii) investigating the accident and/or my claims;

() carrving out ana/or dealing with my instructions or responding to any enquiries by me;

[iv) administering my claims (including the malling of correspondence, statements, invoices, reponts or netices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same 2s well 3s on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages); and/or

(v) complying with spplicoble law in administcring, procesing, handling and/or dealing with my daims (collectively the
“Purpoias”)

(b]  allinsureric) who have insured vehide(s) invelved in this accident and the Insurers' wyers/law firms, may/are permited
to collect, wsc, disclosc and/or proceas my Personal information for one or more of the above Purpotes, and

ir)  mv Parconal inIDFMAtion Mav/(an ha Mot hv anV 01 the INCUrers 3nd fne GIA o therw third namy rsniee meecders or
agents{mduding their [awyers/law irms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for ane or more of the above Purposes.

[d] my Personal Information will also be collected and used to complle daims history for the purpose of fraud Cetoction,
investigation and management In present and all future claims.
(e) the information so collected under {d) above may be shared / disclosed:

() toallsnsurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, invesligating, controliing or managing fraud,
regulatars, law enforcement and government les at reasonably required for the purpoases nated, or

(i) for complying with requirements under any r Uons, laws of court orders,

cs

b0

Pspwr Vg Ssnius ot ol s goaivs

(M drrver &s polcyholder) Name-
Date & Time: NRIG/TIN No..

Scanned with
CamScanner

Page 3of 8



Accident Sketch Plan Pg. 1
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CONNECTS3

566 Woodlands Road ( Mandai Estate ) Singapore 728697
Tel: (65) 9850-9666 Email: Connect3winnie@gmail.com

Roe:533600610L
GST :533600611L

QT19/PC6933M/TPC-596

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Rd #15-02

530

— 0%
L

p= w071

Nz 400

- 2 ')_IBOO
-1}’1'11

S 20,
QUOTATION 58206

Springleaf Tower /.
Singapore 079909 /5??5/800
Dear Sir
Cost of Repair to Vehicle PC6933M
With reference to the above-mentioned, we are pleased to quote as follows:-
No. | DESCRIPTION QTY U/PRICE (S$) AMOUNT (S$)
L, RH side guard blue color 1 550.00 550.00 |/ ScR
2. RH side guard chrome color | 780.00 780.00 | (h s
3| RH side panel | 4,200.00 4,200.00 i/?pl%o
4| Sealant 10 40.00 400.00 |/
5. | Labour to remove & refit RH side glasses to | 600.00 600.00 |/
assist repair 2-pse ' '
6| Labour charges | 1,500.00 1,500.00 |[oo0
7- | Spray painting  sticker. 1 2.000.00 2,000.00 | 1200
SUB-TOTAL $$10.030.00
Price before 7% gst a
‘ m\f S ; “\\"\
TVPWT d”js - 5°l"j"
Thank
Yours f?:i)tl;lfully LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
' the Repairer of the following:
« To resurvey beforefafter spray painling
o2 - LMMF Su N « To display damaged part{s) during resurvey
\}. \ ~ . « Parts prices are subject to confirmation
'\_J Voo AH‘Cr— fq it r[m‘h)hird party survey is on a “Without Prejudice” basis
Winnie Chai ~— * No illegal modification(s) is allowed
" « Supplementary item{s) mus! be resurveyed and
HP: 9850-9666 Suh ?IY" (LkK) |5uspub?ect ma{.r:-.n:::jll,.ra! ?ra:lrf:jrange Company

14/11 /2019

Ly Gubp-

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signature:

Nates
Lale.




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING
Case Notified Est Submitted Adj Assigned Adj Rpt Adj Submitted Ins Auth'ed Status
12 20 Pending for Surv
Main |12 Dec 2019 19:?‘1"‘ Y 5$5,800.00 $$5,800.00 e o ey
Edit Ad) Rot ] Edit Estimates View Rpt Cancel Case I

Reference Claim Details Documents

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS I [Created by insurer]
Insured: -, Co. Reg. No.: -

,".".a'“ GTS TRAVEL PTE LTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201312002G

Vehicle Reg. . 131/10/2019 06:00 - :59
No.: PC6933M Date of Loss: [54 Months and 17 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man Yr)]
Claim Type: |TP / SNM19D205180C02 ROLCYCOVer | DMB1SN30494119011
ﬁ‘i‘“"‘ "0 | oasosor :’gl”a‘:q:g“ 5068503350-04
(Insured): ! *
Excess: 5$0.00

Repairer: C ct3 (HQ) 566 Woodlands Road, 728697 Woodlands - Tel: 98509666

Hond o China Talping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 6389 6111 .. [Handled by Chong Boon Sen]
ﬁ::::::t’s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd (HQ) - Tel:

Adjuster: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by OI SUN PIN] ... [Final Rpt due 23/12/2019]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view All |  Compose Case Mail |

There are no mall for this case.

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKSE View All I Search Tasks l Create New Task I Complete I

Due Date Priority Type Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
No results.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=... 17/12/2019



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*PC6933M (SNM19D205180C02)
[PAS0D60Y]
TP
GTS TRAVEL PTE LTD
Oct 31 2019 6:00AM
-]
Connect3

Page 1 of 2

Upload Documents | Upioad Photos |  Compose New Letter | View
Assessment Reports {1perpage [v]| M
Ne |Finalized On Hua Hong Pte Ltd (Sungel Kadut) Thumbnail | Print
1 |D4/11/19 14:30 | Accident Statement € | Load HTM
Photos/Images |3 per page &
No | Finalized On Hua Hong Pte Ltd (Sungei Kadut) Thumbnail | Print
1 |04/11/19 14:29 whgmmﬂ’w i © | W | &
2 |04/11/19 14:29 mm’:"n‘fm socuments] 0 | wedwsc | &
3 loviassagy | BeKSBINN. © | e | &
4 |04/11/19 14:29 I‘Lﬁdu::':u:ru?m —— O | wdrc | &
No |Relabel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 |13/12/1909:12 | Chassis Number 0| wadirc | &
2 [13/12/1909:12 | Odometer Reading 0| wadirc | A
3 |13/12/19 09:12 General View € | wadirc
4 |13/12/1909:12 | General View 0| wadirc | M
5 |13/12/1208:12 | General View € | wadirc | &
6 13/12/19 09:12 General View n Load JPG E
7 13/12/19 09:12 General View o Load IPG E
8 |13/12/19 09:12 General View € | Ladirc | M
9 |13/12/1909:12 | General View € | adic | &
10 |13/12/19 09:12 General View €| wadc | &4
11 |13/12/1909:12 | General View O | wadirc | M4
12 [13/12/1909:12 | General View 0| wadrc | &
13 |13/12/1909:12 | General View | wadirc |
14 [13/12/1909:12 | General View € | Load JrG
15 |13/12/19 09:12 General View € | adirc | M4
16 |13/12/19 09:12 General View &) | wadirc | M
17 [13/12/1909:12 | General View 0 | adws | 4
18 |13/12/19 09:12 General View Load PG | K
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno19ss07198r)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTI19019556/QSF3E2
Date: 17/12/2019
REFERENCE
. . China Taiping Insurance : -
Handling Insurer: (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Policy No: DMB1SN30494119011
Claimant Insured
Vehicle No: " C8933M Vehicle No:  "A9080Y
Date of Loss:  31/10/2019 Nature of Claim: TP ﬁ'cf‘:"“ SNM19D205180C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: PC6933M
Make & Model: KING LONG XMQ6129K, 8.8 (A) Engine No: ISL89ES320B22084071
Reg. Date: 14/04/2015 (Man. Year: 2015) Chassis No: LABA1KBKEEB403283
Colour; Multi-colour Odometer: 221683 km
Engine Capacity: 8849 cc
Market Value/New Car
Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S§): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R22.5 Rear Tyre Size: 205/80 R22.5
Front Left Side: Bridgestone 5 mm Rear Left Side: Bridgestone 5 mm
Front Right Side: Bridgestone 5 mm Rear Right Side: Bridgestone 5 mm
The above values represent the remaining tyre treads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %|
Parts 5,930.00 4,477.00 1,453.00 24.50
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 4,100.00 2,800.00 1,300.00 31.7
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S$) 10,030.00 7,277.00 2,753.00 27.45
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 5,800.00
(S$) 10,030.00 5,800.00 4,230.00 4217
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S$) 702.10 406.00 296.10 4217
Nett Amount (S$) 10,732.10 6,206.00 4,526.10 4217
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 12/12/2019
Date Inspected: 19/11/2019 Inspected At: Connect3 (HQ)
566 Woodlands Road
Singapore 728697
Estimated Period of Repair: 5.0 days
Adjuster: Ol SUN PIN Manager: Hiew May Fung
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NOTE: This report represents our findings at the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carried out to the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other liability under any other circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 17 Dec 2019)

Parts: N/A KING LONG XMQ6129K 8.8 (A) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for PC6933M)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page !

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *. [

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *RH SIDE GUARD BLUE COLOR Scratched 550.00F *550.00 FL
2 1 *RH SIDE GUARD CHROME COLOR Cracked 780.00F *780.00 FL
3 1 *RH SIDE PANEL Dented 4,200.00F *3,200.00 FL
4 10 *SEALANT Necessary 400.00FS “400.00FS

F=Franchise part. S=SpcNett. L=ListitemDisc

Sub Total (S$) 5,930.00 4,930.00

- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/10.00% (S$) 0.00 453.00

Total Parts (S$) 5,930.00 4,477.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 LABOUR TO REMOVE & REFIT RH SIDE GLASSES TO New 600.00 600.00

ASSIST REPAIR
2 LABOUR CHARGES New 1,500.00 1,000.00
3 SPRAY PAINTING + STICKER New 2,000.00 1,200.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 4,100.00 2,800.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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