Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Monday, 27 April 2020 11:16 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Steve Chen (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019
Hi denise

confirm.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANELSE

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, April 27,2020 11:00 AM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

Dear Sharon,

Can confirm?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 3:30 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

Dear Sharon,



Please check and confirm.

Lump sum $2100, 5days

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Friday, 3 April 2020 3:07 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

From: Sharon Sng

Sent: Tuesday, March 17, 2020 11:14 AM

To: 'Denise Tay (LKKAuto)' <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; 'stevechen@lkkauto.com' <stevechen@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PANEL SE

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2020 2:31 PM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; '"ADMIN SNGAHTEE' <admin@sngahtee.com>
Cc: 'SAMANTHA TAN' <sam@sngahtee.com>; 'Janice Chang' <janice@sngahtee.com>
Subject: RE: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

Dear All,

Would like to follow up on the repair, if done can finalize?



Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 January 2020 10:46 AM

To: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>; 'ADMIN SNGAHTEE' <admin@sngahtee.com>
Subject: SGV 5800B / TP / SNG AH TEE / DOA: 25/10/2019

Dear All,

Would like to follow up on the repair, if done can finalize?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



