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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 1 April 2021 2:43 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 

19/19/19/VP05/022596
Attachments: SJD9668A_DV.pdf

Hi Hsiao Tong, 
 
Please find attached the signed DV and below bank account details for your further action. 

 

Account Name : BOK SENG LOGISTICS PRIVATE LIMITED  

Account Number : 501259741001 

Bank Name : OVERSEA-CHINESE BANKING CORPORATION LTD 

Bank & Branch Code : 7339 & 501 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
Tel: 8126 8587 
 
 
 
On Mon, 15 Mar 2021 at 08:33, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Pei Jin, 

  

As per our tele-conversation last week, kindly assist to get your client to resign DV. 

  

Kindly let us have your client’s bank details for our necessary action: - 
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Account Name   
Account Number   
Bank Name   
Bank & Branch Code   

  

Thank you. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>  
Sent: Friday, 26 February 2021 10:39 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly inform we had check with the owner for ex-premises at 3 Tech Park Cres, 638129 Singapore that no any 
cheque they receive for Sin Sheng Engineering Services till today. 
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Please assist inform the TP insurer re-issue a cheque direct pay to the vehicle owner "Bok Seng Logistics Pte Ltd" 
because Sin Sheng Engineering Services was closed 

down business since June 2020.  

 
 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
Tel: 8126 8587 

  

  

  

  

On Wed, 20 Jan 2021 at 10:23, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly please assist update the payment status. 
 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Tue, 8 Dec 2020 at 15:23, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Hsiao Tong, 

  

Kindly inform that we had moved to No.8 Tuas Avenue 18, Singapore 638892 already one and half years ago and 

our LOD & tax invoice also put the Tuas address too. We also have referred to the owner at 3 Tech Park Cres, 
638129,  

but they have yet to receive any letters.  

  

Kindly please assist to cancel the existing cheque and reissue the new one to us due to long overdue. 

  

Thank you for your assistance. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 1 Dec 2020 at 10:00, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 
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Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Pei Jin, 

  

According to our principal, the cheque no. 210334 dated 4/9/2020 for $5,237.00 was already sent out few 
months ago to the following address:-  

  

SIN SHENG ENGINEERING SERVICES 

NO. 3 TECH PARK CRESCENT 

TUAS TECH PARK 

SINGAPORE 638129 

  

Kindly assist to check at your end. Thanks. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed 
/ inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 1 December 2020 9:12 AM 
To: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi Pei Jin, 

 
We will check and get back to you. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 1 December 2020 8:44 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the payment status. 
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Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Wed, 12 Aug 2020 at 10:02, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Please find attached the signed DV for your further action. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Fri, 7 Aug 2020 at 15:56, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 

Thank you. 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Friday, 7 August 2020 3:13 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

We agreed to your offer. 

Kindly please assist revert your DV to us. 
 

  

Thank You 
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Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Fri, 7 Aug 2020 at 14:51, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

We propose settlement as follows:-  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,815.00 
2. Loss of Use (7days x $60) $    420.00 
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $       2.00 

TOTAL $ 5,237.00 

 Please confirm acceptance. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be 
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on 
the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6841 2157 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 9:04 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Sat, 18 Jul 2020 at 10:59, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 
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Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 7 Jul 2020 at 11:17, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Mon, 29 Jun 2020 at 17:01, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 23 Jun 2020 at 13:27, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

  

Thank You 
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Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 16 Jun 2020 at 13:30, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Mon, 8 Jun 2020 at 09:23, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Pei Jin, 

  

We are pending our principal instruction on this matter. 

  

Thank you. 

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much 
regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 8 June 2020 9:20 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 
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Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, 1 Jun 2020 at 16:27, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Tue, 26 May 2020 at 09:37, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Tue, 19 May 2020 at 10:09, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
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Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, 11 May 2020 at 10:46, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Mon, 4 May 2020 at 13:03, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Pei Jin, 

We are in the process of clearing insured. 

Thank you. 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via 
email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is 
much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 4 May 2020 12:53 PM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Admin A; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 

  

Thank You 

Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
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Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, 27 Apr 2020 at 11:43, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly please assist update the status of my claim. 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 
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On Mon, 20 Apr 2020 at 13:43, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.       
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 17:41, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> wrote: 

Hi Jia Le, 

  

We are agreed your offer. 
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Attached LOC document and ATA for your attention please. 

Kindly assist to revert us with the liability issue/offer if direct settlement is in order.     

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 13:11, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your patience. 

  

For COR, recommended amount at L/S $4,500.00(before GST) with 5 repair days. 

   

** Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, 
authorisation to act, rental receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
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Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with 
the sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No 
admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially 
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation 
terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All 
correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 10:04 AM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) 
Cc: Jia Le (LKK Auto); Admin A 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Mr. Taufikh, 
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Please be informed that we have emailed after repair photos to you on dated 12/11/2019, 
but until today not yet receive your  

finalize. 

  

Kindly please assist have your finalize as soon as possible. 

 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 09:59, Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

Dear Pei Jin, 

Our surveyor haven’t finalize on this case, you may liaise with our surveyor. 

Thank you. 
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Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All 
correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

Best Regards, 

Chan Jia Le | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 9:55 AM 
To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) 
Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Jia Le, 

  

We would like to ask did Mr. Taufik have finalize this accident case? 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 
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Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Fri, 3 Apr 2020 at 17:16, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
wrote: 

Hi Mr. Taufikh, 

  

Please be informed that we have emailed after repair photos to you on dated 12/11/2019, 
but until today not yet receive your  

finalize. 

  

Kindly please assist have your finalize as soon as possible. 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  



26

  

  

On Tue, 12 Nov 2019 at 08:37, sinsheng engineeringservices <sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
wrote: 

Hi Mr. Taufik, 

  

Please find attached the spare parts & after repair photos. Please have your finalized. 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), SINGAPORE 
638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, 4 Nov 2019 at 16:55, Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

Dear Sir/Madam, 

  

Thank you for your assignment. 
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Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Monday, 4 November, 2019 4:47 PM 
To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-
d@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; sinsheng engineeringservices 
<sinsheng1981@gmail.com> 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Dear Nivitha 

  

Please arrange Mohammed Rasul to conduct TP survey. 

  

Regards, 

Ong Li Li 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  

Singapore 199555 

Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

  

From: sinsheng engineeringservices [mailto:sinsheng1981@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 4:36 PM 
To: ONG LI LI 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG 
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Subject: Re: Accident Involving SJD9668A with SKR1995Y on 01/11/2019 Our Ref: 
19/19/19/VP05/022596 

  

Hi Ong Li Li, 

  

We are selected Mohammed Rasul. 
 

  

** KINDLY NOTE THAT WE ARE ALLOCATED AT NO 8 TUAS AVE 18 (LEVEL 5), 
SINGAPORE 638892 WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT  ** 

  

Thank You 
Regards 
 
Pei Jin 
Sin Sheng Engineering Services 
No 8 Tuas Ave 18  

Singapore 638892 

(Level 3_Office) 

(Level 5_Workshop) 

Tel: 6863 9595 
Fax: 6863 6477 

  

  

  

  

On Mon, 4 Nov 2019 at 15:31, ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> wrote: 

  


