
1

Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 November 2019 10:48 AM

To: 'Rajeswary D/o Doraisamy'

Subject: Pre-Repair Survey by LKK (Vehicle No. SJU 2804E ; Your Ref: MT/1068828-002)

Attachments: Inspection Photographs.pdf; Photo of damaged parts.pdf; Photo After Spray.pdf; LKKInvoice1.pdf

Dear Rajeswary, 

 

Refer to your assignment on 04.11.2019 at 12.03pm. 

 

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SJU 2804E on 04.11.2019 at 5.45pm. 

 

At the time of inspection the repairer did not present their estimation to the damaged vehicle. 

 

Please find attached Pre-Repair photographs and invoice of SJU 2804E. 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 12:08 PM 

To: 'Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim' <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'Thio Tse Kiat' <tsekiat.thio@income.com.sg> 

Subject: RE: Pre Repair Survey for LKK on 04/11/19 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 
 

Celine Fong  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

 

 

From: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim [mailto:hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 4 November 2019 12:03 PM 

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Hazalysa Binte Ibrahim <hazalysa.ibrahim@income.com.sg>; Thio Tse Kiat <tsekiat.thio@income.com.sg> 

Subject: Pre Repair Survey for LKK on 04/11/19 

 

Dear LKK, 
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Please assist to survey the vehicle as per Tse Kiat’s instruction :- 

    

      

   

    

NEW 

ASSIGNMENT  
 

S/n 

THIRD 

PARTY 

OUR 

INSURED WORKSHOP / CONTACT NO. DOA / CLAIM NO / OFFICER REMARKS 

            

1 SJU2804E GBH9251S KENT AUTO SERVICES @ 

97547573 (MR KENT TAN) 

27/10/19 (MT/1068828-002) 

RAJESWARY 

DANIEL POON & CO 

 

 

Thank You. 

 

 

Warmest Regards  

 

Hazalysa Bte Ibrahim 

Admin Assistant 

Motor Department  

T +65 6430 7902 

www.income.com.sg 

 

 

     

PLEASE CONSIDER OUR ENVIRONMENT BEFORE YOU PRINT THIS EMAIL... 

 

Disclaimer 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) 

named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all 

copies of it. Thank you.  
 

 

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software. 

www.avg.com  

 


