LCRF PTELTD
CARROS CENTER

60 JALAN LAM HUAT #04-01 5(737869)

Main +65 62524991

Ms AIG Asia Pacific Indurance Pte Ltd

Date: 01/11/2019
Attn : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT

VEHICLE NO: SLE7638X
CHASSIS NO : RU11114486

ESTIMATE

MAKE / MODEL : Honda Vezell1.5X CVT

DATE OF ACCIDENT : 28/10/2019

YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NUMBER :SGV1338X

MILEAGE ;: km
PARTS RIPTI QrY  UNITPRICE  LIST PRICE
1 Ffront bumper R 1PC $955.00 $955.00 07
2 F/Lfender wheel arch moulding ~ (/] 1PC $300.00 s300.00 2! -
3 F/L door - 1PC $1,560.00 $1,560.00 ”
F?Lfender inner liner - (k4 1PC $240.00 $240.00 7
LIST TOTAL S$ 53 055.00
- fl"{ LH ke~ 01 \YSX() 20.00% DISCOUNT $§: _ $611.00 _
$2,444.00
PECI, 9 ,J Q
SPECIAL NETY i
1 Front bumper clips 7 S/:‘ 60 1SET .___5‘38_049_0__-75 AW
J 79 ) Special Nett Total S5: $80.00
LABOUR CHARGES
1 To labour charge for removing front bumper, F/L f{r:der and F/L a/oor 4
out to facilitate repairs and replacement of damaged part $900.00 S 7
v
5 To respray front buéper, F/L fe/nder, F/L door and F/L fender wheel arc 6 i
moulding 5900.00
LABOUR TOTAL SS:  $1,800.00
TOTAL SS: $4,324.00
7% GST $302.68 J100
GRAND TOTAL §%: 54;626‘68
St (00 Wl B By g,
6
U oy - 795 §
LIS [ - 199
LKK Aulo Consultants hence nowdy M~ A 76954
the Repairer of the following: ~
o To tesurvey betore/atier spray painting -

o To dispiay damagad pari(s) during mesuney
» Pants prices are subject to confirmation
» Thied party survey 1S on 8 “Without Prejudice” basis
» N ilagal modification(s) is ailowed
» Suppiementary tem(s} must be resurvayed aad
is subject 10 final approval from (nsurance Company

Acknowtedged by Repairer
Signature:
Date:

LIS 0% 4k
0} E! ¢ 0

-



Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

From: Siak Tong Sim <siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, January 03, 2020 7:38 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Final Bill: SLE7638X

Steve

Ok confirm lump sum $2,250.00/4 days

Regards
S.T.Sim (65-97422188)
Manager

Accident Reporting Center
60 Jalan Lam Huat

#04-35/36 Carros Centre

Singapore 737869

=

On Thu, Jan 2, 2020 at 6:39 PM Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Mr Sim,

Kindly refer our finalize $2250 (L/S, before GST). 4 repair days.

Kindly confirm.

Thanks



