LION CITY RENTALS

Your Reference: SGV1338X
Our Reference: SLE7638X
Contact person: siaktong@lioncityrentals.com.sg

Date: 21/01/2020

Dear sirs

AlG Singapore

78, Shenton Way #07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Accident involving SLE7638X/SGV1338X dated on 28/10/2019

Your insured driving vehicle no: SGV1338X had negligently collided into our said vehicle.

As a result of the said collision, our car has suffered loss and damage as follows:

Cost of repairs $  2,407.50 {Inclusive GST)
Search Fee S 2.00
Loss of use $80 x 4 days S 320.00
Pre-Repair Inspection $80x 2 days S 160.00
Grand Total $  2,889.50

We enclosed herewith a copy of LTA search fee, GIA report and invoices of our said vehicle for
your reference and further actions.

Yours Faithfully
"

S.T.Sim -
Manager
Accident Reporting Centre

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd

1090 Lower Delta Road
#05-12 Singapore 169201

LCR Hotline : 3138 1884
www. lioncityrentals.com.sg
rentals@loncityrentals.com.sg




Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: Pauli Haakenson <phaakenson@sas.edu.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 8:00 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 1338X & SLE 7638X ALONG/AT 1 ROSEWOOD

DRIVE S(737934) ON 28/10/2019

Good day Jia Le,
Noted with thanks.

P. Haakenson

U U~ U~~~

5K &)W zhang l30 shi (a.k.a. Pauli Haakenson 5K RF))

Middle School Chinese Teacher (HZEfdscE))

Singapore American School #ini s E%#%)
40 Woodlands Street 41, Singapore 738547

On Wed, Dec 11, 2019 at 4:04 PM Jia Le (LKK Auto) <Jial.e@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC4/A1G19019468/Eda3

PAUL JOSEPH HAAKENSON

1 ROSEWOOD DRIVE

SINGAPORE 737934

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGV 1338X & SLE 7638X ALONG/AT 1 ROSEWOOD DRIVE S(737934)
ON 28/10/2019

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.



We have received a claim from SLE 7638X against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as
your vehicle moving out from parking lot. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please
contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

""Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,
Chan Jia Le | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

CONFIDENTIALITY CAUTION: This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and contains information that is
privileged and confidential. If you, the reader of this message, are not the intended recipient, you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this
communication. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us immediately by return email and delete the original message. Unless it
relates to the official business of Singapore American School, any opinions or matters expressed in this message are those of the individual sender.



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD (“the workshop™} hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$82.407.50 (Repair Cost), $$300.00 (Loss of Use/Rental), $$2.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SLE 7368X that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 28/10/2019 (date) along
3 ROSEWOOD DRIVE (location) involving vehicle no/s SGV_1338X. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 04/11/2019 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD (the
third party claimant™) of vehicle no. SLE 7638X make the claim as set out in the above paragraph
and we/I have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit.
We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemmnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant” after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursnant to the
damage to SLLE 7638X (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a

without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this !2 | (day) of M (month) 202 (year)

——
()
‘\// ay

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)




LCR

LION CITY RENTALS

Lion City Rentals Pte Ltd
CO REG No: 201504621K

GS5T REG No: MS0371281P

1090 Lower Delta Road

#05-12

Singapore 169201

Tax Invoice

AIG SINGAPORE Inv No. : WIN200102530

78 Shenton Way #07-16 Invoice Date : 21 Jan 2020

AIG Building Ref : WWJ19102712

Singapore 079120 Terms : 7 Days

Tel: 63386200 Veh. No. : SLE7638X

I Tax Taxable

# Description Qty UOM u/p Amt Tax Type Amt
1 Lump sum repairs (SLE7638X) 2,250.00 157.50 GST (SR) (7%) 2,250.00

Subtotal : S$ 2,250.00
Total Tax : S$ 157.50
Total : S$ 2,407.50

For Lion City Rentals Pte L

&
ﬂuthorised Signature)
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10/29/2019

FGENERAL
INSURANCE

ASSOCLATION
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-177831
. Date of Request: 29/10/2019

lion City Rentals Pte Lid
60 Jalan Lam Huat
#04-01 Carros Centre
Singapore 737869

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +685 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Dear Sir/Madam,

Ehquiry Date 29/10/2019

Engquiry By Jean Tan Li Zhen

TP Vehicle No. SGV1338X

Accident Date 28/10/2019

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
-SIRO [] Cash [] Cheque

https /isingapore.merimen,.com/claimsfindex.cim?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=2327531&CFID=615833854CFTOKEN=fe057¢8... 2/2



